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Print Received Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SJV4299U (C0469784)

 [SHD943M]
 TP

 MR SESINANDO LONTOC CUETO
 Feb 3 2018 4:00PM

 [TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
 Em-1 Auto Trade

  
 
From   AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 27/11/2018 16:06 PM.
To   LKK_HQ
CC   Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Subject   Re: Fw: C0469784/P1680520
 
PLS PROCEEED DS WITH QUANTUM TO BE AGREED
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: motor.doc@axa.com.sg; cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 27/11/2018 09:21 AM
Subject: Fw: C0469784/P1680520
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
Please advice also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,

 Shu Pei | Admin
 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

 Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 08/02/2018 10:44 AM
Subject: C0469784/P1680520
 

 

 
 
 
Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,

  
TP: NON ARC
 
Thanks & Regards,
Cynthia Loh


