Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: April 21, 2020 1:20 PM

To: Khar Kian Toh

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AXA OUTSTANDING : Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH

2 REPAIR DAYS - LKK REF CC4/ASM18002632/T1ha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose a settlement as per the LOD of $1609.18.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: April 16, 2020 4:51 PM

To: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk 90@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
<jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AXA OUTSTANDING : Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2
REPAIR DAYS - LKK REF CC4/ASM18002632/T1ha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Mr Khar Kian,
We refer to our below email and the contents were noted.

We will continue to follow up on the matter and will get back to you for an update/offer.
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Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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SeERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when recessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Khar Kian Toh [mailto:tohkk 90@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 April, 2020 4:46 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AXA OUTSTANDING : Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2
REPAIR DAYS - LKK REF CC4/ASM18002632/T1ha3

Dear All,

Kindly acknowledge above attachment is our Tax invoice, LOD, LOA , and LTA Search Fee,

Breakdown:
Amount($)
1) Repair cost $1401.73
2) Loss of Use (2days =$100x2days) $200.00
3) Miscellaneous (LTA Search Fee) $7.45
Total $1609.18

Please check and revert.

Best Regards,
Toh Khar Kian

Li Sheng Automobile Trading
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K)



Mobile: (65) 83987469 | Fax: 67744885
Email : tohkk 90@hotmail.com

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 18 November, 2019 9:22 AM

To: 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk 90@hotmail.com>

Cec: lishengauto(@yahoo.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AXA OUTSTANDING : Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2
REPAIR DAYS - LKK REF CC4/ASM18002632/T1ha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the subject matter.

Kindly forward to us your LOD for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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SeERER W Syve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 10:44 AM

To: 'Khar Kian Toh'

Cec: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); lishengauto@yahoo.com.sg

Subject: RE: AXA OUTSTANDING : Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2
REPAIR DAYS

Hi Toh,
This case was previously Winson case.

To finalise COR $1401.73 , 2 days.



Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 February 2019 3:10 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2 REPAIR DAYS

Hi Taufikh,

For your necessary action.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify
the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the
material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 11:25 AM

To: winson ong <winsonls@yahoo.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2 REPAIR DAYS

Dear Winson,

Thank you for the email.
This case is handle by Zaini.
Dear Zaini,

FYNA. CC4/AXA18002632/T1ka3

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: winson ong [mailto:winsonls@yahoo.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 February 2018 10:10 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@]lkkauto.com>; Richard Toh Chin Huat <lishengauto@yahoo.com.sg>

Subject: Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2 REPAIR DAYS

Hi,
The above attachment is the before paint and after paint photo and finalize.

Can help to Finalize for vehicle SKQ1663K PART BY PART $1,401.73 WITH 2 REPAIR
DAYS.

No Supplementary.

Please check and revert.
Thanks

Winson Ong

97684247

LI SHENG Automobile Trading

Blk K Pandan Loop #01-18
Singapore 128219



