3/23/2020 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKF3052T (C0469951)
[SHB9966Z]
TP
MARIC CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
Feb 12018 9:00AM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
Torque 5 Pte Ltd

From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 20/03/2020 17:28 PM.
To LKK_HQ
CC AXA_SG; thinthin@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHB9966Z (Ol : AXA - C0469951) and SKF3052T (TP : LKK REF -

Subject  ¢c4/AXA18002631/Aua3) on 01.02.2018

Dear officer in-charge

Please proceed to reject TP claim first based on insured's report.

Regards

Peter

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: AXA_SG

CC: thinthin@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 20/03/2020 11:03 AM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHB9966Z (OI : AXA - C0469951) and SKF3052T (TP : LKK
REF - CC4/AXA18002631/Aua3) on 01.02.2018

HI, OI COUNTER CLAIM WAS SUCCESSFUL. KINDLY LET US HAVE YOUR INSTRUCTION/APPROVAL TO REJECT TP
CLAIM.

THANKS

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ

CC: AXA_SG,; thinthin@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 31/12/2018 10:14 AM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHB9966Z (OI : AXA - C0469951) and SKF3052T (TP : LKK
REF - CC4/AXA18002631/Aua3) on 01.02.2018

Hi Team

Pls provide an update to this case. Thank you!

Regards

Peter
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AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Singapore 068811
Customer Centre #B1-01

R (65) 6880 4888
& (65) 6338 2522
B wwwaxa.com.sg
GST Reg No.: 199903512M
Co. Reg No.: 1999035121

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; thinthin@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com

Sent On: 14/02/2018 02:20 PM

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHB9966Z (OI : AXA - C0469951) and SKF3052T (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA18002631/Aua3) on 01.02.2018

Dear Ernest,

We refer to the above matter.

As per instruction, we will proceed direct settlement for this case.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower
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