Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 February 2018 8:59 AM

To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June)

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SDL3513G *** LKK REF: CC4/LCR18002629/wa3
WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDL 3513G AND SLG5753Z ON 22/10/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days
of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 8625.
Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 February, 2018 6:54 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SDL3513G *** LKK REF: CC4/LCR18002629/wa3

Hi Vivian,
Pls advise on liability soonest.
Thank you.

Rgds

June Phua

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, February 09, 2018 4:34 PM

To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) ; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) ; Admin A ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) ; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SDL3513G *** LKK REF: CC4/LCR18002629/wa3

Dear June,

Thank you for your email.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vivian at 6841 8625.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 9 February, 2018 2:10 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SDL3513G

Dear Sir,

OUR CLIENT - SDL3513G



DOA - 22/10/17 @1550hrs
AIG INSURED : SLG 5753Z

1) Attached our client’s report.

2) Pls advise us OIC and liability.

3) Kindly let us have a copy of report SLG 5753Z if you have it.
Thank you.

Rgds

June Phua

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719



