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¥ A Ls LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607196-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobila
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CC4/AIG18002602/Khs3

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16

CHARTIS BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120

|||

Code: AIG
: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. EH 7571X Veh. Inspected SGX 80507
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 08/02/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No., HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
LiH Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/02/2018 Inspection Date 07/02/2018
Survey held at ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 7 S5IN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-T6
SINGAPORE 575642
Sa. Remarks

AJTHE INCPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BlIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




LAl

ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE. LTD.

Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, Singapore 575642,
Tel: 6453 8686 (3 Lines) Fax: 6459 6550

Company Reg. No.

: 201113667N

GST Reg. No.: 201113667N

EH7571X
05-Feb-2018

Vehicle Insured

Accident

¥l :.IE.'i'r'

=]

Our Ref : 21B026 {AIG) / CHAN
GAN YAM
6B TOH

#02-04

SENG
TUCK ROAD

Singapore 596748
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Vic !LKKAI.I‘I:G} e e a——

From: alan khong chin wah <alanauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 9:28 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Pre repair inspection request - SGX8050T VS EH7571X (Ol) DOA: 05/02/2018 ***

LKK REF - CC4/AIG18002602/Khb3

Dear Vic

Moming , your offer have been accepted , you may process payment to us thank you .
Regards

Kenny

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
(4538686

On Wed, Sep 5, 2018 at 9:19 AM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh/@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenny,

We refer further to the below email and to your LOD.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to
our Insured's part, we propose below amount to settle yvour client’s claim:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $  2.461.00

Loss of Rental ($100 x 5 days) $ 500.00

GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
TOTAL $  2,963.00

For your acceptance please.

The above amount is to be made payable to ALAN’S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD.



G Yam Seng (K C_
¢/o Bik 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate '
#11-T6

Singapore 575642

Date: Hf, ~3- WIX )
A ASiA PACIFIC INSUuranCE TE ‘o x}i
meloR Ceims T)*q-T-

T8 s i
HeI-16 A RALdIN

Siuhopint 63920

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES SEXJUSUT AwD CH 74X x:
ALONG __ Jptand TURIA/ KECH oN OV -01 (Y

SeX Busu T

I/ We, the owner of Vehicle No. which was involved in the above

accident,

My / Our vehicle sustained damages as a result of the above said accident and I / we are now

claiming against you for the followings:-

1 Costs of repair z EE'_‘ILL ol :J
2. bow-ofUse/Rental fecs 5ps - For.oL
Rolice / GIA report/ EFA-fees- - & 2 CU

Surveyor report fees -
Others -

Total: | Libi.o0

Please advise whether you are now prepare to settle my claims as outlined above.

thid W

[/ We hereby authorise my / our repairers, M/s Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. and/or their representatives
to negotiate/compromise settlement of my / our above claim on my / our behalf. If there is a settlement
| / we further authorise you to pay whatever settlement sum to my / our repairers being the outstanding
repair bill and incidentals due to them.

Your kind attention and prompt settlement is much appreciated.

Yours faithfully,



" l’ '{? Autp

- mm oewm Consultanis

il B2 B Pre Lid

STUBLAVE Lostb-25 PAYA L BUINDUSTRIAL PARK. SING AIMORE J05933 TEL : (0651 hI5H3361 FAN (656250415

28 MARCH 2018

CHNG SIONG SOON
102 TOH YI DRIVE
SINGAPORE 596560

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/AIG18002602/Khs3

YOUR REF : EH 7571X

ACCIDENT INVOLVING EH 7571X AND SGX 8050T ALONG JALAN JURONG
KECHIL - ESSO PETROL KIOSK ON 05.02.2018

VWe refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of
SGX 8050T against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided to the Third-Party vehicle SGX 8050T. As such. liability may not be on your
favour,

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to vicalpeh@lkkauto com within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not

provided at AlG's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further

document may be required:

¢ Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)



874 74

. Consutianis
B A B Pia i

SLUBLAVE 1 #0125 PAYA L BLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405938 TEL £ (0650 62563561 FAX : (05 62564315

 Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

* If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AIG’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

f -'-)".
Vic Alpeh
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto com

c.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Sex o Ann EHP5FIX

ACCIDENT INVOLVING
v "- N — { .
ON oS- 02 = Y

BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, 1/ We, G*""’“‘ ‘I/Rm gE’N‘!

0O . '.1 —_
nricNo. S 11O e C The owner of Vehicle No. SEXIOSUT

Hereby irrevocably appoint Messrs Alan's United Auto Pte. Ltd. at Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate,

Sector C, #01-76, Singapore 573642, and/or their representative to process the Third Party claim on my/our
behalf and to do all and/or any of the followings:-
l. To submit, negotiate/compromise and to resolve settlements of my/our above mentioned claim.
2. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to
be made by way of Cheque in favor of Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd.
3. For any of the purpose aforesaid, to execute, sign and deliver all documents whatsoever as they deem

necessary for the purpose of settling my/our said claim.

1/ We hereby declare that all the processing and documents done by virtue of this letter of authority on my/our
behalf by my/our repairers or any person authorized by them shall be as good valid and effectual to all intends

and purposes whatsoever as if the same had been done or executed by me/us in person.

| / We further confirm that the aceeptance by Messrs Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. of the settlement amount

constitute the full discharge of my/our claim(s) in respect of the above accident.

S B LY.
Signed on the C } (day) 0y (month) A L1 E’*/ {year)

Ac}uﬁv’t’;dge{i by Owner

(company stamp if applicable)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

wen, L UnTiEn Ay (it 11D (“the workshop®) hereby confirm that we/l
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
kK b"“_ AL Consu7en)s PIE LD (‘name of surveyor’) with respect to the amount claimed for
s§ Al |- oL (repair costs), 8§ BLL.CL (loss of useirental) 5% e (search fees)
for vehicle no. >G% ¥LSUT  phat was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on_ VU L1 WGate) along Tagew JuRinn (el I (location) involving
vehicle nors__ £ 1531 %

This is pursuant to the inspection conductedon __ CF =2 - 3¢ ¥ (date) at "the workshop".

Well confirm that we/| are/am authorized by the owner __ 7 2+ Vam SEwh ("third party claimant”)
of venicle rio, > BUSUT 16 make the ciaim as set out in the above paragraph and weAl have ful
authority to settie the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of
authority given by “the third party claimant”™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss andior
expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant” after the above said
agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to costs of
repairs and/or rental andlor loss of use pursuant to the damage to S Gyl {vehicle no.) as a result
of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the third party
claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without
admission of liability basis

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive
lurisdication over any dispute arising out of the same.

o Datedthis 22 dayof __ 2\ (month)20_'® (vear) r

{ e
S 1

Signed by AlG appointed surveyor Chopped & Signed by "the workshop”

CIRER 303/ 1



ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE. LTD.

Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, Singapore 5
Tel: 6453 8686 (3 Lines) Fax: 6458 6550
Company Reg. No.: 201113667N
GST Reg. No.: 201113667N

Vehicle Insured : EH7571X
Accident Date : 05-Feb-2018

Our Ref : 218026 (AIG) / CHAN
GAN YAM SENG
46B TOH TUCK ROAD

#02-04
Singapore 596748

FINAL REPAIR COST FOR TOYOTA AXIO SGXB050T

To supply spare parts

To remove roof lining, front and
rear seats, trim board and carpet

To apply undersealing
To putty and spray replaced parts
To remove, cut-out damaged parts,

panel beating, welding, align,
refix and te renew above parts

Add 7% GST :

Total

Singapore Dollars Two Thousand Four Hundred and
Sixty One Only

75642.

TAX INVOICE
No. 1 225129
Date : 10.03.2018

PAGE : 1

161.00

N e ——



CCHIN HUI CAR RENTAL o so s

BLK 7. SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE. SECTOR C, #01-76, SINGAPORE 575642. TEL: 6453 4680

CUSTOMER
GAN YAM SENG \\ \
C/O ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD mvoice no @ 180075
BLK 7 SIN MING IND. ESTATE,
SECTOR C, #01-76 DATE ¢ 28022018
k ATTN: MR. ALAN KHONG WS J
RENTAL FEES FOR :-
s/n [rental veh no.| vha no. vr reference no, of davis | unit pr§ amount
1 |SIS 8I07E 8058 SGX 8050T 5 140,00 | §  700.00
EFE SEERERERRERET L]
PLEASE LET US HAVE YOUR CHEQUE MADE IN FAVOR TOTAL: 5 700,00

OF CHIN HUI CAR RENTAL

YOUR EARLY REMITTANCE IS MUCH APPRECIATED,

CHIN §UI CAB'RENTAL



Irll\N HUI CAR RENTAL

BLE 7. SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE,. SECTOR C, #01-76,

SIGAPORE 575642, TEL: 6453 4680
REGN. NO.: 33090791K

Hirer - H—M W _S\H {:}

NRIC § Paszpor Np g [ 1 I USH{E f_ Dtz af Birth

bR Tuf Tued @
Ho-o0d Sc §7ve

Adlgirogs,

FEEE3K

Contact Number

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

NO:| 8058

= ‘. |
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CHIRG S

DRIVERS PARTICULARS

. 1 el
| Dy 5@#. ”.‘-rt\ fr# P iy (:f DU {‘JU

Drniver above Age 70 years ald
Driver less than 2 years Driving Exparience

2. ADDITIONAL EXCESS - 853000.00
Dnver Age 23 to 25 years old with 2 years driving experignce
Criver Age &5 to 70 years old with 2 years driving experence

L 86 x fest T
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1. NOT PERMITTED TO DRIVE - Not Covered - J[ Elm Tl ¢ ¥
Driver Age 22 years old and below s [

TOTAL Ci uumGEss Q Y |
izt — 2 f O—‘Zl:)—.
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and o parking and rEfs imnngoments may be billed (o st sccourt and my signature sbove will be commdened 0 have been msce of the chanuetredil Cond vouchar. Al informaton

| harvm glvn GHIN MW CAR RENTAL m conmection with 1His agresmsst s fiie
" IMPORTANT

1. ALL FARKING AMD TRAFFIC VIOGLATIONS ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE HIRER, AND ADMIMISTRATIVE CHARGE WILL BE LEVIED DN ANY TRAFFIC VIOLATIDNG

RENRECTED

2. THE HIRER SHALL BE LIABLE FIIR EXCESS CHARGES FOR ANY LATE RETURN AT THE RATE SHOWN PER HIDUR OR PER DAY, INCLUSIVE OF CIW ANDVOR PAI WHERE

APPLICABLE

0 VEHICLE iS5 STRICTLY FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY, AND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGAPORE WITHOUT PRIOR COMSENT OF THE COMPANY OHIN HUI CAR

RENTAL

4. |N CABE OF ACCIDENT. THE HIRER EHALL REFPORT TO RENTAL OFFICE IMMEDMATELY. |F THERE |2 BODILY INJURIES, A POLICE REFORT MUST BE MADE WITHIN 24

HOURS

RETURN OF VEHICLE THE HIRER | DRIVER |5 REQUIRED TO SIGN 1M THE COLLINMN "BIGNATURE OF HERER f IRIVER™ FAILING WHICH THE DAY AND TIME INSERTED BELDW
SHAL| BE OEEMED TO BE THE DAY AND TIME THE VEFIOLE 18 RETURNED TO CHIN HUI CAR RENTAL AND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPTED AS COMOLUSIVE EVIDENCE
QF THE SAME AND SHALL NOT BE CHALLENGCED OR (UESTIONED ON ANY ACCOUNT WHATSDEVER

Dﬁ"f_ M TIME N MILEAGE CHECKED BY - Y
i £ . ,

I‘l_} b

P RN L I ) R




. . 252018

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-019221

Date of Reguest: 05/02/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Alan's United Auto Pte Lid
Bik 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
mm"‘ & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE #rcne: <65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

#01-T6

Singapore 575642

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 05/02/2018

nquiry By CHOU HWEE TIAN
Vehicle No. EHTST1X

Accident Date 05/02/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurar Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
EHTET1X AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pta. Lid. 28/08/2017-27/08/2018 65-5419-3000
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwardad to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Singapore and wa take no responsibility for their accuracy of contents and shall be under no liability whalsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

or in connaction with the reports or their images.

"liﬁ is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

htips:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=1715361&4CFID=2801796BACFTOKEN=COfS .
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4 24502018 Invoice

q

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE -ro-c +655224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION

Operating Hours: Monday fo Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration Mo: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-019221
Date of Request: 05/02/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-76
Singapore 575642
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 05/02/2018
inquir}.r By CHOU HWEE TIAN
P Vehicle No. EHTST1X
Accident Date 05/02/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TF Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2,00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use;
Date:
[¥] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

https:/isingapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&rafid=1715361&CFI0=2801T968ACFTOKEN=COIS ... 22



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Casg Notified Est Subwmitted | Adj Assigned  |Adj Rot | 4d] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
i D8 Feb 2018 E;,;ﬁ’ 2018 $%2,300.00 5$2,300.00 Fending for Survey
" ;
Edit Reg gon Ad Azt | gan Estimates | | view Rt | Cancel Case. |

Reference Claim Detaills

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Creatad by adjuster]
Chng Siong Soon, ID: 505602128

GAM YAM SENG, [1D: S1110856C

} iu‘.wz.f?ma 10:00 - :59

%" |[324 Months and 29 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr}]
: |TP/ 23025473905G m*;“;'};“:"' 2100425656 (Comprehensive)

Policy Ne.
{Claimant}: |
L — | Excess: | o

Repairer: | Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) Blk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, 575642 Sin Ming - Tel: 6453 A6AG

Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Handled by Kesaval, Jaclyn-M]
Insurer: laclyn-M, Kesaval@aig.com

ﬁ::::-‘::t" Lonpac Insurance Bhd (HQ) - Tel: +55 61507388

| Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 20/02/2018]

SGXBOS0T Date of Loss

rZ17VPOS015027

| EH75T1X

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All i Compose Case Mail i
There are no mai for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | Compiete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
| No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp ... 11/9/2018



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SGXBO50T (23025473905G)

[EH7571X]
TP
GAM YAM SENG

Feb 5 2018 10:00AM
[Chng Siong Soon]
Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Upkoad Documents | _Upload Phatos | Compose New Letter | Upload video | _Upload Audio | View [View in Browser 2]
|Letters/Correspondences N - a 1perpage  |v]
[Na_[Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
11 [{Draft) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown ﬁ___ Edit
i
E[Mltlll'l'lll'll: Reports Ia per page :l] [+A
[No_[Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (SG) Thumbnail| Print
. ) Accident Statement
!. ] i kit | From:00 - Rog, No: EHFSTIN, Daimant: CHNG FIONG S00N n Lo HTH
|
! Photos/Images o [3 per page <1 M
(No_|Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print

1 |D4/D9/18 1752 Odometer Reading 0 | wadic | A
2 |D4/09/18 17:52 Chassis Number 0 | s | B
3 |04/09/18 17:53 | General View D | wadws | 4
4 |04/09/1817:53 | General View O | ldiwc | B
5 |D4/0%/16 17:53 | General View 0 | wadiec | &
6 |04/09/1817:53 | General View 0| adec | A
7 04/09/1817:53 | General View 0 | adec | A
B 04/09/18 17:53 | Genersl View © | Loadrws | 4
'S |DA/0S/1617:53 | General View 0 | Laaws |
10 |04/09/18 17:53 | General View Load G | A
11 |0409/18 17:53 | General View 0 | adwe |
12 [04/09/18 17:53 | General View 0 | Lora e
13 |04/09718 17:53 | Ganeral View O | adws |
14 |D4/09/18 17:53 | General View © | esws | &
15 |04/09/18 17:53 | General View 0 | ceawc | M
16 |04/09/18 17:53 | Reinspection Photo 0 cwaws | @
17 |04/08/18 17:53 | Relnspection Photo D | kaiws | &
18 [04/05/1817:53 | Reinspection Photo O s | M
19 |D4/09/18 17:53 Reinspection Photo 0 | lcedirs | &
|20 |04/09/18 17153 Reinspaction Photo 0 | Load G
Iﬂ_mmunhil‘l;n 1 per page :ﬁ_ui'
Mo_|Relabel/Ruorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 0B/0Z/18 18:21 | EMAIL FROM WORKSHOP @ | LoacFoF

|2 08/02/18 18:32 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 07.02.2018 @ | LoadPOF

|3 |0B/02/18 18:22 | TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT s Load POF

4 09/02/1812:11 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED _ Load PDF

5 |28/03/18 10:10 | LETTER TOD O1 0 | ioad por

6 |11/09/1808:21 | WORKSHOP INVOICE € | Load PDF

7 [13/09/18 08:23  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM © | Load POF

'Lq  |11/05/18 06:23 | Release Voucher Load FOF

s [11/09/1808:23  RENTAL RECEIFT == —= Load POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...
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Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

| Letters /Correspondences [1perpage [v]
[No | Finalzed On LKK Auto Consultants PteLkd (HQ) _ Thumbnail | Print |
10 [11/03/1808:23 | GIA SEARCH O [ odeoF [ ]

Documents Checklist

' DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
i:I'FErn are no gocument checklists configured. |

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
Fente: Rermarks ars Drvele unkfEss yind shaw i 1o ather parties

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 11/9/2018



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: EH7571X (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA COROLLA 1.5 X
SGXB050T (TP veh) AXIO (A)
[Data of Accident: | 05/02/2018
Global Sum Settlement | - | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate - 4 179,08
Final Repair Cost t- 2.461.00
Loss of Use ] days at $0.00 per day
Renlal (if any) i1 S50000| 5 days
LTA | GIA Search Fee 1 200
Others: - 0.00
'8
Final Settlement Sum - 2,963.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Mo BOLA Scenario No;

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability lo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Alan's United Auto Ple Ltd -1 2,863.00
2) -
3 '$
11 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdocé& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 11/9/2018



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreane 1essor1sery

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC4/AIG18002602/KHB302
Date: 11/09/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple_ Lid.  Policy No: 2100425656
EL":‘“'“' Vehicle scxsos0T Insured Vehicle No; EH7571X
Date of Loss: 05/02/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 230254738056
D RIPTION & |
Reg No: SGX8050T
Make & Model: TOYOTA COROLLA, 1.5 X AXIO (&) Engine No: INZC595061
Reg. Date: 07/08/2007 (Man. Year: 2007) Chassis No: NZE1416032879
Colour: Metallic Grey Odometer: 167451 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A

Sum Insured (S$);

Market Value/New Car Price

MDITION OF VEHI THE TI F SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable), Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/60 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/60 R15
Front Lefi Side: Yokohama ¥ mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 4 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama ¥ mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 4 mm
The above valuss represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Pars 212565 1.534.20 591.45 27.82
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,780.00 1.400.00 380.00 21.35
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 3,805.65 2,934.20 971.45 24.87
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) 2,300.00
(S%) 3,905.85 2,300.00 1,605.65 41.11
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 27340 161.00 112.40 41,11
Nett Amount (5§) 4,179.05 2,461.00 1,718.05 #41.11
+ Car Rental (5.0 x 55100.00/day) (5§) 500.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 2.00
Nett Liability (S5) 2,963.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 07022018
Date Inspected: 071022018 Inspecled At: Alan's United Auto Pte Lid (HQ)

Blk 7 Sin Ming industrial Estate, #01-76
Singapore 575642

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 11/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: Thiz repor! represents our fndings al the time and place of inspection stated herew. Such inspection has been camed out fo the best of our
khowledge and abiity but any other labity under any other circumstances /s hereby exprassly excluded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 11/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *"FRONT OFs DOOR Bent 853.10FL *853.10FL
2 1 *FRONT O/S DOOR RUBBER Serviceable 144 70FL *.FL
2 1 "FRONT O/S DOOR GLASS REGULATOR GEAR Damaged 202B80FL ~202.B0FL
4 1 "SET FRONT O/S DOOR FRAME TAPE Necessary 87.50FL *47.50 FL
5 1 *REAR O/S DOOR Bent 804 90FL *B04.90FL
6 2 *REAR 0O/S DOOR HINGE Repair 144 40FL “~FL
7 1 *REAR O/S DOOR RUBBER Serviceable 152 80FL “FL
8 1 *SET REAR 0/S DDOR FRAME TAPE Necessary 87.50FL *B7.50FL
9 1 *0/S CENTRE PILLAR Repair 34B.TOFL “FL

F=Franchise par, L=ListliemDisc
Sub Total (S§)  2,834.20 2,045.60
- List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S$) 708.55 511.40

Total Parts (S§)  2,12565  1,534.20

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen ... 11/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscelansous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE ROOF LINING FRONT AND REAR SEATS ,TRIM MNew 120.00 0.00

BOARD AND CARPET
2 TO APPLY UNDERSEALING New 50.00 60.00
3 TO PUTTY AND SPRAY REPLACED PARTS New 900.00 800.00
4 TO REMOVE,CUT-0OUT DAMAGED PARTS ,PANEL New T00.00 540,00

BEATING WELDING ,ALIGN ,REFIX AND TO RENEW ABOVE

PARTS

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,780.00 1,400.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-aut,
< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 11/9/2018



