Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 5 November 2018 7:27 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); William Tan
Subject: Re: SIW 779Y-DOA: 8/2/2018

Dear Madam,
| accept your lump sum repair offer $5,500 and 6 working days.

Thank you.

On Mon, 29 Oct 2018 at 10:12 AM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear William,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $5500/- @ 6 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 6:52 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: SIW 779Y-DOA: 8/2/2018










On Fri, 26 Oct 2018 at 6:46 PM, William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com> wrote:













On Fri, 26 Oct 2018 at 6:43 PM, William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com> wrote:
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On Fri, 26 Oct 2018 at 5:23 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear William,

Kindly forward us resurvey photos.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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