Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 April, 2019 10:32 AM

To: 'Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims)'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident on 5/2/2018 involving SHC 4381M & SJJ 4931R (China Taiping's

insured) Our Ref: TAX/02/18/2033/Ig

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: TAX/02/18/2033/1g
Our Ref: CC3/CTI18002577/Swa3

Dear Lee Gek,
ACCIDENT ON 05/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHC 4381M AND SJJ 4391R
We refer to the above matter.

We were informed by our principal M/s China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltdthat they have repudiated claim
for this accident.

Please re-direct your client’s claim to our insured for redress.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 August, 2018 9:51 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident on 5/2/2018 involving SHC 4381M & SJJ 4931R (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/02/18/2033/Ig

Dear Vivian,



As spoken today, we understand that there is no report made by your insured to-date.
We cannot be waiting indefinitely.

Please let us know by 5" September 2018 if your principal has repudiated liability so that we can proceed with legal
action against your insured. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)

Sent: 21/05/2018 17:39

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident on 5/2/2018 involving SHC 4381M & SJJ 4931R (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/02/18/2033/Ig

Dear Vivian,
We attach 2 more scene photos showing your insured’s NRIC and his driving licence.

Since there is no report, please let us know if your principal has repudiated liability. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 21/05/2018 10:10

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & 1A/ Taxis/Claims)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 5/2/2018 involving SHC 4381M & S1J 4931R (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/02/18/2033/Ig

WTHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to the email below.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.




Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 21 May, 2018 9:13 AM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident on 5/2/2018 involving SHC 4381M & SJJ 4931R (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/02/18/2033/Ig

URGENT
REMINDER

Dear All,

We refer to our LOD of 12/3/2018.

Video footage is not available. We attach the scene photos for your perusal.
Please let us have your offer by 28" May 2018. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)

Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@_fmnr

AUTOMOTIVE




