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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2018 3:47 PM

To: assign; chowauto; rta; admin; cynthia.ong; LKK Valuation; motorsurvey; admin

Cc: ANG Yvonne; grace

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV) - S8M007Y3 / SJM2263H / DOA : 26.01.2018 -
Urgent

Attachments: SJM2263H Rebate.pdf

Hi

Please let me have your market value urgently.

-4 K

Best Regards

Kitty Teo | Specialist, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 Press 3

~ A

. redefining /insurance

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: assign [mailto:assign@Ibs-auto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 06 February, 2018 11:04 AM

To: chowauto <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; rta <rta@rta.com.sg>; admin <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>;
cynthia.ong <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; motorsurvey
<motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; admin <admin@Ibs-auto.com>

Cc: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>; HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; ANG Yvonne
<yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; TAN Jas <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; ONG Birdie <birdie.ong@axa.com.sg>; grace
<grace@lbs-auto.com>

Subject: Re: Checking Market Value (MV) - S8MO007Y3 / $JM2263H / DOA : 26.01.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48
hours.

Thank you.

Regards,

Grace

LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to pe Exported:
Intended De~regfstratf'on Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Mode:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eiigiba'h'ty Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Company

0932C

SIM2263H
Yes

06 Feb 2018

HYUNDA|

I30(FD) 1.6 DOHC AUTO
Grey

2008

G4FC8U572243
KMHDCSIDR9U16022O
89.7 kW (120 bhp)
$13,902.00

26 Dec 2008

26 Dec 2008

1

$13,902.00

Yes
25 Dec 2018

$6,951.00

25 Dec 2018

E-Open Category

vrl.lta, gov.sg/taivri/actionse nquireRebate ByPublicBefore Dereglinput?Fun CTION_ID=F03 04009TT

-
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PARF/CQE Rebate Enquiry

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $15,058.00
COE Rebate Amount: $1,220.00
To.tal Rebafe Amount: | .$8,171..00

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Feb 2018

OK

httpé:ia‘vrl.Ita.gov.sgﬂta!vrl!action!enquireRebateByF’ublicBeforeDereglnput‘? FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT 212



