Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 3:35 PM

To: zaarafida@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident on 2/2/2018 involving SHB 496Y & SLC 9848D (Our Ref:
TAX/02/18/2013/1g)

Dear Mr. Singh,
We refer to Ms. Lee Gek’s e-mail below.
We do billing our principal M/s AlG for third-party claim where we had conducted survey to third-party vehicle.

For private settlement, you have to issue a separate cheque at $342.40 (GST included) for our survey fee.

Payable to : M/s LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Kindly send the cheque to:

Joy Irene (Ref: CC3/LCR18002492/R1js3)
M/s LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,Ubi Avenue 1 #02-25

Singapore 408933

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.Ilt may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 2:59 PM

To: zaarafida@gmail.com

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident on 2/2/2018 involving SHB 496Y & SLC 9848D (Our Ref: TAX/02/18/2013/Ig)

Dear Mr Singh,
We refer to your calls proposing for private settlement.
As informed you, our taxi was surveyed by AlG’s appointed surveyor LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd prior to repair.
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We apologised for the delay as we are waiting for LKK to finalise the repair costs with our workshop. The amount
has just been finalised and we quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of repairs $ 950.00 (as recommended by LKK)
Loss of rental S 735.63 (5133.75 x 5.5 days)
LTA search fee S 5.00

$1690.63 (excluding the survey fee)

Please let us have your cheque for $1,690.63 payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD and mail to claims department, SMRT
Automotive Services Pte Ltd, No. 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4, Singapore 757705.

Please deal with Ms Joy from LKK with regards to the survey fee.
Thank you.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
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