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, V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- e 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3
Hv.0u07 TH E CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199565 Date: 07022018 I””"ul"mllm m
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJD 2443C Veh. Inspected SHC 6327H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 07/02/2018
& Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c ]
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 068/02/2018 Inspection Date 07/02/2018
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
Sa. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




FEREANE §, #0225 PAYA UKL INDLSTREAL PARK o Ml s AT EEE
Your ref;  To Be Advised
Our ref: CC4/1L.PC18002487/K1hb3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear SivMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer to the above matter.

ompiny Regietration No. 190607158

MRS TEL ¢ o6S ) 62563567 AN 1 1IN

Date: 08.02.2018

SHC632TH

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 07.02.2018
al the premises of M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 3,127.30
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 1,459.80
"Check” Trtems Amount 1 8% -

Market Value ;8% -

L.TA Reimbursement Value ;5% -

Nett Value 8% e
Description of Damage: B
The vehicle sustained damages at the LAl g1 5
Rear O/S Portion aften
Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chona (LKK Auto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo®@lonpac.com:

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February, 2018 10:57 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Our Ref; 17/18/18/VP05/020381 Accident involving SID2443C & SHCB327H at
Bishan Junction on 6/2/18

Attachments: 07022018105104 pdf

Dear Catherine,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SHC 6327H on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon. :
Kol

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e — #

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com:>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 9:53 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020381 Accident involving 5)D2443C & SHCB32TH at
Bishan Junction on 6/2/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3

Attachments: 28022018083520.pdf

Dear Shu Pei,

We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 7:10 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020381 Accident involving 51D2443C & SHC6327H at Bishan Junction on 6/2/18
**¥| KK REF:CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4D8533)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
Sent: Friday, 9 February 2018 9:11 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>



Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020381 Accident involving $JD2443C & SHC6327H at Bishan Junction on 6/2/18

***| KK REF:CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3
Dear Shu Pei,

Our insured has yet to lodge a report and we are making enquiries.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com

Sent: Thursday, 8 February, 2018 7:16 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020381 Accident involving 51D2443C & SHCA327H at Bishan Junction on 6/2/18
*#¥| KK REF:CC4/LPC1B8002487/K1hb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 6327H at M/s Premier Automotive Services
Pte Ltd.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-2108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 10:59 AM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <gricwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com:

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VvP05/020381 Accident involving 5/D2443C & SHCEA27H at Bishan Junction on 6/2/18

Dear Eric,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com

sent: Wednesday, 7 February, 2018 10:57 AM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lenpac.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020381 Accident involving 5/D2443C & SHC8327H at Bishan Junction on 6/2/18

Dear Catherine,

Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SHC 6327H on without Prejudice Basis.
We look forward to receiving your report soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443

TEL: 65446676 / 65446689 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D
7-Feb-18

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA REGN NO: SHC 6327 H

1pc Rear bumper _— $ §96.00
1 pc Rear bumper lower cover = § 206,00
1pc Rear bumper ofs side bracket @ $29.00 * $ 29.00
1pec Rear bumper inner sponge > 3 114.00
1pc Rear bumper reinforcement o 3 607.00
1 pc Rear bumper ofs stay @ $53.00 ~< B 53.00
2 pcs Rear bumper reinforcement lower bracket @ $18.00 * 3 36.00
2 pcs Rear bumper reinforcement upper bracket @ $18.00 %= % 36.00
$ 1,777.00
Less 10% 3 177.70
3 1,599.30

SINETT
1 set Rear bumper clips — 5 48.00

1 set Reverse sensor = 5 2}0460'/ Z2evo
Sundry 3 E}U—Uﬁ’lx

To dismantle / replace/test reverse sensor to new bumper

and reset to the same $ 12080~ 2
To dismantle / refit the inner garnishes, inner linings, inner
trims, cushion seat, carpet, etc to facilitate repairs. $ 18080 X<

To labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including knock-out, straighten, repair,

reshape and adjust of the same $ 4,591115/ S
To putty and spray painting on rear bumper $ 200.08~ /{°
To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels. g z‘ga"ij'n,' <

3 3,127.30

( ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST )

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.

b [~ ((€e/

/ :}//f o 4’! | : o2
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7-Feb-18

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02
SINGAPOKE 486443
TEl: 65446676 / 65446680 FANX: 62141511
CO. REG 2007077430 GST REG: 2007077431

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA REGN NO: SHC 6327 H

1pc
1 pc
1pc
1pe
1pc
1pc
2 pes
Z pcs

SINETT

1 set
1set

B

Rear bumper o M

Rear bumper lower cover = o
e
Rear bumper ofs side bracket (@ $2&-88
LT
e V5

Rear bumper inner sponge

Rear bumper remnforcement
P

Rear bumper o/s stay @ 55408 <J

Rear bumper reinforcement lower bracket @ $18.00 £5%

Rear bumper reinforcement upper bracket @ 518.00 %

Less 10%

Rear bumper clips —  m**

—

Reverse sensor

Sundry

To dismantie / replace/test reverse sensor to new bumper
and reset to the same

To dismantle | refit the inner garnishes, inner imngs, inner
irims. cushion seat, carpet eic to facilitate repairs

To labour charge for dismantie and renew the accident
damaged parts Including knock-out, straighten, repair
reshape and adjust of the same

To putty and spray painting on rear bumper

To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels

{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST )
THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REFPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE

ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.
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5 53 00
5 36 00
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5 17770
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5 48.00 -
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Vic (LKKAuto)

e T Er—— e —— e e e ——|
From: Gary Shi <gary.shi@premiertaxi.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 1:25 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc AccReport; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6327H & SJD2443C on 06.02.18 (Lonpac case) LKK
REF CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3
Attachments: SHC6327H - DV pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Vic,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client’s part and driver of SHC6327H,
our client agreed to direct settle the above claims at $1690.00

We enclosed hereby Discharge voucher for & ATA your kind attention, original copies will pass to Mr Kalvin.

Kindly let us have your settlement sum of 551690.00 in our favour — Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd within
14days from the date hereof.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damage only.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www . premiertaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Motice | This e-mail message, including ary attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipientis) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure ar distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destray all copies of the ariginal message.

@& Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

wh

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 5:32 PM

To: Gary Shi

Cc: AccReport; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6327H & $JD2443C on 06.02.18 (Lonpac case) LKK REF
CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Gary,

we refer further to our below email.



Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we propose a global sum of $1,690.00 (all in) to settle your
client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the enclosed DV and ATA then forward back to us the original signed copy
together with the LOD and supporting documents for payment processing.

Thank you.

"please note that our abave offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of ligbility on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408633)

F IFES e
o

i Sgve the Earth- Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-malil, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 February, 2018 4:40 PM

To: Gary Shi

Cc: AccReport: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6327H & 5JD2443C on 06.02.18 (Lonpac case) LKK REF
CCA/LPC18002487/K1hb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Gary,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that till date, we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report.

We will follow up and will get back to you for an update.

Thank you.



Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{q08933)

¥ IIRS o

SLERER R Save the Larth Print only when hecessary’

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank yau.

From: Gary Shi [mailto:gary.shi@premiertaxi.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 February, 2018 4:10 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: AccReport; CS A Team

Subject: LOD / Accident involving SHC6327H & 5JD2443C on 06.02.18 (Lonpac case)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Asher & Vic,

Your Ref: S1D2443C

Our Ref: SHC6327H/GS

Date of accident: 06/02/2018

We refer to the above mentioned accident.

Hereby we would like to append our losses from Lonpac Insurance Bhd, as insurers of vehicle number S1D2443C
which their insured driver's negligence driving in the above accident.

Enclosed herewith our letter of demand and supporting documents for your kind perusal.
Kindly look into the matter and let us have your favourable reply as soon as possible.

To expedite this claim settlement, please reply to us by email.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premigrtaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Motice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipientis} and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unautharized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destray all copies of the oniginal message.

gh Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

v






Gag Shi

From: Gary Shi

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 1.25 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: AccReport. Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHCE327H & SJD2443C on 06.02.18 (Lonpac case) LKK
REF CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3

Attachments: SHCE327H - DV _pdf

WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Dear Vic,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client’s part and driver of
SHCG327H, our client agreed to direct settle the above claims at $1630.00

We enclosed hereby Discharge voucher for & ATA your kind attention, original copies will pass to Mr Kalvin.

Kindly let us have your settlement sum of 551690.00 in our favour — Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd within
14days from the date hereof.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damage only.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 4B6443
Tel: 6214 BBB0 Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited, if you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the ariginal message.

g4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

#h

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 5:32 PM

To: Gary Shi

Cc: AccReport; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6327H & $JD2443C on 06.02.18 (Lonpac case) LKK REF
CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Gary,

We refer further to our below email.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607 198R GST Reqg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

300 BEACH ROAD
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Ref : CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3n2

Date :

Code : LPC2

11-08-2018

|

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SJD 2443C Veh. Inspected SHC 8327H
Policy No. Z17VP05013462 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17/18/180P0O5/020381 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From ERIC Assign Date 07/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIA OPTIMA c.Cc 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KNAGM4 14MFS561402 Colour SILVER
Odometer 260619 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |2058/65 R16 ACHILLES 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/65 R18 ACHILLES T mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/65R18 ACHILLES 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/65 R16 ACHILLES 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR OfS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  06/02/2018 Ilnspaction Date 07/02/2018
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

-IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOCD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 6327H
: Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [ =1 B f OUr A%
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 656.00 696.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER CRACKED 206.00 206.00
1|REAR BUMPER (/S SIDE BRACKET SERVICEABLE 29.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER INNER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 114.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 607.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER 0/S STAY SERVICEABLE £3.00 .
2|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT LOWER BRACKET SERVICEABLE 36.00 -
{@%18.00
2|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT UPPER BRACKET SERVICEABLE 36.00 -
@$18.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -177.70 -80.20
1,599.30 811.80
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NMECESSARY 48.00 48.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|SUNDRY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00
378.00 248.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE/TEST REVERSE SENSOR TO 120.00 20.00
NEW BUMPER AND RESET TO THE SAME.
TO DISMANTLE/REFIT THE INNER GARNISHES,INNER  [NOT NECESSARY 180.00
LININGS, INNER TRIMS,CUSHION SEAT,CARPET,ETC TO
FACILITATE REPAIRS.
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE 450.00 200.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS.INCLUDING KNOCK-
OUT,STRAIGHTEN,REPAIR RESHAPE AND ADJUST OF
THE SAME.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR BUMPER. 200.00 180.00
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
REPLACED PANELS.
1,150.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,127.30 1,459.80
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,150.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) ;

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18002487/K1hb3n2
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