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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 08-02-2018 Qur Ref No. D18001102MFSH
Accldent Date 03-02-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHCB8248P Third Party Vehicle. SJLEZ10B
Survay Location NO 81 woodlands industrial park E9, #04-04,ES Premium s(757047)
Contact Person, ALLAN
Contact No. 0/ 90236602 Fax No. 0
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appotatsy LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA,
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

CARZ AUTO SERVICES

: ; tt . NIL
Ce : Workshop PTE LTD Attention, N
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the sufvay report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspation
This is'a compuler genaratiad latar, ro signatlrs reguired.




212018 Claim Workflow System
3ob Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/234709) Jo PRI Documents () | Close %
PRI Header Details
_ Claimant
Claim No D18001102MFSH Policy No D-1B0BB936MFSH S.No & 1 & CARZ ALN
Name
Workshop | CARZ AUTO SERVICES 5“""::n NO 61,woodlands industrial park 9, #04-04,£9 Premius
Pt PTE LTD & Contaci Mobile; 90236692 , Phone: 0 , Fax: 0
{Contact Person @ ALLAN) Dﬁtilli. Emailld: ALLAN_GOH@CARZAUTO.COM.SG
Qur LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions NITH .
Survayor PFTE LTD To Surveyor SUT PREGUDICR:
COMFQORT TP
Insured Insured 2
Sinine TRANSPORTATION PTE Vehicle No SHCB248P Vehicle SILB210B
oD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 06-02-2018 05:31:45 PM Appointed 07-02-2018 09:54:29 AM Accept 07-02-2018 1
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Surveyor I I ::qud
Inspection | s 07-02-2018 vey
Date *: (I, Report Date Enpﬁrt
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make | | Model Please Select Model ¥ Year |Select Year 1
Chasis No | | Engine No | Mileage |
Cubic
Color | CoBSHIY |
Multiple Decuments Upload
| Upload Multiple Docurnents |
Flle Name Action
|
Surveyor Job Remarks
Remarks I Sava l

bt s ficlaime. com 8001 /ClaimWSiSurveyorDetalls/ 234709
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

m—
From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com»
Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 5:43 PM
To: 'Claim Workflow System'; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ca: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOMSG; 'SUR"
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001102MESH/1

Dear Sir f Madam,

Fiease be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts to infarm the workshop to
present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

BEST REGARDS.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Paone: 6843-1972 | emodl: assignniented [Kkauts com | fux: Ba56-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Fram: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 10:40 AM

Ta: "Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims @rmsfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001102ZMFSH/1

Daar Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | enmil: assignments@ilickauto.com | fax: begbgqrs
Bk 51, Payn UbiTndustrial Parck, Ubi Avenge 4, #o2-25 | S(408953)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:owsmetorclaims@msfirstcapital com.sg]

sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 9:55 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: CWSMODTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001102MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS Fitst Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
- WWW.aVE.com



