Asher 5"2 (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday. 16 December 2019 3:53 PM

To: Asher Sng [LKKAuto), Admin A

Ce: Tan Kah Leong; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your ref : SNM18D00060C02/8(cml/tkl), ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SID 5298K AND PZ 1688H ON 02/01/2018

Attachments: TP LOD.pdf; LETTER TO OLpdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT pdf; LKK ADJUSTMENT pdf; LKK
INSPECTION pdf

Follow Up Flag: Faollow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Claim Ref: SNMISDOOOGOCO2/S(eml/tkl)

Dear Asher

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 5318480

We await your payment advice to enable Kah Leong to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sqg.cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: 4 #§# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it is infended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, aither in whale or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notily the sender immediately. Ploase delete the e-mail and any copies of if thereafter.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto: AsherSng/a@ Ikkauto.com|

Sent: Monday, 16 December, 2019 3:07 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh/@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee/@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your ref : SNM18D00060C02/8(cml/tkl). ACCIDENT INVOLVING SID
S208K AND PZ 1688H ON 02/01:2018

Your ref : SNM18D00060/C02/8

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JD 5298K AND PZ 1688H ON 02/01/2018

1




The accident occurred when our insured lost control and hit third party vehicle. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " SC AUTO INDUSTRIES (5) PTE LTD" at 53,184.80 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with G5T) $4,237.20 52,182.80
2. Loss of Use (5days x 5450) S 2,250.00 51,000.00 (4Days x 5250)
3. LTA Search Fee S 2.00 5 2.00

Total $3,184.80

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

lhank You,

Besl R2gorch

Asher Sng | Coso Hondlo:

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 48414051 | emall gsherna@lkkgulo com | fa 47414108

Blk 51, Poyo Ut Indusimicd Pane Ui Avenue | 32-15 | 51408¥33)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service,
For more information please visit hittp: /www symanteceloud.com




SCAUTO

Your Ref : SID5298K
Our Ref : 5C18/01/011/4TR-TP (PZ1688H)
12" january 2018

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {S) PTE LTD

Attn: Claim a
Dear 5ir / Mdm,
ACCID OLVING PZ1 D5298K ON 02.01.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
BY E-MAIL & POST

We are instructed by the owner of PZ1688H to claim damages against your insured, the driver of motor
vehicle no. SID5298K, in connection with a road traffic accident involving our client’s motor vehicle no.
PZ1688H and motor vehicle no. SJID5298K driven by your insured at the material time.

We are Instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligence and/or management of his
motor vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s motar vehicle was damaged and our clients have
been put to loss and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

1
1
3.

Costs of Repair (Incl. G5T) S 2,182.80
Loss of Rental/Use S 2,250.00
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00
Total S 443480

(S450 x 5 days)

Please note that our bus is under PRIVATE HIRE. NOT PRIVATE NON-HIRE, thus, not listed in the NIMA
Benchmark Rates, we need higher LOU to close.

Please note that you should send us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter of demand by e-mail
to claims @ scauto.com sg within seven (7) days of your receipt of this letter and revert with an offer not
later than fourteen (14) days of this letter. If we do not hear from you, we will submit the claim via our
solicitors,

Thank You.

Yaours faithfully,

5C Auto industries [5] Pte Ltd

T

F

scouto.com.sy

Globol Standards, Local Support



Our Ref: CC6/CTI 18002430/R1mb3

16 MAY 2018

LUA GEOK KEE
BLK78 LENTOR GREEN
PRESIDENT GARDENS
SINGAPORE 789309

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJD 5298K AND PZ1688H ON 02/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed 10 negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

1

Bevan Lim

Case Handler

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: bevanlimia@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



F Rat No SC18/01/0114TR-TP
To  SC Aulo Industiies |5 Pie Lid
" Ma, 51 Senoka Road
Singapore 758131

Dear SirMadam

REPAIRICLAIM FOR DAMAGES ARISING FROM AN ACCIDENT ON 03-Jan-2018, 18:18:00
ATIALONG SLIP RD FROM CTE TO AOCHOR AD

e e P

egistiation Mo MRIGH amvare the owner(s) of Vehils No PZISESH which was
Wmmmmm

et in mm:mwﬁm uoml EE b
2, 'We have appointed ihe firm of sclicitors MIS ol 3 act on mylour behall to reccwsr
gamages anuing out of the accident from he parties concemed.

1, 1'We heraby suthorse you 1o undartaks the necessary repairs o bring the Vehicls back 1o pre accident condltion and  appomt you as my ‘our agent 1o
[Ease with miy/our soliciors with reapect 1o mylour claim for damages

4. \Ne heraby suthoriss you to claim *Thisd Party/Own Damaged (O0)

£ \Me hove |matructed our salicitors to obtain all insbuctons pensining 1z e clam fom your goodselves (W ackmowlsoge thal all instrucbons glven to
them by you will thertote be as good s il they weie given by malus

L, U'We Bulhorise you 16 RPNt Burseyors 1o wapect e Vehaks snd to pay the Survey fes on my Jour Behalf priss i carmying aul the repars
7. I'We entrust you o carry our the regales diigently and lsave i entirsly o your discration in scesoting of repscing any ofer of ssisment

£, We have instructed our solicitors to releass sll monied recoversd and received By Ihem in connection with thes claim afler dedusiing iheir fees duectly
o you and 1o be made in the neme of 5C Auto Indusiries (8) Pte Lid. |/We authofise you o deduct the sumis) of money recoversd for the costs of mepair
o mest your repsir Bl Any sumis) of money recowvered for tha joas of wee will be refumed to maAm aftar deducting the surwey fess, your handling fess
Bdministrative charges and any other expensas Inclmed on myfour beball “We understand that all monies due to me/us shall only be released o melus
aftar wa have signed the dischargs voethers. I'e hereby agree 1o sign the decharge vouchers promptly on notification

5. 'We undemtand mnd appeeciale thal fyicur clsim may be unsuccessful o only pamally successful |0 Such an svsrd e shall
costs or sny shonfall forthwith on receipl of your Invoice. LWWe shall slso reimburse you for all ofher sxparses incumed by you on my
your adminstrative charges,

%
4
H

10, U'We shall on you requast furnish you with all relevant documents and infermabon promptly = ensbie you (o process the claim expeditiously  |We also
agrea o aiend court andiocr De @ wilness i necossary. You shall have fhae righl o discharge yourselves aa my four sgenl should |Wve il jo co-opermbe wilh
you of fumush you with the relevant dotumentsinformation by ghing meius witlen mofice 1o that effect In such an event, IA\Ve shall pay ithe repair costs
Forthwith on recedptol your invoice and reimburse you all other sxpenses incurred by you on myfour behalf including your administrative charges.

11, 'Wee resarve fha nghl 1o terminete you appoinferment as ow sgent =l any teme befoss the claim s seftled (0 such an evert AWe shall pay the mpai
contaforfwith on receipt of pourf mvoice and reemburse you all oifer expensss incwmed By you on my'our benall maluding your sdmenistrative charges

1L IWe aschnowledge your right to hewve & len over all documents and money held by you untl Bl monies owsd by melus fo you (where applicabla) has
bean fully seited

13 'We heseby sgree io pay you the following handling lee

m) 20% of the fotal amount Saimed for loss of use (afer ceducting the legal and survey fees) whare Court atengance js not requered, ar
(i) 25% of the iotal emount caimed for loes of uss (afer deducting the legal and survey fess| whers Court atendancs (s reguired.

14, 'We hereby request you bo carry out the Iallowing additonal repas mhs not resulting from the ssd accdent |

Additional Repair Jobs

Comt of Repsi B8

The balance amourt dus to ma far the koss of uss shall be vsed to pay the additional repair job.
Iive homby agres to pay you fhe sddiinel costs of repair on receipt of your (nvoice i he amount sucessfully cimimed for the coss of repar and for
loss of use is insufficsnt (o mest the addionnl costs of mpair

| have resd and understand the terms and conditions of this Letter of Authorisation snd || hes alss besn sxplained o ma n Mandasin

Fa o -

Dated thes 18 day of Decemnber, 2019

s : ) ) 5
*m-i';;m Tour Royale Services Ple Ltd ) =( <C )3)

L- - 'IJEL.FIIr:Ii Road #02-01 W . NSy

\_/\r‘ __,[ WHDBII&EQ - f ¥, NIE =

g Sty Authansed signatory of SC Aubg Indistries (5] Pie Lid
MEms 4 NRIC No . & NRIC Na

g

e

Sigmh:-i of Wilnees HC# DER E
Wiiness's Name: & NRIC No. 59

* Delete where sappilicabie



Folley Mo @ DMPCSMIDLI4E91702 Clalm Ne : SNMIEDOOD&OCOZ2
Claimant : TOUR ROYALE SERVICES PIE LTD
Amount t E53,1B4.80

DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY FOUR AND CENTS
EIGHTY ONLY.

I1/We agree to accept the sbove mentioned amount to be pald to mefus in full &
final setilement of all clalms, ooits & distursemsnts for injuries / damages
sustained by ma/us through an accidsat invelwving

Claimant Vehicle No. : P 1688H

Insured Vehicle No. ¢ S5JD 529BR

Date of Loss = 02F0L/201E

Flace of Accident t SLIP KD FROM CTE TO ROCHOR ED

IH CONSIDEHATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforessntlioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) BTE. LID., I/We agree absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD. and/o:=

Insyred Hame : LUA CGEON ¥EE
Driver Nams SEFMATHE TAN YU LING

"

from all clalms, pressnt ar futuze Ip gespect =f all lass, indury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment i= made without admission of liebility on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SIKGAFORE) PTE. LID.

(1} General Damages 5%
(2} Cost of Rapalsr/Ewmssss 55 2;182.B0
(3} Losa of Use/Rental/Earning g5 1,000.00
(4) GIA/Police Reporta/

Investigation Results/Search Fees 3 2.00
{5) Medical Reports/Expenses 5%
(6} Survey Feeas/Towing Fes/Disburssmsnt 55
[7) Cost including Disburasmant g5

TOTAL o 5 w v om0 w0 e s swciecwia e 8 3,184.80
Lk o 2 o 2 & 2 1 4 2 & o & o o L]

Claimant Hame: TOUR ROYALE SERVICES PIE LID HRIC Mo : 199043546

- Q
Signaturse I -L Date : H"(I“\H
W vices Pte Ltd
Pasoh Rogd m02-01

Singapore 089629 -




G oL AUTO INDUSTRIES (S) PTE LTD
§ ..J i i How . 1 01 LRI

- F
E il
SC AUTD LO.COIMLSO
Co Reg Mo 193800107D
M/S TOUR ROYALE SERVICES FTE LTD Final Bill
42 Craig Road GST Re No: 19.9800107D
SINGAPORE 089680 Date: 12/272018
Insured  TOUR ROYALE SERVICES PTE 11D Our Case Ref. SCISOIDIIMTR-TP
Accident Dme 212018
Policy VBX PLO90834 00008
Damaged Vehicle No: PZI68RH
S/no Description QTY Price  Disc Amount
Replaced Parts
| DOOR RUBDLER | PC 516000 - S 16000
2 ALUMINILUM PROFILE | PC £240.00 - S240.00
Labour
| SPRAY PAINTING | S 1,000,000 - S1.000.00
2 LABOLUR FOR LHS FRONT PORTION | S640.00 . S640.00
Subs Total < 2040.00
/ ST (%) S 14250
.'"
/ ”/ = Total Amount 5 LIBLBD
»

L
Authorised Signature




12372018 Invoice

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C©°7 Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE -icne <65 6226 0010 Fax +25 8224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

Our Ref No: GR-18-011885
Date of Reguest: 2301/2018 Your Ref No Onlina Purchase
SC Auto Industnes (S) Pta Lid
51 Sencko Road
#03-01
Singapore 758133
Dear SirMadam,
Enguiry Date 23/01/2018
Enguiry By Lea Mal Lin
TP Vehicle No. SJ05298K
Accident Date Q2/01/2018
Enguiry Result
TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel Mo,
5JD5298K China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 26/03/2017-25/03/2018 8388 81M
Thank You,

The images prowided fo you are taken from he original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the mambars of the General Insurance Association ol

Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no linbility whatsosver for any loss or damage anising out of

ar in connection with the reports or their images.

This 15 @ computer generated document and requires no signature

hitps singapore. merimen. comiclaima/indes. cfmMusebor=MTRsasAfuseaction=dsp _ganinviphrefid=17026258CFID=27204110ACFTONEN=158
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1123208 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE -1 <65 5226 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Dperating Hours: Monday to Fnday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C° Registration No. M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref No GR-18-011895
Date of Reguest: 23/017201B6 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
SC Auto Industries (S) Pte Ltd
51 Senoko Road
#03-01
Singapore 756133
Dear SirfMadam,
Enguiry Data 23/01/2018
Enquiry By Lea Mai Lin
TP Vehicle No. SJ05288K
Accident Date 02/01/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusiva) 2.0
Thank You

This s a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Darne:
[X] GIRQ [ ] Cash | | Chaque
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