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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Kian-Chuan <Kian-Chuan.Chan@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 February 2018 2:27 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1086670912SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18002406/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SLQ 8968Z(OI) & SGN 1937J ON 04/02/2018]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,  
 
Please proceed if everything is in order.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards, 
 
KC Chan  
AIG 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
Tel +(65) 6419 1945 | Fax +(65) 68357416 
kian-chuan.chan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the  
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and 
any  
copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any 
computer  
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by 
AIG  
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

____________________________________________   

 Please consider the environment before printing this email   
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, February 09, 2018 10:45 AM 
To: Chan, Kian-Chuan 
Subject: Your Ref: 1086670912SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18002406/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 8968Z(OI) & 
SGN 1937J ON 04/02/2018] 
 
Your Ref: 1086670912SG 
Our Ref: CC3/AIG18002406/R1pb3 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 8968Z(OI) & SGN 1937J ON 04/02/2018 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Our insured vehicle is registered under company. We noted that the relationship of the driver, Mr Reuben 
George with insured is “Relative”. 
 
We had spoken to Ms Florence(PIC) and she confirmed that Mr Reuben George is an authorised driver by 
them. 
 
In view of this, kindly advise if there is policy issue and whether we can proceed direct settlement with third 
party. 
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Thank you. 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


