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¥ LS B LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
B AP — 51 Utr Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

-_— TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg No 129607198R GST Reg Mo, 19-3507198-R

Affiliated to Federation Intarmationale Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CCB/AIG18002388/Uyb3
78 SHENTON WAY #08-16 N""“mﬂmmu
CHARTIS BUILDING Date . 08-02-2018
SINGAPCRE 079120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJV 2480X Veh. Inspected SJH 4288A
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date D&/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 16/01/2018 [Innpa{:tlon Date 05/02/2018
Survey held at JHAUTO TRADING
14 DEFU LANE 10 #01-388
DEFU INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 539185
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BjIN ACCORDANCE TD YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




JHAUTO TRADING

14 Defu Lane 10,

Detu Industrial Estate
HO1-398

Singapore 539195

H/P: 9771 8731 / 9054 5425
Email: gih-wih@hotmail.com

CASH SALE
Invoice Date: 23/01/18
Vehicle No: SIH4 2884
Make/Model: Hydunai Tucson

Business Registration - 532407761 Chassis No:
Mileage:
To: 3" Party Claim
S/N | QUANTITY | " PARTICULARS TUNIT | AMOUNT
PRICE (sS)
== (S i ST ! L3
01 | 01 |Rear Bumper (Whole) ™ /e 0’1;.,.; Z _ | $B3460
02 o1 Rear Inner Bumper Panel AT | S5830 ﬂ"
03 | 02 | Bumper Retainer fen | 59095 | S18190—
04 | 15et | ReverseSensor  Shgd doossm) | $25150
05 Labour For Above _*00 | | $220.00
06 | Spray Painting For Accident Area ~ 30p | | $35000

Customer’s Signature / Co. Stamp
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JHAUTO TRADING

14 Defu Lane 10,

Defu Industrial Estate.
#01-398

Singapore 539195

H/P: 9771 8731 / 9054 5425
Email: gjh-wjh@hotmail.com

CASH SALE
Invoice Date: 23/01/18
Vehicle No: SIH4288BA
Make/Model: Hydunai Tucson

Business Registration : 53240776L Chassis No:
Mileage:
To: 3" Party Claim
| S/N | QUANTITY PARTICULARS UNIT AMOUNT
107 PRICE (S$)
01 01 Rear Bumper (Whole) Pyl & a $834.60
02 01 Rear Inner Bumper Panel A 5588.00 &
03 02 Bumper Retainer Lt P $90.95 | 5181.90—
04 1Set | Reverse Sensor ShiA 2005 §251.50
05 Labour For Above 0D $220.00
06 Spray Painting For Accident Area 2oo $350.00
i Total: $2,426
ot Bfld
Customer’s Signature /.Co.Stamp W For JHAUTO TRADING
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3132018

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type:
Owner |D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle Na.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Qriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

PARF/COE Rebate Englilry

Singapore NRIC

84798

5JHA28BA

No

13Mar 2018
HYLUNDAI
TUCSON20A
Black

2008
G4GCB246591
KMHJINB81BR?U945322
104.0 kW [139 bhp)
$14.799.00

07 Aug 2008

07 Aug 2008

2

$11.283.00

Yes
06 Aug 2018

$5,641.00

06 Aug 2018

E-Open Category

hittps:iivr lta.gay saita’vilaction'engureRebateByPubhcBefaraDe regiNpul?FUNCTION I0=FO304008TT

2



na2om PARFICOE Rebale Enguiry

GOE Petiod(Years): 10

QP Paid: $16.301.00
COE Rebate Amount: $582.00
Total Rebate Amount: $6,223.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Mar 2018

OK

hitps divrl.lta gov.sgitalviiactionsnquireRebateByPublicBefor Dereginpul TFUNC TION_ID=FO304006TT 22



Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Jh G <gjh-wjh@hotmail com>

Sent: Saturday, 24 March 2018 5:24 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SIH 42884 Our Ref: CCH/AIG18002398/umb3 ACCIDENT
INVOLVING S5JV 2490X(AIG) & SJH 4288A ON 16/01/2018

Attachments: DV & ATA pdf

Hi Bevan,

Please refer to attached for the DV & ATA as requested earlier.
Please proceed on your side.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Mr Hui

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@Ikkauto.com=>

Sent: Thursday, March 22, 2018 5:51 PM

To:lhG

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref; SIH 4288A Our Ref; CC6/AIG18002398/umb3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV 2490X(AIG) & SIH 4288A
ON 16/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mr Hui,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Kindly sign the Attached DV and ATA and revert back to us for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence an the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud



Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya UThi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408033)

-

FLIYrs =
SLLRER =W Save the Farth Print only when mecessory

From: Jh G [mailto:gjh-wjh@hotmail.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 8:20 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SJH 4288A Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002398/umb3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV 2490X(AIG) & SIH 4288A
ON 16/01/2018

Hi Bevan,

Confirmed with acceptance.

Please proceed on your side.

Let me know any documents i need to submit before proceeding with payment.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mr Hui

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) < im@lkk .com
Sent: Monday, March 19, 2018 5:13 PM

To: gih-wih@hotmail.com

Ce: Vic [LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SJH 4288A Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002398/umb3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV 2490X(AIG) & SIH 4288A ON
16/01/2018

Your Ref: SJH 4288A Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC&/AIG18002398/umb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JV 24%0X(AIG) & SJH 4288A ON 15/01/2018
We reter fo the above matter,

We propose setliement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,300.00
2. Loss of Use [2days x $380.00) £ 150.00
3.LTA search b 7.45

Total | 51.467.45




Please confirm occeptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on @ without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email; BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408043)

s

RSN Sove the Farthe Print only when necessary



51 UBIAVE 1, #801-25 PAYA LUBEHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAN : (63) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002398/Umb3

14 MARCH 2018

LIANG WEIMIN

APT BLK132 LORONG AH SO0
#12-416

SINGAPORE 530132

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV 2490X AND SJH 4288A ON 16/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
Bevan Lim
Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: bevanlim(@lkkauto.com

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Depr)



AU ZATIONT

. CHIANG EE_KOON (the third party claimant™) of BLK310B PUNGGOL WALK #04-552
S(822310) 1address). owner of _SJH 4288A (vehicle no.) hereby authorize JHAUTO TRADING

("the workshop™) 10 act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of
use (“claim™) for my vehicle no _SJH4288A that was damaged pursuant to the accident which

eccurred on _16/01/2018 _(date) along _KPE TOWARDS ECP BEFORE AIRPORT ROAD

EXITS tlocation) involving vehicle no’s _SJV 2490X  (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further 1o settlement of my claim with

payment cheque's being made in favour of the workshop.

| lurther achnowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on & without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s 1s concerned,

Dated this _ 2% (day)of _ Y%K (onth) 20\ ¥ (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
{with chop if applicable) {with chop)

Scanned by CamScanner



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

"Well. JHALUTO TRADING(“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement
with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS
PTE LTD iname of surveyur) with respect to the amount claimed for §51.300.00 (Repair Cost),
55160.00 (L.oss ufUmﬁ,ﬂﬂ‘l].ﬁLﬁ{Eﬁﬁmm; for vehicle no. SIH 4288 A that was damaged
pursuant to the accident which occurred on 16/01/2018 (date) along KPE TOWARD ECP BEFORE
AIRPORT ROAD EXIT (location) involving vehicle no/s  SIV 2490X. This is pursuant o the
inspection conducted on 05/02/2018 (date) a1 “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner CHIANG EE KOON(“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SJH 4288A make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority 1o settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit, We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid for all damages.
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SJH
4288A (vehicle no,) asa result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimani™ pursuant 1o the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.
This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

¢ MARCH  (month) 20 )8 (year)

Co L

Signed by appointed surveyor

Scanned by CamScanner



JHAUTO TRADING

14 Defu Lane 10

Defu Industrial Estate

#01-398

Singapore 539195

H/P: 97718731

Email: gjh-wijh@hotmail.com
Business Registration : 53240776L

Name: AIG 3™ Party Claim

Contact:

Cash Bill : JHO109

Invoice Date: 14/02/18
Vehicle Num: SJIH4288A
Make/Model: Hydunai Tucson

S/N Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S5
01 All Spare Parts & Labour
02 Lump Sum Finalizer @ $1300.00

E.&0.E Total S$ : 1300.00

Terms : Cash



Land TmnspnrtRAuﬂwmy

Land Transpon Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore ST5701

GST Registration No. | M4-0008528-2

Receipt No. © ITNET-00000-180131-001805

Previous Receipt No. :

E :
=i gt b b

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SJV24800
As at 16 Jan 2018/08:40:00
Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enguiry - SJV2480X
Enquiry Fea
20180131185508632193

Sub-Total
Total Before Rounding
Rounding Ditferenca
Total Amount Payabls
Paid By

BOo000000000kA (12
Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amount
Excess Refundabie Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

T.00 G40

T.00 048
T.00 0.49

3 Jan 2018 / 18:58:03
31 Jan 2018/ 18:55:53

T4B

748
Tap

Ta5

745
745

TAS
000




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fasilans
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _ ——
| case | Notffied Est Submitted | Adj Assigned Ad] Rot Al Submitted | Ins Auth'ed [Status
| 1620 2018 a0 e1300.00  |$$1,300.00 e T
Edit Reg_| _ | eonaanor | !n:m” view Rt | | case |

Reference Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjusier]
| Tnmured : Linng WeiMin, [D: 52646712H

[ Matin
Claimant: 1u-mmn EE KDONM, |0 502084798

Venicle feg. | . | 16/01/2018 09:00 - :59
Na.: SIH4288A Date f LoSS: |13y Months and 9 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r]]

Claim Type: | TP / 573944210656 POICYICOM®T | 2100186327 (Comprehensive)

Vehicle Reg,
Policy Na.
Noo SIV2450XK (Clalmant): SITVDEISS/VPEFRDD

(Insured) |

Repaiter: ;Jhlll:n Trading [) 14 DEFU LANE 10 ®01-358. DEFU INDUSTRIAL ESTATE, 539195 Defu Lane - Tel:
Hanadling | ATG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel; §5-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Kesaval, Jachyn-M]|
Insurer: | davclyi-M. Kesaval Biaig. com

([JMMANEY | Uberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6221 8611
|

\Adjuster. | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 5256-3561 _ [Handled by MARCUS CHUA| .. [Final Rpt due 20/02/2018]

. View Al I Compose Case Mail I
|Th!mm na mail for this case.
|

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subiject  Handier Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 3/4/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*SIH4288A (57394421065G)
[SIV2490X]
Ll
CHIANG EE KOON
Jan 16 2018 9:100AM
[Liang WeiMin]
Jhauto Trading
upisaa Documants | upiosa Phetas | Compose maw Letter | uposa vices | upiosd aus | Viaw [View in Browser| ~ |
Letters/Correspondences - 1 per page E &
Mo [Finalzed On LMK Auto Consuitants Pte Ld (HQ) Thumbnail Print
1 (oran) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown 0 e
Assessmaent Reports a Toerpee 121 B
\No [Finsiized On | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) _ Thumbnail | Print
QTR R b gromagiesso BN S 0 | LosdHTM
Photos/tmages ) Sperpage [V &
Ne | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
I 14/02/18 13:47 | Odometer Reading D | weaws | 4
:z :ummu 13:47 | General View o D | oaws | A
3 14/02/1813.47 | Chassis Number D | edivc | 4
4 1402/18 13:47 | General View B @ | sedwc | B
5 |14/02/18 13:47 General View D | wdws | A
;5 [14/02/18 13:47 | General View D | wediec | A
7 14/0/18 13:47 | Genersl View . O e | B
B 14/02/18 13:47 | General View O | wesws | A
9 14/02/18 13:47 General View 0| saws | B
(10 |14/02/18 13:47 | Ganaral View o O ars | B
11140216 13:47 | General View . . @O | s | BB
12 14/02/1B13:47 | General View 0D | weaws | B
11 14/00/18 13:47 | General View 0| wede | A
14 14/02/18 13:47 | Genersl View o B © | wedrs | B
15  14/02/18 13:47 | Genaral View B 0| owiws | 4
16 1402181347 | Genersl View O | weiws &
17 14/02/18 1347 | General View D | wadwrs | A
18 14/02/18 13:47 | General View D | wadws | A
18 14/02/18 13:47 | Ganeral View a © | wwowrs | &
20 14011813147 | General View O | siwc | 4
21 140181347 General View N O wrc | B
22 14/D/1B 13:47 | Genoral View 0| dws | M
23 14018 13:47  General View @ | adwc | B
24 |14/02/18 ﬁ?ﬁ‘-‘_  General View 0 | wdws | A
35 14/02/18 13:47 | Genersl View 0O wrs |
' 26 ]i“"' E?? _4, General View 0 wews |
17140218 13,47 | General View 0D | twdws | 4
28 1401181347 | General View © | wedwc | B2
29 14/02/18 13:47 | General View - ©  waows |
30140218 1347 | General View - O i | &4

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 3/4/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2
Letters/Correspondences . Tperpoge (V]| W2 |
\No_| Finatized On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) == Thumbnail | Print
31 14/0218 13:47 | General View O | owi¥c | B
|32 14/02/18 13:47 Reinspection Photo 0| caars | A
33 14/02/18 13:47  Reinspection Photo 0| oadrc | A
Pocumentation - R iperpage  [v] B4
No  Aelabel/Roorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print

1 0B/UZ/1B16:10 | TP GIA REPORT _2 Load POF
4 TE/02/18 1918 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load FOF
(3 14/03/18 06:50 | LETTER TO O1 ——— ﬁ Load POF
4_:03.-"IHHE 15:48 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
5 0104/16 1548 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
6 03/04/1815:48 | Relasse Voucher R— Load MOF
7 | 03/04/1B15:48 | LTA SEARCH Load POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

m|5m||-ﬂﬂr|

There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HG)

Show Remarks To: || Handling Insurer
Heim Earmerhs S Drivels of e you ihoe © i other parties
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYDR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I‘P‘nhlnli No: 5JV2490X (Insd veh) Model: HYUNDAI TUCSON 2.0 (A)
SJH4288A (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |16/01/2018
Global Sum Settlement | | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate -1 2,594.00
Final Repair Cost -1 1,300.00
Loss of Use ' 5 160.00 2.00 days at 380.00 per day
Rental (it any) -1 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee '3 745
Others: - 0.00
' 8§
Final Setllement Sum -1 1467 45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate
low)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
- - BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability; (%) Assessed Liability (7): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be fitled only for chain collistons and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} |Jhauto Trading 5 1,467 45
2) '5
3) g
03 Apr
JOANME LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
[Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice: Release Voucher: Authorisation to Act: Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docltr... 3/4/2018
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1ssesrissr;
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@Ikkauto. com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCB/AIG18002388/UMB30Q2

Date:; 04/04/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  Policy No: 2100186327
N ant Vehicle < tu2s8a Insured Vehicle No :  SJV2480X
Date of Loss: 16/01/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 5730442106506
ESCRIPTI
Reg No SJH4288A
Make & Model: HYUMNDAI TUCSON, 2.0 {A) Engine No: G4GCaZ48501
Reg. Date: 07/0872008 (Man. Year 2008) Chassis No: KMHJNB1BROUS45322
Colour Black Odometer: 142855 km
Engine Capacity: 1876 ¢cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/New Car Price
General Condition Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Candition
Front Tyre Size: 215/85R16 Rear Tyre Size; 215/85R18
Froni Left Side: RADAR 6 mm Rear Left Side: RADAR & mm
Front Right Side: RADAR & mm Rear Right Side: RADAR & mm
Tha above valles represent the remaining lyre ireads death
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2,024.00 1,136.80 BBT.20 4383
Miscellaneous ltams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 570.00 £00.00 70.00 12.28
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 2,594.00 1,636.80 957.20 38.90
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,300.00
Nett Amount (S5} 2,594.00 1,300.00 1,204.00 49.88
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x S$80.00/day) (S$) 160.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S$) 7.45
Nett Liability (S$) 1,467.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 05/02/2018
Date Inspected: 05/0272018 Inspected At Jhauto Trading
14 DEFU LANE 10 #01-388, DEFU
INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
Singapore 539185
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen p... 4/4/2018
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Lim Chin Siong Bevan

NOTE: This repart represents our findings al the time snd plece of inspection staled hersein Such inspaction has been camed out o the best of our
kncwiadge and ability bul lnyﬂh%uﬂ:wmrmmwuhmfwm
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Oty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 “REAR BUMPER (WHOLE) Dented / Deformed BI4BOF *821.10FL
2 1 ‘REAR INNER BUMPER PANEL Repair 588.00F *FL
3 2 *BUMPER RETAINER MNecessary 181.80F “181.90FL
4 1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Sharted 251.50FS *200.00FS
5 1 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Cracked 168.00F *1688.00 FL
F=Fra parl 5=Spchett L=ListhamDisc
Sub Total (S§)  2,024.00 1,371.00
- List ltem Discount on L tems 0.00/20.00% (5%) 0.00 23420
Total Parts (S55) 2,024,00 1.136.80
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen _p... 4/4/2018
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selecied.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR FOR ABOVE New 220,00 200.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING FOR ACCIDENT AREA New 350,00 300.00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 570.00 500.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. _|

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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