Vic (LKKAuto)

I—R R

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October, 2019 12:08 PM

To: Vic [(LKKAuUto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Qur Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020371  Accident involving

SGX8598E & 5JD5152Y along Yishun Ave 1 towards Seletar on 3/2/18 - LKK REF
CC4/LPC1E002396/Aha3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ex1.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

|“ The all 0% lonpac.com.sg
= i

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authonised external parties only,

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@ lkkauto.com|

Sent: Thursday. 24 October, 2019 1:50 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371 Accident involving SGXBS9SE &
SJDS152Y along Yishun Ave | towards Seletar on 3/2/18 - LKK REF CC4/LPCI8002396/Aha3

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18002396/Aha3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 5GX 8598F (0|) AND 5JD 5152Y (TP) ON 03/02/2018

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 5" February 2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct
Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that Insured vehicle had rear-ended the TP vehicle.

As such. under MCF and BOLA scenario 27, for rear-ended collision, we have to settle the claim from the front
vehicle.

We propose to offer ta TP repairer "PRECISE AUTO SERVICE" as below:



TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 340217 $ 1,284.00
Loss of Rental (5180 x 5 days) S 540,00 5 400,00 (5100 x 4 days)
Loss of Use [$100 x 2 days) S 200.00 S —
LTA & GIA Search Fee (S8 + 529) S 37.00 s 37.00
TOTAL | 4,179.17 5 1,721.00
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Our surveyor’s recommended days to repair 2 days
Weekends / Downtime 2 days
TOTAL 4 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@1kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

SS22T SET Suve the Earthe Print only when necessory-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient.
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe
that vou received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the
e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 October, 2019 3:19 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); MT _Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371 Accident involving SGX8598E & SID5152Y along Yishun
Ave | towards Seletar on 3/2/18

Dear Sirs,
We attach herewith our PA and marked esumate for your records.
We will be requesting for mandate shortly,

Thank you.



Hest Hegards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2006 | emall: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408q9373)

FRARS T .
SeSmES = Bsve the Forth- Frinté only when necessary”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient,
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe
that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the
e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
muail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com|
Sent: Wednesday, 14 February, 2018 11:49 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan(@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim(@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371 Accident involving SGX8598E & SID5152Y along Yishun
Ave | towards Seletar on 3/2/18

Hi Metr Kwan,

Attached insured’s GIA report for your necessary action.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 1995355
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ex1.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mer Kwan (LKKAuto) [ mallto:Melkwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 14 February, 2018 11:40 AM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Ce: MT _Claim_SG; ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto);
Admm A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371 Accident involving SGX8S9RE & SIDS152Y along Yishun
Ave | towards Seletar on 3/2/18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Refl 11818/ VPOS/020371
LLKK Ref : CC4/LPCIB0O02396/Aeal
Dear Sir /Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



Please be informed that we had survey TP vehicle on 09.02.2018 and the estimated cost of repair is not
ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge 18 Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 February, 2018 4:37 PM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo(@lonpac.com™>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>

Ce: ' MT_Claim_SG'<mt_claim@lo .com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371 Accident involving SGX8598E & SIDS152Y along Yishun
Ave | towards Seletar on 3/2/18

Dear Eric,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LLKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@®|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwool@lonpac.com]
Sent: Monday, 5 February, 2018 2:55 PM

To: assignments@/lkkauto.com

Ce: MT _Claim_SG < im@lonpac.com=

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020371 Accident involving SGX8398E & SID5152Y along Yishun Ave
| towards Seletar on 3/2/18

Dear Catherine,

Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SJD S152Y on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to recerving your report soon.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



Asher Sna SLKKAutnz

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 &:41 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOVLING VEHICLE NO. SID 5152Y AND SGX 8538E ON 02 FEB 2018
Attachments: 20122018183721 pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Without Prejudice

Your Ref, . CC4/DAI1B0D3542/Apa3
Vehicle No. : GBB 9791G/T/18

M/s LONPAC Insurance Bhd
100 Beach Road

#19-00 Shaw Tower
Singapore 189702

Dear Ms. Asher

We are the repairer for vehicle no. SJD 5152Y and instructed by the owner, Precise Car Rental, on his behalf to submit
the claims against your insured’s vehicle no. SGX 8598E that was Invalved In the above mentioned accident.

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence. In order to save the legal cost, we will process the claim to
you directly as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (Survey By Mr, Adrian) $ 1,284.00 |(Including GST)
2. Loss Of Use (2 days X $100.00) b 200.00
3. Car Rental (5 days X $180.00) g 540.00
4, LTA / GlA Search £ 37.00
Total : $ 2061.00

Please let us have your payment in our favour of "Pracise Auto Service".
Your prompt reply of the above claims will be much appreciated

Thank You

Best Regards
Yan Hang

T:67457367 | F: 6841 33090

E : suppontSprecissauto sq

W: www preciseauto.sg

A : No.l Kakl Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kakl Bukit, Singapore 417883
1



TO: PRECISE AUTO SERVICE
NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 8
#02-34/38
SINGAPORE 417883

LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO. =00 S1S2 Y AND Sax 956

We, Precise Gov Renta| NRIC No, § 35 444055
owner of vehicle no. <30 Siyvz2 Y , hereby authorise M/S PRECISE AUTO
SERVICE to commence repairs to my miotor vehicle and to forward the claim for damages
sustained in the above accident to the third party driver and/or his employer and/or the
vehicle owner and/or the insurer concerned. |/We agree that in consideration of you giving
up your repairer’s lien | agree to assign the whole proceeds of my/our third party claim to
you and if applicable, our solicitors (to be appointed by you on mylour behalf) shall accept
this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay the amount compensated direct to you after
deduction of their costs on a Solicitor & Client basis. |/We undertake to co-operate fully
with you and our solicitors to see the claim to a successful conclusion. In the event the
proceeds of claim for damages, interest, costs and expenses including legal costs are paid

to me directly by the third party insurer, | undertake to indemnify and/or reimburse the said
proceeds of claim to you.

If the third party driver and/or his employer andlor the vehicle owner andlor the
insurer reject liability, | will be fully responsible for the repair costs.

I/We also autherise you to sign all discharge vouchersfindemnity forms and all
necessary papers in connection with the above claim in my/our absence.

|/We authorise you to appoint such a firm of solicitors on my/our behalf as you shall
deem fit for the purpose of the third party/own insurers’ claim.

I'We undertake to inform you andlor the solicitors appointed by you on
my/our behalf in the event the third party’s insurance company communicates with
me/us directly by telephone or in writing and l/we further undertake not to enter into
any compromise Settlement Agreement with the third party insurance without your

consent as | understand that this may jeopardise a fair recovery of the third party
claim.

My vehicle Is repaired by the repairer on my own free will without any inducement,
thraat and/or promise

In the event of any breach of my undertaking and the repairer |5 compelled to

enforce this undertaking, | agree that | shall pay for the legal costs incurred by the repairer
on a sclicitor afd client's full indemnity basis.

! | ':{,;3\

Owner Signature
(Company Stamp, if Applicable)



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 17/18/18/VP0O5/020371

DATE : 30 OCTOBER 2019
DISCHARGE VOUCHER
I/'We. PRECISE_CAR_RENTAL confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC

INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SGX 8598E the sum of Singapore Dollars
One Thousand Seven Hundred Twenty One Only (51.721.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liguidation and discharge of property claim competent to mefus upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
mefus whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or
indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SJD 5152Y on 03 FEBRUARY 2018

along YISHUN AVENUE | TOWRDS SELETAR.

I /We hereby agree 1o indemnily and keep indemnify (FONG HOO YIN / LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever  made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

IVWe further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
PRECISE AUTO SERVICE.

/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

\Ws
Signature of vehicle owner/Date M1' '-l"*'l , H
This Discharge Voucher applies only lo the claimant's ¢/
for property damage and will not affect the personal
PRECASE ok WVYL injunes clum and/or uninsured losses claim on a later da°
Name of vehicle owner/Date 79! u\\ﬂ Further, the settisment terms hernin shall nol be used 3«

#vidance o prqudi:;e the claimant’s personal injuries cla
and/ot other uninsured losses claim ansing out of the
subyoc! matter in (s achon.



PRECISE AUTO SERVICE
NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-33/34/36 AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 417883
TEL : 67457367 FAX : 68413390
CO. REG. NO, : 35766600C  GST REG. NO. : 35766600C

Accident Date : 03-02-18

PRECISE CAR RENTAL
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 Invaice No: TP1811-013
#02-33
SINGAPORE 417883 DATE :30-11-1B
L A EEE
VEHICLE MODEL : HONDA CIVIC
LUMP SUM REPAIR

INCLUDING SUPPLY OF PARTS & LABOUR

PANEL BEATING & SPRAY PAINTING 1,200.00
SUB-TOTAL : 1,200.00

ADD GST 7% 84.00

TOTAL AMOUNT SGD 1,284.00

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,



Precise Car Rental

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-34 Autobay(@ KakiBukit DATE: February 12, 2018
Singapore 417883 INVOICE # R-0226
Phone 67457367 Fax 68413390 FOR: Accident Car
Replacement
Vehicle # SLP 2820 K
Bill To:
PRECISE AUTO SERVICE

CO : Mohamed Syaflg Bin Mohamed
Block 345 Tampines Street . 33 #03-350
Singapore 520345

DESCRIPTION NUMBER OF DAYS| RATE AMOUNT

Rental from 09/02/2018 at 12.45pm to 12/03/2018 3| $180 5540
at 12.40pm
YOUR REF: 5JD 5152Y

TOTAL | § 540.00

Make all cheques payanl?_m Precise gdrrﬂﬂul

( | L~
L7

|
i

Signature of Owner



- 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-34 Autobay @ Kakibukit S(417883)
Tel: 6745 7367 Fax: 6841 3390
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FRECISE CAR RENTAL

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

s 1 o 00 MIOHAMED SYAFIG BIN MOHAMED

MRIC/Passpait Nd SRR50121F iﬁ“ﬂﬁ‘m. lll'lllq%%

Admeas E'It 3”'}5 1““?\”55‘ ST.33 Age
#03- 33’3 - s 520345 |

Marar & Achtross 0f Empamnys

: L e Dawmng Eap
Dreewg Lice=ce Mo Pessad Dats
DL Tyow. Locatin Vhers
" (1a1] HA

Maarma a8 n W)

NRICYrasport My Chade exl Sirim

DRIVER'S PARTICULARS

Hirer's Cwn Vehicle No: 530 5’51"‘{ ﬂummrir
Loan Vetedle Ho: S 2dlsk_

!uaul-MWm- S .

CHARGES

- PRECISE CAR RENTAL

rRANo: R- 0226

T _Ph!'uu; by

VA No

1 dmy es180|-  redw | $OMOJF

Par wisek Aornthly

Dihars )
COWPAI w$ Per dayiNonihy
Iﬂﬂm‘ﬂﬁmﬂﬂ Svt
G57
OR No (A) BUB-TOTAL I
- er F s | Ll ) L] 13
w'r:rl'u- N ‘
[| First _. ki FREE par day GST
™ il g TOTAL CHARGES | $ 54O t- )

Secunty Deposil - §

Bank

CASHNETSVIBAMCAMEXTCHO No:

IMPOHTANT

Thai Hiwr gl e e g i rrieid lom e 2 puasi s o age el obehei £

el npumesburd drrorg maperercy Feigre o ohsare s
N g comts ko b B ¢ e it Avribuerined Cnvewt
Al solicies Bfe sceppibin et petrid wiel elaull rokureemd el paiegl et il = e
A perwes charge of 33 o bap of 8 pedngl waituerge B paysias by Te e S
tad o roae the eetechl 3f T Aggrerariate patrol i

whie Bppaciilie iy el ifer D opeealien Pours well by Sueged ga 8 b
Ty Tl
i L of T vencis ior fmgie purpond [T or dimndl if oD &l el S
pestdling e wafi Wi et ettty girniibibed i
Wetuoii sirictly b Srgepors wse ooty s ey ot be doves oul of S
O W wrd of "-r. e Tar Reria Tha hew @ |
fe== o §300 i iVl i TP NFICAIESE FTIEEOCE E U D e Can

Expiry Date Card O Mo

Hame as in Card

NON WAINVER EXCESS Syt iy (3

STIS 3, m':l\'..:

ACCESSORIES CHECK
il L STD Took ) Hub Cap J Radie | CO Cartridge
LJeck O TyeOpomer ) PutolCap 1] Spare Tyre

Hirer's Signature

SINGAPORE Usa

md!ﬂ ﬂ‘l-u chargafcredd card vouche: All information | have been given

Additional Drvers Signature

read and agred o the terms ang condibon an both sdes of this sgresmsnt IHMMMDMWumhwl | sgren that al] amounts
under this agreement and lor parking and iraffic infringements may be billed to that acoount and my signature above will be consdired 10 hive been
Precias Car Rental i connéction with this agreemaent is frue

piary avsd b Mosleg vialsl S lowrees @ Pare® B ey : gt

I M phmid o @arty Tuhen of seticcie The hres shad e batde oo aodbanal [ar I
e @y G redirm il e retl shoen per o pie diky. Pchusss of CTRY aector P

gl ooy oy i BUll ety Damcn ) ePusd

sslered o eoumRd By 7o N rEEpecy

vwincir Ful weceys mrmom| bapen i Gan p

The v teserse B my
wesartee] Ang demags b

LT BT e

il Niewasewer L Degt

FToLE o pesl SrEhg 80 Faemige of pes e safuiie aep ot ol

E D ST 8 CEFEDS DTN O pwel s BT
T e=3! =f hatraiery] Py i Eamel] Cn pal's R Debeean 200 - B4

Tt Hirwr sgreea thad & puschuomd e, smpty petol e loss of veisoe

i) byl Fusde o ealacy, By bl Bose ol
i i Pwl? e ol & S -Hoads Erergensy Se
ST BOCWITNCE. M e vnall i

wpert Tl De remde sltvies 2d bpurs. Failure o comply, S bivgd el heee b Baiine
Ml sty Yoo ol parlens Dlern Fob sscrs @5

T wowd Of mr msodeet

F e cad e Meanrd and o Aol e et e oS

i oF e okl OF 1P (0 e 2 ol B
[ FrEEEy e wvert of & |
¥ &1 repissarsenl vebice f a1 aces
vowl il fep tepuie B Ouil @uthorised sersbap

el Ay

e Tyl el cre adwald P

}
i iy i

soliite 8 Dresbolown o that
oo s Caled pon o respond 1

el of such Peaponas B B50 00 per irip
r cawe of pezicend, i Paree ghall repart b rencs offion immedansly Ao

B udonl

s Py &3 be paee) avemadigiely

dity L wrsaarm st B 1 ety watie =y
S el ) o =i g ew
Mol water Ay darage 8 e ergre Wil Be Bar Ty e Rewirhee

F] Af ooy date will b eyt gincty confsienfia’ s = solsly gee] B e

& mhe ot pelEing mustiecs

herpar] ey e ) P D gt Rdka OO o glatechai

al resh-gracieen of Lo s wlmn 1 The furer D 30 Faws (e reapaneibs
€ Tha hirer drelie Otietr hull e re sprreles by Al Qe rwhey |t e
cmgnred Al b afle erolatoes D Wd e mtey et e 1P baee Ny
SRl PEACT i repaat of G0 N CONPECToeT it T o e ope i
T rurer praoe grver Bl Do fedponmililes fir o e denages loasss il | s ol rerrpiuting) T sales jraltarTes
W] e TR POreeeT DETES Beg Sl BaDenan |ncradvig [ %]
Diate Ol _ Thmie Oul Milsage Chack By Rmrmarks

'T‘“"ﬂc? |3 :4g
Fuu.n- Of Wmbachs The Hret In Hinquired To Sign

‘?j‘i

%1

Feier u itk SiRanee

Datetn |  Tewmin | Mieage St o)

Aamarks

r;[_,ﬂ_,_f 1J S il _J_JQL“-J fyint

In The Colunn “Sgrature OF Hirer Drivor Faling Wiich Tha Day And Tine insared Below Shall Be Dosmed 1o Be The
Chary And Time The Vehicle s Retumed To Precise Car Rental And The S Shall Be Accepied As Conclusive Evidencs OF Tha Sam And Skall Not Be Challenged Or
Ouestorad On Any Account Whatsoeves And | had cleared 7y belonging iterm from tha rerdal whicle (cashcard, parking coupons. eic|”

o

o

rurmr wThover Sagrusine

£ +

3




- .5F . & 4

Invaice hitps:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTR....

ENERAL GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

i RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE & rofnes auoy #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030

: Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M40C017735

SEARCH RESULTS

Our Ref Ne: GR-18-018107
Date of Request: 0S/02/2018 Your Ref No: PRECISE

RiAZ LLC

133 New Bridge Road #08-09
Chinatown Point

Singapare 058413

Dear SirMadam,

. Your Search Critoria;
Dale of Accident: 030272018
Place of Accident; YISHLUN AVE 1
Cliant Vehicle No: SJD5182Y

With reference to your search criteria far the accident report, the fallowing documents were found lo closely maleh your

search criteria:

REQ. VEHICLE ACCIDENT LOCATION ACCIDENT DATE
SGX8598E ALONG YISHUN DAM - ROAD SHOULDER 0022018 22:00
Thank You,

The images provided lo you ate taken from the onginal reports forwarded to the canire by the mombers of tha Ganeral Insurance
Assoclation of Singapore and wa lake no responcibliity far their sceuracy of contenis and shall be undar no liability whatsoover Tor any loos

or damage arieing out of er In connection with the reponts or thelr Images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

10f2 221372018, 12:24 PM
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hips://sinpapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTR...

= EHERAL GENERAL INSURANGE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
y INSURANCE & Raffles Quay #18.00, Singapare 048580

ASSOCIATION Phone: +85 8224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE O8sr R o o ot rras o 1o P

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-019107
Date of Requesi: 05/2/2018 Your Ref Nao: PRECISE
RIAZ LLC
133 New Bridge Road #05-08
Chinatown Paint
Singapore 055413
Dear SirMadam,
Your h Cr n:
Dale of Accidenl: 03/02/2018
Place of Accidant: YISHUN AVE 1
Clienl Vehicle Ne: SJDE152Y
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)
E-File Search Fee (Public) 14.02
GET Amounl 0.98
Total Amount Dug (GST Inclusive) 15,00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Date;
[X] GIRO [] Cash [] Cheque

2211272018, 12:24 PM
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Invoice . ' hitps://smgapore. menmen,comfclaimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=MTR...

T ENERAL GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singopore 048580
ASSOCLATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Q23R 1 Hours: londoy 1o Fridey Bam (o Spm

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-1B-021968
Date of Request: 08/02/2018 Your Ref No: PRECISE

RIAZ LLC

133 New Bridge Rood #09-00
Chinatown Feinl

Singapore 058413

Daar Sir/adam,

Date of Accldent; D3/022018
Vehicle No: SJD51562Y
Place of Accident: ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 TWDS SELETAR,
Involving Vehicle No: SGXBSSBE

With reference lo your application for the accidant report, we have aftached the following accident reports as requesied:

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S5) a7y |AMOUNT (S5)

SGXBS98E ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 TWDS SELETAR. 14.00)1 13.08
GST Amoun! 0.82
Tatal Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14.00

The Images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Asssciation of Singapare and we take no respoenaibility for their accuracy or contents and shall ba undar no liability
whalsoever for any loss or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.

This is a computer generaled documen! and requires no signature,

For GIARMEC Official usa:
Date:
[%] GIRG ] Cash | ) Chegue

1of | 22M12/2018. 12:24 PM
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Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No, SGX8598E As At 03 Feb 2018/ 12:28:00)

L—awFirm Search Details

Seurch Reason: {nsurance claim in relation to traffic accident
L-=wFirm Case No. PRECISE (V)

Current Owner Details

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC

Cwner |D: S8079067H

ey Mame: FONG HOO YIN

Repimered Address Type: HDB/HUDC

Refistered Block/House

i S91A

Refstered Stroot Name:  CHOA CHU HANG CRESCENT
Regstered Unit Mo B20-42

Regmtered Buillding Mame: -

Regitered Postal Code: 4815691

Current Vehicle Details

‘ehlcle Mo SGXBSTEE
rake Description/Model: MAZDA f MAZDAIJ 5-DOOR HATCHBACK 15L SPAEAT
| rsirance Compary Name: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
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