Vic ‘I.I{I{Autnz

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May, 2019 504 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Admin A

Cc Elaine Cheong; Alfred Teh: Chee So Chow; Hslao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau; Vic
(LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBZ128E (O
SNM1BD00739C02/8) AND SFG2205E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI1B0023B5/Uha3) on
05/02/2018

Dear Alfred,

We refer to the below email.
Please be Informed that we had settled the matter with TP at a global sum of $3,670.00 (all in).
We will forward all relevant documents to your good office in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

o
LKK - Save the Farth Print enly when necessery:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intendad recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintendad recipient is prohibited. and may be a violation of law. If you believe thal you received this e-mail in emor, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delate the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereaf, and infarm the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachmenis and any copies thereol. Thank you

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 24 December, 2018 9:54 AM

To: Vic (LKKAute); Admin A

Ce: Elaine Cheong; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBZ128E (Ol: SNM18D00739C02/8) AND
SFG2205E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118002385/Uha3) on 05/02/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI118002385/Uha3
CTi REF - SNM1BD00739C02/8 (SBZ128E)

Dear Vic
We refer to your email of 22 December 2018 pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to negotiate offer as follow:



Vic SI.I{KAutn!

From: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Sent: Monday, 24 December, 2018 9:54 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto); Admin A

Cc Elaine Cheang; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau
Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBZ128E (Ol

SNM18D00739C02/8) AND SFG2205E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002385/Uha3) on

05/02/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CT118002385/Uha3
CTI REF - SNM18D00739C02/8 (SBZ128E)

Dear Vic

We refer to your emall of 22 December 2018 pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to negotiate offer as follow:

Cost of Repairs

Loss of Use (@ $120.00 to $150,00/day x 3 days)
GlA Search fee

Total

We awalt your advice to enable Elaine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

$3,317.00
$ 360.00 & up to $450.00

s 200
$3,679.00

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +85 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 T4T78B/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer ;

This message is confidential: its cortents do not constitute a commitment by China Talping Inxurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd Any unauthorized
disclosure, wre or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. [f you are not the intended recipient of the message,

please notify the sender immediarely.



From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Saturday, December 22, 2018 2:43 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBZ128E (O1: SNM18D00739C02/8) AND
SFG2205E |TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI18002385/Uha3) on 05/02/2018

CTI REF - SNM18D00739C02
LKK REF — CC6/CT118002385/Uha3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SBZ 128E (Ol) / SFG 2205E (TP) / OTHERS ON 05/02/2018

We refer to the subject matter.

This is a chain collision where a Foreign registered vehicles were also involved in this accident. It was reported that
the Insured vehicle had collided 1o a motorcycle IPY 580 (Foreign) then the sais motorcycle collided to another

motorcycle PNB 7826 (Foreign) which caused it to side swipe the stationary TP vehicle at the junction,

We had spoken to the Insured Driver Mr Sean where he confirmed accident and was informed of the TP claim and
liability issues on 09/03/2018 and agreed to settle the matter. A letter was sent out to the Insured to informed about

the TP claim and liability. No feedback from Insured till date.

PIR is against Insured Driver for an offence of Careless Driving and action will be taken against him.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour as he is the cause of the accident

and BOLA does not apply due to foreign registered vehicles being involved.

Summary to offer to repairer FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD is as follows:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) $12,807.90 $ 3,317.00
Loss of Use (S180 x 3 days) S 540,00 S 540.00
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL | $13,349.90 '§ 3,859.00
TP VEHICLE

Market Value : $51,000.00 (est)
LTA Rebate  :$46,600.00 (est)
Nett Value :$ 4,400.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days

4 days

CLAIMED

3 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval and/or further instructions please,

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6841-2066 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408533)

=TT Sove the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-maill contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distnbution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe thal you received this e-mail in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and Inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mall, all atachments and any copies thereol. Thank you

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 March, 2018 12:17 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Joel Goh; Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Lucas Lee; Sharon Han; Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SBZ128E (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SFG2205E (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18002385/Uks3) on 05/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SFG2Z205E at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

We will revert preliminary advice in due course.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action,
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best flegards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: ShirleyH iew@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Drate : 03.05:2018

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SFG 2205E /| SBZ 128E ON  05.02.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SFG 2205E | which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SBZ 128E The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of vour insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

I} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) .3 1,317.00

2) Rental 5 540.00

3)  GIA Search Result $ 2.00
3 3,859.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice ¢) Vehicle Registration Log Card

b) I/C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

c) GIA Report/ GIA Search Result g) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

d) Insurance Certificate h) Palice Report

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
ns soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant,

Thank vou.
Yours faithfully,

e I e
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Our Ref: COWCTIIROD2ZIRS/L ka3

03 APRIL 2018

SEAH KIAT SENG

o LEWIS ROAD

SINCATOILE 258601

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBZ 128F / SFG 2205E / OTHERS ON 05/02.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Ple Ltd to resolve the ¢laim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or vour authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred. we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement

with third party claimant

Should vou however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us it vou have further queries,

mwnhmny.

16841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Zainic@Ikkauto.com

ce. China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pre Lid
{Motor Claims Depi)



DATE : ot 42 A

TO H China Taiping Insurance Sinaancre Ple Lid
RE ¢ ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SFG 2205 ang
887 128E ONLY

ALONG JUNCTION OF MIDOLE ROAD TOWADS VICTORIA ST

ON iS-FJ‘-)ﬂJ"

'We, ONG PAL CHOY
of (NRIC No./ROC No.) $1295703C

of BLK 837 VEERASAMY ROAD #11-111 5-200637

owner of vehicle no. SFG 22058 in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle  src 22056 at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
ete. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/'We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned ¢laim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner @u"“

ONG PAU Loy

Name of Owner
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MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Policy No ¢ DMPCSNG006361708 Cluir Mo ; SNMIENOOT7ISCL2/E (SRE1ZEE)
Claimant : ONG PAU CHOY
Amournt + B43,670.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED SEVENTY OHLY

1/He agree ta acoept the above mentionsd amount to be pald to medus in Tull &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disburaementas for injuries [/ damages
sustained by mefus through sn acoident inwolving

Claimant Vehicla No. i SFQ I205K
Inaured Vehicle No. : ZHI 128E

Pate of Loss + 05.0Z.2018
Place of Accident t MIDDLE ROAD TOWARDS SELEGIE ACGAD

I¥ CONSIDEFATIUN of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTO0., [/We agres absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE |[SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. anmd/or

Insured MName
Driver Nams

; SEAH KIRT SENG

¢ SEAH KIAT SENG

from all claima, present or future in respect of all lecszs; Injury or damage
sustalned by mefus arising cut of the said sccident.

] acknowliedge that thia payment 13 made without admission of liapilicy on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (STNGAPORE]) PTE., LID.

(1) Global Som {all ind 55 3,670.00

TOTAL . o o o o0 8 o oo v eomomn on e W 3,670.00

L eSS S =~ — o —— = = 1

Claimant Mare: _Q% ?Bﬂ L_‘\l& NEIT No &liﬂ‘.‘: pl-F 74

Stgnature : @,\% pate . 05.2.2019




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

TAX INVOICE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #0148 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Ple Lid

Tax Invoice 20248

3 Anson Road Diate :03.05.2018
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Vehicle No  :SFG 2205E
Singapore 079909 Make/Model TOYOTA CAMRY
Chassis/Eng# -
Accident Date :05,02.2018
Claim No (0418- 20248
Attn: Motor Clmims Department Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S5 3,100.00
E&O.E Total : S$ 3,100.00
GST @ 7™ :_S% 217.00
Amount Due - 8§ IIT00

FASTECH AUTOPTE L
All Invoices are subjec

to GST

Frmeval B4 Bt il i Pl g



Dynamic Car

Rental

I KAKI BURIT AVENUE 6, #01-4548/50 AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 477883,

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786

Co. Reg No. 52528467K

No.20529
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DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No:67458520

Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To. ONG PAU CHOY Invoice DCR-2018-04-07
Date 20.04.2018
Agreement No - 20528
Refl LOD
. DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SJRT314K { 0418-20248 ) 5 540.00
Rental Period from  17.04 2018 to 20.04 2018
E. & O.E. Total § 540.00
Hagly Lue Pok Ling

for Dynamic Car Rental
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

l 8 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax. +585 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam lo Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE G Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No: GR-18-020266

Date of Request: 08/022018 Your Ref No: Onlina Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenues G #01-48

AuloBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Daar SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 06/022018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. SBZ128E

Accident Dale 05022018

Enquiry Result

TP Véhicle No InsiLirer Peariod ol Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SBZ128E China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 01/04/2017-31/03/2018  |6380 8111
Thank You

The images providad 1o you are iaken from the ofiginal reports forwanded to the cantra by the members of the Ganeral Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responaibility for their sccuracy or contants and shall be under no liability whatsoaver for any
Ings or damage arising out of o In connaction with the reparts or their images,

This is & computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 06-Feb-18



lnvoice

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Faux- +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

GST Registration No: MA00D17735

TAX INVOICE
Our Rel No: GR-18-020266
Date of Raquest. 0EM022018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Ple Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date oDeM2/2018
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
TP Vehicle No SBZ128E
Accident Date 05022018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.
This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ]| Cash [ | Chaque
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 06-Feb-18






