Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
“

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 2:28 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc Chong Boon Sen; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta); Chee So Chow; Alfred
Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBBE844U (Ol SNM18D00602C02/4) and

SHBS5377A (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18002371/Smb3) on 31.01.2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118002371/Smb3
CTI REF - SNM18D00609C02/4 (GBB8844U)

Dear Bevan
We are in receipt of your email and contents duly noted.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +6563896183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh{@sq.cntaiping.com

www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNVERSARY
In Singapere sinee 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. excepi
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, June 01, 2018 2:19 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong @sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Chee 50 Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

1



Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8344U (Ol SNM18D00609C02/4) and SHB5377A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18002371/Smb3) on 31.01.2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118002371/Smb3
CTI REF — SNM18D00609C02/4 (GBB8844U)

Dear Sir/Madam,

we refer 1o your email below.

We have settle with TP atm instead of $8,959.58.

The break down should be as follows:

REVISED - TO OFFER

Cost of Repair (w/gst)

Loss of Rental (5116.63 x 9 days) 5 T,ID49.E?
Loss of Income (550 x 9 days) S 450.00
LTA Search Fee 5 7.00

TOTAL 5875958

We have offer to TP and now pending for their DV .

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanlLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408933)
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From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 10:53 AM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau
<kklau@|kkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivial lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>;
Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB&844U (0l: SNM18D00609C02/4) and SHB5377A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18002371/Syb3) on 31.01.2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI18002371/Syb3
€Tl REF - SNM18D00609C02/4 (GBB8344U)



Dear Bevan

We refer to your email of 24 May 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $8,953.58.
\We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

1 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID; +656389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: clai ti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sq.cntaiping.com

ANMNINVERSARY
In Simgupere sinee 1958

Disclatmer !

T'his message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ikkauto.com]
Sent; Thursday, May 24, 2018 11:50 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.coms; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBBE844U (Ol SNM180D00609C02/4) and SHB5377A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18002371/5yb3) on 31.01.2018

Importance: High

CT! REF - SNM18D00609C02
LKK REF - CC3/CTI18002371/5Smb3s2

Dear Irene,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBB 8844U (Ol) AND SHB 5377A (TP) ON 31/01/2018



We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that the Insured vehicle Rear-ended Third Party Vehicle.

We had spoken to the Insured Driver Mr Santhigu Johnson and was informed of the TP claim and liability issues on
18/04/2018. A letter was sent out to the Insured to informed about the TP claim and liability. No feedback from 0I/0ID
till date.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

summary to offer to repairer SMRT_AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 13,387.90 s 7,452.91
Loss of Rental (5116.63 x 10 days) S  1,166.30 5 1,049.67 (5116.63 x 9
days)
Loss of Income (560 x 10 days) 5 600.00 S 450.00 (550 x 9 days)
LTA Search Fee S 7.00 5 7.00
TOTAL $15,161.20 [ 8,959.58

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 6 days + 1 Sunday + Inspection (1 day)+
DOA (1 day)
TO OFFER 9 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee @sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 3:41 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com=
Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8844U (01 : CAl - SNM18D00609C02) and SHB5377A (TP : LKK

REF - CC3/CTI118002371/Syb3) on 31.01.2018

Dear Shu Pei,



Kindly refer to the above attachment.
Case Handler: Chong Boon Sen

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3, Anson Road, #16-0@

springleaf Tower,

Cingapore 879939

Co. Reg. No. 200288384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdeptfisg.cntaiping.com
Email: lucas.leef@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February, 2018 7:36 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Chong Boon Sen; Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8844U {O1: CAl - TBA) and SHB5377A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118002371/5yb3) on 31.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHB 5377A at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte
Ltd - Woodlands.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report
TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jas and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: E741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
&0 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapare 757705

Tel : 65 686G 2647

Fax : 65 G368 7421

www,smri.com.sg
China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
clo LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date: 12" March 2018
Mo. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park Our Ref.: TAX/I01/18/2184/LG

Singapore 408933
Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT ON 31/01/2018 INVOLVING SHB 5377A & GBB 8844U
ALONG BENOI RD TOWARDS PIONEER RD

LETTER OF CLAIM

\We claim on behalf of SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd, the owner and the hirer of taxi no.; SHB 5377A. Your
insured's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, our clients have suffered
the following losses:-

Cost of Repair : ‘;h, )-5:1 9 l

1.
2. Loss of Rental for _& days @ S% 116 - I53 fday : ﬁ_lé_i’h_zi
3. Loss of Income for _U__days @ S$ po.00 jday 3 € g0-0v
4. Police Report/ SAS Report/ LTA Search Fee : £ :? . J9
5. Survey Fee : -

Total Claims £ 40O Yo-a |

We enclose the following documents:

Letter of Authorisation
LTA Search result
Others

Repair Invoice
Survey Report
Photographs pcs

- IR

Investigation results wehicle laid-up report

OO0

Proof of Loss of Use/Rental/lncome

2,
[7] Police / SAS report of Qe 53H3A 3.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this
letter. Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

Yours sincerely,
MRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

')g;‘_.
Tan Lee Gek
For Manager, Claims
Claims Departrment
DID: 6866 2647
Email: leegek@smrt.com.sg

FR-AS-CL.M-02 REV 2



Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April 2018 5:04 PM

To: Alex@ebenezer.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Your Ref GBB 8844U Our Ref: CC3/CTI18002371/Smb3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB

88441) AND SHB 5377A ON 31/01/2018

Your Ref: GBE 8844LU
Our Ref: CC3/CTI18002371/5mb3

18 APRIL 2018

EBENEZER NDT SERVICES PTE LTD
33 KIAN TECK WAY

SINGAPORE 628746

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 8844U AND SHBE 5377A ON 31/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I, SMRT TAXIS PTE_LTD (the third party claimant™) of _BLK 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (S) 757705 (address), owner of SHB 5377A (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHB
5377A that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 31/01/2018 (date) along
BENOI RD TOWARS PIONEER RD (location) involving vehicle no/s GBB 8844U (“the

accident™).

[ further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit

and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehiclels is concerned.

Dated this Iﬂ’ (day) of :'ﬂ NAY) (month) EDJi (year)

A

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



& SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

Date: 3111|15I3

Our Ref. No.:

| etter of Authorisation

| fichammed Flﬁ.u 2 Sallbee n (NRIC No.. 21544488 [F ) the
reglstered hirer / rehef driver / contract hirer of SMRT taxi registration number

cHR 53T\ ereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi

and 61 %E‘n — 9&” Y happened on | lJﬂlS’
= - : Algna
along MWE Towers Tuey Pronet Exd §-4rgirm.

(the “Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or

proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited

to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my
behalf as may be required.

Name mul’iﬂn*]meyfﬁub ............. Signature: ﬁ@b* 3! K f { (&

NRICNo, . S1S444 88 I¢

Tel No. . 961822
Address E’ll l':' %q"é - a““"m ZNT &"‘F.‘?".. C‘; ...............................
7 o3-3%6

......................................................................................

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



Policy Ho ¢ [DMCVSNIDZ6S41700 Claim Mo : SHMLEDOOE09CD2/4
Claimant : SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

Amount ¢ 85E,750.58
DOLLARS EIGHT THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FIFTY NINE AND CENTS
FIFTY EIGHT ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid £e mefus in full &
Final settlement of all claims, costs & dispursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Cclaimant Vehicle Mo, @ SHB 3377A
Insured Yehicle Ho. : GBB BS44U
late of Loss : 31/01/2018
Place of Accident : BENOI ROAD TOWARDS FIOMEER ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementicned sum by
CHINE TAIPING INSURMNCE (SINGAFORE] PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING [NSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Inzured Name : EBEMEZER MDT SERVICES PTE LID
Driver Name : SANTHIAGU JOHHSOHN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all legss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the =said acoident.

| acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 55
(2} Cost of Repair/Exeess 53 T,252.91
{3} Loss of Bee/Rental/Earcning 3 1,499.67
{4) CGIAfPolice Reports/
Investigatian Resulbs/Search Fees 55 7.00
(5) Medical Reports/Expenses 5%
(6} Survey Fees/P.T. Fees 5%
{7} Cost including Disbursement 55
——mmEsEESESSTomESSS
TOTEL & i S o W & @ o s ¥ w8 w0 oe 55 8,759.58
Claimant Name : f“"ﬁ T I HRIC Mo :

-§ JUN 2018

Signature : Date




. SMAT Automative Services Fte Ltd
SmRT 251 Worth Bridge Reoad Singapore 179102

Tal: 6% 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

AUTOMOTIVE a
Tax Invoice
Customer Cede: 3000063 55T EKeg Ho. ;7 ME-8500001-7
CRN 1 1990042802
SMRT TARXIS| PTE LTD Invoice No. : IV1BO0Z00347
Rate : 14.02,2018
Block Unik Vehicle No. @ SHBL3TTA
Your Ref Mo, ¢ TAX/DL/18/2184
Al WOODLAHMDS IMDUSTRIAL PARK E4d our Ref Heo. ¢ 24094394
SINGAPORE: 757705 Terms + 30 Days
Doscription o Oty = Unit Add / (Dizmcount) Amount
- Cost * Amount
FParts
COVER, RR BUMPER AS3Y 1.00 ¢ 423,90 (25.00 } S 105,97 5 LT 92
SEMS0OR REVERSE 1.00 = 18000 .00 5 0.a10 o 180.00
GIARD, RR BUMPER, LOWER 1.00 § 558.30 (2500 ) g 132.57 3 418.72
FILLER; B\ BOMPER ; LR 100 % 115.90 {25.00 ) - £ 849, 92
RETATHNEER, RE BUMPER, LH 1.00 &5 111:50 (25.00 ) g &1.87 = 83.62
FAD, &R BUMPER, RH & LIt . 1 (.00 5 3.80 t£5.00 3 5 a.an 5 .00
PAL, RRE DIMPER, RII & LH , 2 0.00 5 SN (25000) i G0t S 0.00
PAD, R BUMPER, RH & Ll ; 3 b:00 § 3.80 (2500 ) g .o 5 o, 00
SEAL, RR BUMPER ARM, BH & LH 0.00 $§ 11.60 {25 .:00) 3 0.00 5 0. 00
PIXEL STIOZKER 2.0n0 8 R0 .00 0. 00 5 0,00 5 120.00
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1.0 & 318.80 (Z25.00 3 = F T 5 £438010
END PRHEL SUS-ASSY, BOLY: (OWER BLOE L:on 5 B98O 12500 9 ¥ 20745 i 472,50
PATL GATE | PANEL SUB-ASSY, BAUR DGOR 1.00° 5 329,60 {(25.00 ) S Z32.40 = 69720
TATL GATFE BACK DOSE QUTSIOE CARNTSH 1.00° 3 B91.20 {25.00 ) 5 222.80 G GeR., 20
5UB--ARSY
NAME PLATE (HYBRID) , LUhEEAGE 1.00° 8 52.30 (2500 ) £ 13,07 Y 39,22
COMPRATMENT DOOR
FMBLEM SUB-RSSY REAR L.o0 5 46,30 (A5 .01 : g P 7 34.7%
NAME PLATE (BRIUS) , LUGEAGK L0005 52.30 (25.00 ) 5 A3.07 & 3022
COMPRERTHENT DOOR
SMET LOGD 100 & 1.80 0. 00 b a.oo0 b3 /.80
STICKER DECAL &555 8888 1.00 5 21,60 .00 5 Q.00 g 2160
TAIT, GATE| LOWER GLASS SUB-ASSY, 0.00 5 725.90 (25.00 ) 5 G040 s 0.00
BACK DOOR
SEALANT W/SCREEH 0.00 § 37.00 0,00 § 0. 00 5 0.00
TAIL GATE GLASS SUB-AS8Y, DACK DOOR 2,00 51589.70 (#5.00 ) 5 Q.00 5 0.00
SEALRNT W/SCREEN 2,00 %5 “37.00 0.00 5 0.00 > 74.00

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/3 E. & 0O.E



Tal: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

‘ SMET Automotive Sarvices Phe Ltd
stT 251 North Bridge Road Singapore 179102

AUTOMOTIVE .
Tax Invoice

Customer Code: S000063 G8T Beg Ho. + ME-8500001-7

CEM : 1990042805
aMRT TAXIES BTE LTD Invoice Ho. ¢ IV1B0Z00347

Date : 14.02.2018
Block Unit vehicle NMo. : SHBS3TTA

Your Ref Bo. : TAX/01/18/2184
G0 WOODLANMDE INDUSTRIAL PARK 241 Dur Bof Wo. ¢ 24084334
SINCAPORE |757705 Terms : 30 Days
Daszcription i Oty Unit Bdd /] (Discount) Amouant

o= : - - Cost % Amount
TAIL GATE WEATHERSTRIP, BACK DOCR o.ou 5 360.70 E25.00 ) > 0.0 5 0.00
LAMP ASSY, LICENSE PLATE 0.00 $ €3.70 {10.00 ) $ 0.00 3 0.00
NUMRER FLATE 0.00 & 35.00 Q.00 5 0.00 2 0. 00
MUMBER PLATE FRAME 0.00 5 25.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 .00
TARTL CGATE| LOCK RSSY, DACK DOOR .00 & 452.10 (G001 g 0.00 £ G.00
TATL GATE LOCK COVER ;- BACK DODR g.00 & 25.30 (253:00 ) 5 0.ue $ Q.00
TATL GATE STRIKER ASSY, BACK DOOR 000 5 24,90 25.00 ) 4 .00 2 .00
TATLGATE BCGARD ASSY .00 % 251.50 (25 00: ) b 0.00 & 0,00
SPOILER SDB-ASSY, REAR 100 $1322.10 (25.00 } 330, 52 5 951,57
LAME SET, STOP CENTER 0,00 % 186.50 (10.00 ) 5 g.00 b= 0.00
MOOLDING SUB-ASSY, ROOF DRIP SIDE 1.00 & 52.70 (25.00 ) £ 1317 5 39,5872
FIMISH, REAR LH
MOULDING SUB-ASSY, RO TOE 100 5083740 t25.00 0% & 159 .35 £ U R 1t
PANEL SUB-ASSY, FEHDER BERR LR .00 5 224,80 {100.00) & B24.00 i u. oo
LENS & BODY ASSY , RR GBUMPER , LH (.00 5 486,80 (LO.GO0 ) 5 0,00 5 0,00
LENS & BODY, REAR COMBINATION LAMP 1.00 & 438.10 (10,00 ) 5 43.81 5 394 .23
LH
TAIT GATE BACK DOOR HIMGE MSSY, RH 2.00 5 59.10 (25.00 ) g  29.55 5 45,85
& 1:H
TATL GATE MODLDING GLASS, BACH [JOOE 1000 & 28 (2500 ) TEd = 2225
TAIL GATE MOULDING LOWER GLASS |, 1:00 5 19.70 (25.00 ) g 192 5 14 .77
BRACK DOOR
Sub-Total 2 5532.901

Labour
o REPATR REAR PORTICH 1.00 % 600.00 0.0 - 0,00 5 600.00

Others

— 7
Buthorised Signﬂiure
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 2/3 E. & O.E
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SHRT Aulbomobive Secvicas Pte Ltd
231 Horth Bridge Road Singapore 179102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: &5 63340247

AUTOMOTIVE &
Tax Invoice
Customer Coda: 3000063 G5T Reg %o, ¢ MR-3500001-7
CEN : 1990042802
SMRT TA¥XIE PTE LTD Invoice Ho. ; IV180200347
Date 14.02.2018
Block Unit Vehicle No. SHBS3T77A
Your Rof Ko, TAX/DL/18/2104
o0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARE E4 Our Ref Ng. 24094394
SINGAPORE 757705 Termns 30 Days
ﬁuscriptiﬂn h.%y T Unit Add / {Discount) Amount
] Cost % Amount
TO CHECE WIRING AWND SYSTEM FUNCTION 1,00 & =35.008 0.0o o a.00 ] 3000
TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFEOTED 1:00 5 3000 Q.00 (2] 0.a9 7] 30.00
AREA
TO TRAMSFER REAR TAILLGATE MECHANISM L.GQ 5 6. 00 Q.00 5 0. 00 2 60,00
TO REMOYVE AHND REEFLY REAR WINHDBCREEN Lo 00 & -x200.00 0,00 5 Q.00 3 120,00
T REMOVE AND INSTALL LUGGAGE 1.00 3 50.00 Q.00 - i3.00 5 30,00
COMPARTMENT TRIM TG FACTLITATE
REFPAIR.
To INSPECT BER LIGHTING, MECHANISMS 100 & 30,00 0,00 & .00 G 30.00
& WATER TEST BR LIGHTING FOR
LEAKAGE
T REPLACE SUMDRY PARTE 0.0 5 L0000 .00 3 .00 5 0, 0a
MO WASH AND ZACUOUM C.00 & 60,00 . Q0 3 O.00 i g.00
I'Gr RERSRAN HEAR RUMPLSR .00 5 200 00 ) L 5 0.nag 5 200,00
10 RESFRAY REAR FANEL G.00 % 180.00 0. 00 5 G.0u 3 u.00
TO RESPFRAY TAIL GATE .40 % 200.00 .00 g 0.00 3] 200.040
T BRESPRAY TATLGATE OUTSIDE GARNISI 1.00 & 100.00 Q.00 5 000 % 100. 00
TO RESPHAY SPOTLER L.00 5 100.00 0.00 % 0.00 5 100.00
[y BESPRAY RELR FEXNDER I3 .00 % 209.00 o L 5 0, ey 5 200 . 00
GRAND TOTAL & i,282.81
Remark
Make /Model PRTUSY
Accident Date 31.0L.2018
H.2. Payment by cheque should be crossed and
made payable to 'SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lbd'.
Ho receipt will be issued unless regquested. 5
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Ruthorised Signature
for SMRT RAutomotive Services Pte Ltd

E. & O.EB
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SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Rel:  TAX/01/18/2184
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 07/02/2018

ACCIDENT ON 31/01/2018 INVOLVING SHB 5377A & GBB 8844U
ALONG BENOI ROAD TOWARDS PIONEER ROAD

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 5377A is $116.63 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

// LB
LT )
14 . : 'H

Ty

for Manager
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Sl Wahicle Hub

Enguire Transaction History

Transaction History Details

| op Mates Time 31Jan 2018/ 15:17:26
Assel Type: Yehiclo Transaction Amount:
Asset 1 GRIRAOA41T

TEAX Insuranee Foguiry (IR

Iransaction Type: Channel:

Paymient)

ESASBANC - BALGISH BINTE ABDUL  Business Transaclion
User 1D

1AL Reference Mo.;

Search Date / Time; AJan 2018 09:11:00

=
Insurance Company: LAINA LATPIRG INMSURANCE (SINGAPORLF) FIE LTI

Information displayed is corrert as af the lng date and time.,

Enguire Related Logs Back to List

Hitedivrl Ha.gov. sglliadvellactionfhubAgancy Tl oglelaf7EUNCTION 1D=F1801004F T

$/49

External Agency

20180131151/26582565



