Véron Chen (LKKAuto) $3Y S70SsS

From: ~ Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 1:48 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto})

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: SID : 12662545 2911348870SG (Jonathan @ 92237799)
Importance: ‘ High

Your Ref: CS/LCR18002367/Svd3
Dear Veron,

We note that you have submitted report in Merimen and we have since processed payment for your fees and closed
this case in Merimen.

Whilst reviewing the file, | noticed that our insured has not submitted GIA report for this accident. Kindly advise if you
sent any letters/emails to our insured to inform them of this non-reporting case.

If there was any correspondence between your office and the TP repairer, kindly forward copies for our record.

Please let us hear from you urgently.

Thank you. 32\,_/

/——_
Best Regards,

Angie Gan % /\—MS (A)L Lt(Q &(A\O‘ r)(/‘]l (ﬂ\/j

AlG
Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Dfd' o 2

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-18, Singapore 079120
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AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more. Jo Ned N° N .
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: o s AT VAN

The information in this email (and any altachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, June 29, 2018 8:00 AM

To: Rumli, Sharizah <Sharizah.Rumli@aig.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Quek, Joyceline-CH <JoycelineCH.Quek@aig.com>; Paramchand, Varsha <Varsha.Paramchand@aig.com>; Mutalip,
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