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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

— e
From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.cori>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 3:22 PM
To: “Elaine Cheong'; assignments
Cc SUR
Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT EOR GBGI101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20122017

(DM17HO02911-EC)

Dear Sir/tdm,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some atte mpts to inform the workshop to
present the vehicle,

This case has been pending fora long timeé due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
tempaorarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad 1o reé-open the case accordingly.

N

BEST REGARDS, g LS

G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Fhane: 68411972 | email: assignments@lkkouto.com | fax: b56-4315

ik g1, Payn Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenne 1, #02-25 | S(s0893a)

From: Nivitha (LKX Auto) [mailto:ad min-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 2:21 M

To: "Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)' <shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>

Cc: 'Ong, Germaine (VWG Singapore)' <Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGY101Y & GRD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (DM17H0029 11-EC)

Dear shii Shi,

Noted, with thanks.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Cansultants Pte Lid

Phote: 68411972 | emnil: assignments@ kaito, clim | fiams B256-4315

BIK 51 Paya U] Industeial Park, Ubi Aveniue 1, #na-a5 | S{4oByay)

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [mailto:shushi_tang @y w.com sg]

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 2:05 PM

To: Nivitha [LKK Auto) <admin-di@lkkauto,.coms

Ce: Ong, Germaine (VWG Singapore) <Germaine.ong@vw.com. sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGS101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 {DMlTHﬂﬂZSlI-EC]
Hi,

I'm not able to arrange survey, customer is not willing to accepl the excess.

1



He say he will consider if he wants to claim and get back to me
Best Regards,

T;]I'Ig Shu Shi
Insurance Servica Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampal
Singapore 368314

DID: +85 6922-3502
Mobile. +65 9386-7833
Main Line ; +65 6305-7249
Main Fax: +55 6285-8520
shushi tang@vw.com.so
nftplhwvew viv coim.sq

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [i |'|,__i_|_|_L_t__'-_-___|_.c_1_.'_'l'||"|-!:'J_-L-!;_!}l_lt___;ﬂ__jr,rj,_.j-_'-_r:]|j'

Sent: Monday, 5 February, 2018 2:00 PM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Ce: Ong, Germaine (VWG Singapore)

Subject: FW: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGS101Y & GBD49207 ON 20/12/2017 (DM17HO02911-EC)

Diear Shu 5hi,
Kindly advise urgently

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6841-1972 | email: asslenments@lkkautocom | fax: 6246-44915

Bik 51, Priya Ubi Indistrial Pack, Thi Avénue 1, Foo-25 | S{408093)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@ikkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 12:08 PM

To: "Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)' <shushi.tang@vw.com. sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGI101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (DM 17HO02911-EC)

Dhear Shu Shi,

Its 0D far GBC 9101Y



HEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | email: gasignment=Elkkaits.com | fix: dd st-a915

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | Slao8933)

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [mailto:shushi.tang@vw.com &g

sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 11:56 AM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-diEtkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBG9101Y & GBD4A9207 ON 20/12/2017 I:DMl?HG[]E';lll-EC:I

These TP had been survey by ntuc on 28/12/2017
Sest Regards

Tang Shu Shj
Insurance Service Advisor
Afiersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 6922-36502
Mobile: +65 9386-7833
Main Line . +65 6305-728%
Main Fax: +65 6285-B620
shushitang@vw.com.sg
http/iwww. vw com.sq

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [malto:admin-d@Ikkauto Com)

Sent: Friday, 2 February, 2018 11:549 AM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBG9101Y & GBD4320Z ON 20/12/2017 (DM17HO02911-EC)

Dear Shu Shi,
Its TP

BEST REGARDS,
G Nivitha | Admin
LEK Aumto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssiznmer @lkkautodom | e 6256-4315
3




BIK 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue L#po-2x | Slan8uaq)

From: Tang. Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [mailto:shushi tang@yvw.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 11:51 AM

To: Nivitha [LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto. coms

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGS101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (OM17HON2911-EC)

You are survey TP or QD?
Bast Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macphersan)
| Kampong Ampat
singapore 366314

DID: +55 6922-3502
Mobile: +85 9385-7833
Main Line : +65 6305-72580
Main Fax; +65 6285-B620
shushl tang@ve com.sq
hitp: v v com sg

New Arteon.

This is high performance

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mallto:admin-d@ Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 2 February, 2018 11:03 AM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGO101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (DM17HO0291 1-EC)

Dear Shu Shi,
Appologize, is the vehicle GBC 9101Y In the workshop?

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Aulo Consultants Pre Lid

Fhone: 68431-1072 | amail essignmentadlikanto oom | fax: bast-4315

Bk 51, Payva Uld Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | Sl40B931)

Fram: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) |!T‘In"I|H‘-"..I'ELH-":I.fHIl:E-’-j'lwﬂ'l._ij:{]
Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 10:58 AM



To: Mivitha (LKK Auto) <gdmin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBG9101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 {DM17HO0291 1-EC)

Our insured vehicle no is GBGO101Y
Bes| Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insurance Sarvice Advisar
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore {Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 §922-3502
Maobile: +65 8386-7833
Main Line : +85 B305-7299
Main Fax: +65 B285-8620
shushi langfvw com. £q
hitto:fiwww v coim sq

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mallts; atdmin -gjimlkkaute.com)

Sent: Friday, 2 February, 2018 10:45 AM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Subject: FW: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT EOR GBGI101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (DM17HO02911-EC)

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | emnil: essignments@Ikkaulocom | fax: 256-4515

Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenus 1. #02-25 | S{40B037)

Sent: Thursday, 1 February 2018 5:31 P

To: "Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)' <shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBG9101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (DM17HO02911 -EC)
Dear Shu Shi,

Is the vehicle GBD 49202 in the workshop?



HEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phote: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fox: 6a506-3315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenie 1, #02-25 | S{408934)

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@eqinsurance.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 February 2018 3:33 PM

Te: assignments

Subject: FW: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGI101Y 8 GBD4%20Z ON 20/12/2017
{DM17HO02911-EC)

Attachments: ESTIMATE - GBGS101Y.pdf; Ol - GBGI101Y PDF

Dear All,

Please refer to the attached.
Kindly cantact Ms Shu Shi from M/s Volkswagen Centre Singapore to arrange for the survey.
We enclosed the following documents for your perusal;

. Our insured, GBG9101Y - GIA report
. Repair estimate

Policy excess: $1,500.00

Kindly acknowledge receipt & revert. Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong

Le L] by

eqnsurance

EQ Insurance Company Limited
Wuranll Baail BIT Tosor Bk A8 Compliis S
i S RTTD i b JI T ewt 771 | g B

o i L
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Driviiegrd /T oalidentil infirmitrioh mmioy be contoised o fhid messoge. i o ans (7of D inTEnded recienL. Ainase oy ihe arnder immedptrhe gt giiete ofi conae @

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [maiito:shushi.tang@vw,com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2018 11:22 AM

To: Elaine Cheong

Cc: Yim Woel Shyr |

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGI101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (CLAIM REF:
DM 17HO02255-EC)

Hi Elaine,
Piease find attached estimate basing on the current damage not inclusive of hidden damage.
Best Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insuranca Service Advisar



Alterzales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 6922-3502
Maobile: +65 B386-7833
Mazin Line - +65 6305-7209
Main Fax. +65 6285-8620
shushllang@vw.com sq
AHD W vw.coim.2q

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Sent: Friday, 26 January, 2018-3:53 PM

To: 'Elaine Cheong'

Cc: Yim Woel Shyr

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBG9101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (CLAIM REF:
DM17HO02255-EC)

Hi Elaing,

Customer is checking If the China licence is valid for use? Or EQ only take SG licence into consideration?
The driver had more than 2 yrs of driving experience

Best Regards,

Tarng Shu Shi
Insurance Sarvice Advisar
Aflersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 365314

DID: +66 6922-3502
Maobile: +65 9386-7833
Main Line ; +65 6305-7259
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
shushltang@vy, com. sq
ptto.waww. VW Com. 89




New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Elaine Cheong [mailto:elaine.cheong@eqinsurance com,sal

Sent: Friday, 26 January, 2018 3:06 PM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Yim Woei Shyr

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBGS101Y & GED4920Z ON 20/12/2017 (CLAIM REF:
DM17HO02255-EC)

Bear Shu Shi,
Thank you for your email with attachments.

As spoken yesterday, we understand that insured wish to revert to his OD claim and have now requested you to

assist him to put up an appeal to us

In view of the policy excess @53,500.00 (S500.00 + 53,000.00 - ¥ & Inexperienced driver), kindly let Us have your

repair-estimate for our consideration

Thank you

Regards,

Elaine Cheong

eé'ﬁSLjTD.FttZ&”

EQ) Insurance Company Limited

’ - e AT - Tote el
‘i_‘ = i ﬂ; - youve 9ol o

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [mallto:shushi. tangi@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2018 11:33 AM

To: Elaine Cheong

Subject: FW: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBG9101Y & GBD4920Z ON 20/12/2017

i



