Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 6:26 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Ce: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; KKLau; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIH2806T (Ol
SNM18D00617C02/6) AND GY7755U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002344/Kus3) on
31/01/2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002344/Kus3
CTI REF - SNM18D00617C02/6 (SIH2806T)

Dear Asher

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter,

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $17,336.00 (all in)
We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel (65) 6389 6183
Fax (65) 6224 7478
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntalping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com
Disclaimer :
This message is confidential; its contenis do not constitute a commimment by China Taiping fmsurance (Singapore) Pie. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,

use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. [f you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February, 2019 9:14 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIH2806T (Ol: SNM18D00617C02/6) AND
GY7755U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002344/Kus3) on 31/01/2018

Hi Sir,
We refer to the email dated 14/02/20189.



Third party chasing for offer / settlement.
Please kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Caose Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

phone: ¢841-6051 | emall: gshepna@kkauto.com | Tax £741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 3:50 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJH2806T (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND GY7755U (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002344/Kus3) on 31/01/2018

Your ref : SNM18D00617/C02/6
Our ref : CC6/CTI18002344,/Keals2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured make a right turn @ control junction collided with third party vehicle. We are
of the opinion that liability is not in our insured’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " HUI YANG MOTOR SERVICE" at 517,336.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $36,337.29 $ 16,157.00
2. Loss of Rental (w/G5T)(11days x $100) S 1,177.00 $ 1,177.00 (11days x $100)
3. LTA Search Fee S 2.00 S 2.00
Total $37,516.29 $ 17,336.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You.

gest Regaords,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 4841-8051 | email; gshersng@lkkouto.com | tax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 May 2018 10:53 AM
To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee <|lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAute) <thinthin@I|kkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJH2806T (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND GY7755U (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CTI18002344/Kus3) on 31/01/2018

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 March, 2018 2:41 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee
<lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com:; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kkauto.com:=

Cc: Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com>; Adeline Chng <adeline chng@sg.cntaipin m>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJH2806T (Ol : CT1 - TBA) AND GY7755U (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18002344/Kus3) on 31/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,

We have inspected TP vehicle GY 7755U M/s Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd - Sin Ming.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice



- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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HUI YANG MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Contact Add : SIN MING AUTOCARE Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Singapore 575721
Tel: 64513752 (2 Lines) . Fax: 64514658
Reg No. 201629438M

Date: 26/02/2018

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
Metor Claims Department

3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapore 170009

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GY7755U & STH2806T ON 31-01-2018
ALONG X-JUNCTION OF JALAN BUROH & JURONG PORT ROAD

SETTLEMENT OF QUR CLAIM FOR GY7755U

Lump sum repair cost as recommended by surveyvor ( TP0303 ) $ 16.157.00

11 days Loss of Rental @ $107.00 per day § Li77.00

(8 days repair + 2 Sunday + I arrange surveyor )

I'P Insurance Enguiry 3 2.00

Total $ 17,336.00
e —————

*The above claim applies only fo vehicle damage and expressly exclude all personal infuries
and other conseguential loss.

Please let us have your reply soonest possible, thank you.

Best Regards,

Marco Neo

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

DID: 64515752

Fax: 64514658

email: hui_yang_motor@hotmail com



Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 4:04 PM

To: 'NOOR AMENG@GMAIL.COM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH 2806T AND GY 77550 ON 31/01/2018

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18002344/Keal

19 DEC 2018

MOHAMAD NOOR BIN ABDUL RAHMAN

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING STH 2806T AND GY 7755U ON 31/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @lkkauto.com

r.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Metar Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION LETTER

FE WEHONE T MY CONCE RN

We., kMK Cortdtruction A Evginer ,_'.,3.« Fffe J4<!  hereby declare and agree to use the
address of Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd. that is at Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive. #04-02 Sin Ming
Autocare Singapore 575721 in all my/our correspondences with any party in connection with
myour elaim ansing from an aceident involving my/our motor vehicle registration number
GY 7765 Lt and other vehicles registration number S°JH 2806 7 along
%-Junction of Delen BaOhE Juvgeg fook @4 on 31-0-00.8

FPWe, further grant authority o Messrs Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd or any of their

representatives to open all my/our letters and to negotiate my/our claim on my/our hehalf,

I'We wish to mtorm vou that vou could issue the chegue payment in favour of my/our repairer

Messrs Hui Yang Motor Pte Lid.

Stgnature of registered owner and'or Company’s stamp



Ppolicy No : DMPCSN3061271803 Claim No * SHNMIEDOORLT/CD2/E
Claimant : EME CONSTRUCTION & ENGINEERING FTE. LTD
Amount * 8517:338.00
DOLLARE SEVENTEEN THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED AND THIRTY SIX
OMLY .

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuriea / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident invelwving

Claimant Vehicle No. : GY 77550

insured Vehicle No. : BJE 2BO6T

Date of Loss £ 31/01/2018

Flace of Accident : X-JUNCTION OF JALAN BUROCH & JURCNG PORT ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementionsd sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/for

Insured MName ¢ MOHAMAD NOOR BIN ABDUL RAHMAN
Driver Hame : MOHAMAD NOOQR BIN ABDUL RAHMAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 85
(2) Cost of Repair/Exccss 55 16,157.00
(3) Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 55 1,177.00
(4) GIA/Folice Reports/

Investigation Results/Search Fees 55 2.00
{5} Medical Reports/Expenses 55
{€) Survey Fees/Towing Fee/Disbursement 55
{7) Cost including Disbursement 55

TRIBL: o ociw e 5 5 5% W @ W w0 % w0 & eak 17,336.00

Claimant MName : KMR COMNSTRUCTION & ENGINEERING PTE. LTD NRIC No : 201618731E

'3'] : .,ﬂgxéﬁafij?

Signature . d b Date




HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

Bill To: TAX INVOICE
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd TP Claim Invoice No: TPO303
Motor Claims Department Bill Date:  26/02/2018
3 Anson Road
#16-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore (079909

Description Amount

Date of Accident : 31/01/2018

Owner * KMR Construction & Engineering Pte Lid
Vehicle No . GYT755U

Make & Model :  Mitsubishi Canter

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by surveyor & 15100.00

Sub-Total : | §  15,100.00
Add 7% GST: | § 1,057.00

Total Amount SGD - | § 16,157.00

Reg No. 200 629438M
OST No: 200 6204380

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

Auwtharised Signature

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd

Sin Ming Autocare Bik 176 Sin Min g Drive
#4-02 Singapore 57572/

Email: hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com

H/P: 98625891 Office: 64515752 Fax : 64514658
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CONVINCE AUTO PTE LTD

176 Sin Ming Drive #0404 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721
g TEL: 6556 1131 FAX: 6553 1131
Emal: convinceapl@convinceauto,com.sg
[— GST REG NO:200516575H Company Heg No: 2005 16575H

AMENDMENT

- [ TAX INVOICE
HUI YANG MOTOR SERVEE [/ |1/ NG * ARDNIROOIOS
BLK 176 SIN MING DRIVE | OTHER REF ¢ GXT65IR
#4-02 DATE tO1/2/2018
SINGAPORE 575721 A/C NO : HOS0
TEL: 6451 5752 CURRENCY : R
PAGE :
NO DESCRIPTION VEHNO  Our PO AMOUNT
1 RENTAL FEE FOR NISSAN CABSTAR GXT7651R  P1000057T [, 100.00
PERIOD: 01/02/18 - 12/02/18
(5100 X 11 DAYS)
SUB TOTAL: 1,100.00
7.00 % GST: 77.00
TOTAL: 1,177.00
CONVINCE AUTO PTELTD

w8 Bl gDl

Y

&W‘HGRISED SIGNATURE



CONVINCE AUTO PTELTD

-~ ."

CONVINCE

Rental Agreement

176 Sin Ming Drive #04-04 Sift Ming Autocare Singapore 575721
Tel: G558 1131 Faw: 6553 1131 Email: eonvinceapl@eonvinceauto,com sg
Company Registration No. 200516575H GST Registration No. 200516575H

NO RA 1357

NRIC Mo | Business Reg: ' T T

Addrass:

Contact Person: Tel:

Vehicle No: Make & Model: = » | (n.0 . Date: &
Hirer Class: 2/2A/2B/3/4/5 | Check Qut/ |I'II
MName: Date Out; "”—"f_

TmeOut_ 4. =0p KM Qut;

Petrol: E/ W/ %/ 3%/IF
Date In: S—s=t=sz 13|00}30:%

Time In; L‘r‘ﬁagm KM In:

Petral: E/f YW/ W% IF

Insurance is written by an independent insurance company and acknowledges that he has
received, read and understood the policy conditions relating to the same.

1t Driver Class: 272AI2B/3/415 | pode of Payment
MName e — k% y
Addpaia o Cash / Cheque | Company Billing / Credit Card / Others
{Hp):___ (O): (H): Cheque / Card delails:
NRIC: MNationality: Country of Issue: Expiry Data:
Driving License No: _ Driving Exp:__yrs Expiry Date:
Additional Driver Class: 2/2A/2B/3/4/5 s
Marme: Rental Charges - $_”_ per day (wi/ fi!llao . ob
Address: . Total Rental Period _~— day /wk /mih S§_———
[ (He): (0) — (H): Additional Rental Charges g T
NRIC: Nationality: Country of lssue: H-00
Driving License Mao: Driving Exp: __yrs Expiry Date: s =4
cow @5 Byt
Non Waiverable Excess =] @s =13
The Hirer acknowledges collicion damage excess per accident applies Fatral Top up 55
Own Damage: Delivery / Collection charge Bhoee s
Signature: ) Damage to Third Party: Miscelianeous 55—
Collision Damage Waiver (CDW) Sub Total S
The Hirer may limit his liabilityy for any damage ansing from collicion to $ by | Less: TERD
purchasing COW and pay the specified sum. Pre-payment / Deposit S5
Total Due: 5%
| Signature:; *charges subject to Final Audit
|
Personal Accident Insurance [PAl) Refundable Deposit
PAl may be purchased at a premium specified harein. The Hirer acknowiadges that the Deposit s
pos

Date of refund

| Signalure: Refund Acknowledgemant
Special Instructions For Official Use
Invoice No: Date:
= Receipt Mo: Date;

Important Notes

1. Rental Vehicle is sirictly for Singapore use only and may not be driven out of Singapore without prior consent of Cwner.

2. Only persons aulharized by Convince Auto Pte Lid may drive the vehicle.

3. All parking and traflic violations are the responsibilty of the Hirer. An Administration charge will be levied on any traffic violations redirected.
4. The Hirer shall be liable for excess charges for any late return at the rate shown per hour or per day.

3. In the event of accident, the Hirer shall report to the rental office immediately.

I'We have read and agreed to hete
i STt
& kg '.i-l

X X

& and conditions as set out on both sides of the agreement and cerify that the information given Is true and
I'We agree that the amounts payable under this agreement may be billed to the same account and my
n made on the application credit card charge slip,

PSS LT
[9F fa

iy E\\ >E—
. oy
" ; Fid

{Hirer Signature)

{Additional Driver's Signature)

(Convince Auto Pte Ltd)
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A" GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
|| GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
! "'"Wﬁ y INSURANCE Phone: +l35ugg£4 0010 FEI]I: ++35r3224 0030
T associaTion Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-017748
Date of Requeast: 01/02/2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02
Sin Ming AutoCare

Singapore 575721

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 01/02/2018

Enguiry By Sandra Ee Jing Yi

TP Vehicle Mo, SJH2806T

Accident Date 31/01/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
SJH2806T China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 30/01/2018-29/01/2019  |6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reporis forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for
any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,



;-u'fr_F

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

%, ﬁ GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Ragistration No: M400017735

Qur Ref No: GR-18-017748
Date of Request: 01/02/2018

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02
Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721

Dear SirfMadam,

TAX INVOICE

Your Rel Mo: Online Purchase

5,0 ‘GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

Enquiry Date 01/02/2018

Enquiry By Sandra Ee Jing Yi

TP Vehicle No. SJHZ806T

Accident Date 31/01/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and reguires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque




