Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 6 April 2018 9:30 AM

To: YT(HQ)'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGD 1293K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P AND SGD 1293K ON
01.02.2018

Attachments: RV Il SGD1293K 01022018.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SGD 1293K
Our Ref: CC4/11118002340/Uka3

Dear Shawn,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P & SGD 1293K ON 01/02/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We confirmed settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,284.00
2. Loss of Use(6days x $50.00) S 300.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 29.00

TOTAL (@100%) $1,613,00
(@50%) $ 821.00

Kindly refer to the attached DV above and forward your DV in ORIGINAL HARDCOPY via post for our necessary
action.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: YT(HQ) [mailto:utauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April 2018 3:55 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGD 1293K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P AND SGD 1293K ON 01.02.2018

Hi Zani



We propose settlement at $821.00

COR $1284.00
LOuU $300.00
Liability 50%  $792.00
GIA $29.00

Settlement $821.00

Best Regards

9743 2262 / 8100 7999
www.yewteegroup.com

info@yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Managing Director of

-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

-YEW TEE (CAMBODIA) AUTOMOBILE CO. LTD
-ULTIMAX LEASING PTE LTD

-SKT TYRE & BATTERY SERVICES PTE LTD

—_——
TOLE: TortTio paatssa

YT

WEST HQ: EAST Branch Office: NORTH Branch:

Blk 6 Woodlands Road 399F Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 Mega@Woodlands

Yew Tee Ind. Est Unit No #01-60/61 39 Woodlands Close #01-12
Singapore 678006 Singapore 417800 Singapore 737856

DID: 6765 3373 / 6762 2081 / 6764 9042 DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6760 4895 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 April, 2018 1:42 PM

To: YT(HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGD 1293K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P AND SGD 1293K ON 01.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shawn,



We refer to our email dated 13.03.2018.
Kindly be informed that we are currently pending for your offer acceptance for our next course of actions.
Appreciate an early reply.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 2:45 PM

To: 'YT(HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGD 1293K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P AND SGD 1293K ON 01.02.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SGD 1293K
Our Ref: CC4/11118002340/Uka3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P & SGD 1293K ON 01/02/2018
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$ 800.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: YT(HQ) [mailto:utauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February 2018 4:04 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGD 1293K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 2854P AND SGD 1293K ON 01.02.2018

Hi



