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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-8607198-R

Affilisted to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

B SHENTON WAY #24-01

Rel CC4/ASM18002336/kb3

[T

AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811 Oum: Ooieti®
Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ~ GBF 1401F Veh. Inspected PC 327C
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date DB/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/12/2017 Inspection Date
Survey held at VFIXAUTO SERVICE PTELTD
50 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6, ARK@HKB, 417882 KAKI BUKIT
SINGAFPORE 417892
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




vfix -

Viix Auto Service Pte Lid

60 Eaki Bukit Ave &

Ark@KB Singapore 417897
Email: viixauto@gmall com
Tel 54489068 Fax: 64457368

M/S AXA IN5 (S'PORE) PTELTD ESTIMATE
8 SHENTON WAY DATE : 04/01/2018
#27-01 AXA TOWER ACC DATE : 22/12/2017
SINGAPORE 068811 REF NO. : VFIX-TP20170388
POLICY ND :
Attention: Motor Claim Department
RE : VEHICLE NO. BUS
DESCRIPTION / ﬂ_‘(ﬂ" AMOUNT 55
1 1 REARBUMPER il 322100 —
2 1 SIDE REAR COMPARTMENT DOOR RH / ﬂ/t) 1,850.00 K
$ 5,071.00
LABOUR & MISCELLANEOUS: AMOUNT S5
1 To remove damaged body panels with all necessary components/attach- 5 ‘9 O 2.000.00
ments apply hot-works where necessary straighten rear side panel repair/
reshape dented panels in accordance with factory specifications,replace
new parts refit align into position refit all necessary components/attachments
2 To spray paint replaced/repaired body panels inclusive of preparatory /0,90 2,000.00
works and painting materials
§ 4, 000.00
GRAND TOTAL - 9,071.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS : NINE THOUSAND & SEVENTY ONE ONLY
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry rage 1 01 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Business

Owner ID: 1200C

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na.: PC3Z7C

Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended De-registration 08 Feb 2018

Date:

Wehicle Make: KING LONG
Vehicle Model: KMOEF00K
Primary Colour: Multi-Calour
Manufacturing Year: 2010

Engine Mo ISBE420521843311
Chassls No.: LASRIDSBAAB204390
Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value: $88,460,00

Original Registration Date: 16 Mar 2011

First Registration Date: 16 Mar 2011
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: 5442300

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligihility Expiry

Date;

PARF Rebate Amount: £0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 15 Mar 2021

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: £29.011.00

COE Rebate Amount: £8,999.00

Total Rebate Amount: $6,999.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Feb 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore DeregInput ?FUNCTIO...

8/2/2018



Zaini (LKK Auto)

—— e e —— e ———
From: Zaini (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 3:07 PM
To: "viix auto’
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta)
Subject: RE: Your ref PC 327C_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1401P AND PC 327C
ON 221272017
Attachments: GBF1401P MP4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: PC 327C
Dur ref; CCA/ASM18002336/Ukb3

Dear lrene,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1401P AND PC 327C ON 22/12/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal 1s in the view that our Insured is not liable of the accident.

Based on the accident scenario and our insured’s CCTV footage after review, It can be seen that your client
encroached into our Insured’s lane and collided onto TP vehicle while turning right. Our principal is in view that your
client’s vehicle should keep within his lane when turning

In view of the above and with our principal’s instruction, we regret to inform you that we are unable to further look
into your claim.

As such, we will close file in our end.

Thank you.

¢ R
taiinl Kusainl | Code Horsilss
LEK Auto Contultants Ple Lid
D eBa1.2132 | enminil: Ioikilkkouto com | fos: 47el-4108

Bk &1, Foyoltd modastv=al PFork, Lty Averod 202225 | RIADEFI)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 11:03 AM

To: "wfix auto’ <viixauto@gmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref: PC 327C_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1401P AND PC 327C ON 22/12/2017

WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Yaur ref: PC327C
Our ref: CC4/ASM18002336/Ukb3



Dear lrene,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1401P AND PC 327C ON 22/12/2017
Wea rafer to Lhe above matter

We are of the opinion that this is a case of confiicting versions. There Is no conclusive evidence yet o substantiate
either party's version, Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.
'l'|-'.;.'|!.
Tainl Kupalnl | Coe Hordle
1K Aute Comsublants Ple Lid
DNl £841-2132 | emall [oififikkouio com | faxe 47413108
Poyolits indusived Pork, Ubs Averwe | 90325 | 3408%3))
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Re:<REJECTION APPROVAL> You rR f.
S7M0062E ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF1401P AND
PC327C ON 22.12.2017

Type
© Question

Messape
Flease proceed (o reject TR
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<REJECTION
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PC327C ON 22.

IDENT INV LVING GBF1401P AND

Type
© Question

Mescape

Your Ref; STMO062E Our Ret: CCALASM 1802334/ Ukb3 Dear Cynthia, We refer 1o the below email, TP
rieported thal Ol vehicle side swiped against his vehlcle. No photos / CCTV footage provided by TP il dats
Ol reported that TP wehicle sped up ahead and collided onto his vehicle upon uening right. Based on the
attachied O CCTV Foatage we abiserved thiat the TP vehidle encroached onto O's lane upon turnling anid
coilided onto O vehicle, We had spoken o the lnsured driver where he confirmed thar at the material tima,
e was travelling at the sald location as reported and mentioned that TP vehicle cut into his bing when
turping and resulted i the collision, Based on the Ol CCTV footage, we are of the view that QI wersion s
more credible. A such, we intend Lo reject TP clalm, For vour approval and/os further instructions please
Thank youi. Best Regards, Zaini Kusainl | Case Handler

e |

1



Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini [LKK Auta)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 3:.07 PM

Ta: ‘wlix auto’

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LEKAuto)

Subject: RE Your rel: PC 327C_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1407P AND PC 327C
ON 2212727

Attachments: GBF1401P MP4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: PC 227C
Our ref: CC4/ASM18002336/Ukb3

Dear Irene,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1401P AND PC327C ON 22/12/2017
We refer to the above matter

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured (5 not liable of the accident.

Based on the acadent scenario and our insured’s CCTV footage after review, it can be seen that your client
encroached into our insured’s lane and collided onto TP vehicie while turning right. Our principal Is in view that your
client’s vehicle should keep within his lane when turning

In view of the above and with our principal’s instruction, we regret to inform you that we are unable to further look
into your claim

As such, we will close file in our end.

Thank you.

o1l Ripeecrich
Talnd Kusainl | Cone Horsiie

LEE Avle Comullanis Ple Lid

From: Zainl {LKK Auto)

Sent: Manday, 12 February 2018 11:03 AM

To: ‘viix aute’ <vfixauto@gmall.coms

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) cchewht@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Your ref: PC 327C_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 1401P AND PC 327C ON 22/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref; PC327C
Our ref: CC4/ASM18002336/Ukb3
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<REJECTION APPROVAL> Your Ref:
S7M0062E_ACCI DENI INVOLVING GBF1401P AND
PC327C ON 22.12.2017

Tvpe
9 Quiestion

Message

Your Ret SIMOO62E Cur Ref: COA/ASM 180023346/ Ukb3 Dear Tmthia, We refer to the bieltne omadl, TP
reatt o thal O vishicls sioi ssviped againeg His velicle. No photos ¢ CCTV tootage provided by T Ul dite
Ol reported that TP velicle sped up alead and collided onto his vehicle upon tuming righl. Based on th
altached Ol CCTV Foulage we dbssryed thot the TP vehicdle encroachied onito Ql's Lo upon bunning dnd
vollided onto O vehicle. We had spoken to the Insured driver where he confirmesd that at the material time,
he weas travelling at the said lcation as reportied and mentioned that TP vehicle cut into his lane when
tisrning and resulted in the collision, Basad on the Ol CCTV footage, we are of the viesw that Ol version s
triare credible. As sicH wi littend to reject TP clalin. For your appooval and ‘o further ihstructions please
Tharik you, Best Regards, Zainl Kusainl | Case Handler
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08 FEBRUARY 2018

TONG FONG CO. (1974) PTE LTD
290 RIVER VALLEY ROAD
SINGAPORE 238331

ATTN: HR /| MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF CCHASMIS002336/kh3

YOUR REF : GBF 1401P

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 1401P AND PC 327C ALONG BUKIT BATOK EAST
AVENUE 3 TOWARDS PIE EXIT ON 22.12.2017

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim
against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD, acting on behalf of
the owner of PC 327C against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario, this is a conflicting version pending
concrete evidence from both parties to determine the liable party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to Zuini Ikkauto com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided
at AXA’s reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be required:

= Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
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« |f you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do nol discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their nghts to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us

Please guote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

)
_Zaini

~ Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108
Emall: Zuinii@lkkauto com

c.c.  AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA)
{Motor Claims Dept)



