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Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 April 2018 5:01 PM
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Cc: Chloe; Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J

Without Prejudice 

Thin Thin 
 
Our client attain 100% in his favor and request for hand over to lawyer handle. 

We has no choice has to follow his instruction,thanks. 
 
 

Right-click or 
tap and hold 
here to  
download 
pictures. To  
help protect 
your privacy, 
Outlo ok 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.

Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 
On Tue, Apr 24, 2018 at 9:52 AM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

"Without Prejudice" 

  

Dear Sukyi, 

  

We refer to the below matter. 

  

We regret to inform you that we have our Principal instruction to maintain our offer. 

  

Thanks. 
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Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Friday, 20 April 2018 12:49 PM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; 
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J 

  

Without Prejudice 

Thin Thin 

Our client unable to accept your offer as 50% and his attain 100% in his favor. 

 
We have been direct-settling cases for so long, hope to settle case amicably as well to prevent incur extra 
costs. 

Hope to heard from you soon,thanks.  
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Right-click or 
tap and hold 
here to  
download 
pictures. To  
help protect 
your privacy, 
Outlo ok 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.

Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

  

On Wed, Apr 11, 2018 at 3:43 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

"Without Prejudice" 

  

Dear Sukyi, 

  

We refer to the below matter. 

  

We regret to inform you that we have our Principal instruction to maintain our offer. 

  

Please re-consider our offer. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

Best Regards, 
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Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 7 April 2018 1:44 PM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; 
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J 

  

Without Prejudice 

Thin Thin 

Bola 24(C) mentioned parking lot but never mentioned exiting from MSCP. 

Moreover, we are traveling on main road therefore this bola does not apply. 

  

Please re-study/re-asses this claim and revert,thanks. 
 

Right-click or 
tap and hold 
here to  
download 
pictures. To  
help protect 
your privacy, 
Outlo ok 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.

Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

  

On Wed, Mar 28, 2018 at 2:00 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

“Without Prejudice"  
   
Dear Sir / Madam,  
  
ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J  
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We refer to the below matter.  
  
We are of the opinion that this case is fall under BOLA 24 (C) both vehicles should exercise caution as 1 vehicle is 
travelling against flow of traffic and the other is moving out of parking lot / exiting from MSCP. 

  

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the 
above matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we have our 
principal instruction to offer 50% to your client’s claim.  
  
We propose the settlement at  
  
Cost of Repairs                                                  $   4,800.00 
Loss of Use (4 days x $ 100)                          $      400.00 

$  5,200.00 

@50%                                                                   $  2,600.00 
LTA Search Fee                                                 $          5.35  
Total                                                                      $ 2,605.35 
   
Please confirm the acceptance. 

  

  

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Saturday, 10 March 2018 5:11 PM 
To: 'Chloe' <chloe@nhtmotor.com> 
Cc: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) 
<jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J 

  

"Without Prejudice" 

  

Dear Chloe, 

  

We acknowledge your email below. 

  

We will get further instruction from our Principal and will revert back to you. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Chloe [mailto:chloe@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 1:48 PM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) 
<jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J 

  

Hi Thin Thin,  

Please refer to the photos and video attached.  

Our customer has his right of way from the carpark without any stop-line.  

The road our customer was traveling on was designated for the drivers exiting the car-park. 

However, your insured went against the traffic into my customer's path, obviously trying to make a short-
cut to exit the carpark, which resulted in this accident.  

I hope to attain 100% in our favour.  

LOD will follow soon.  

Thank you.  

  

 
 

Right-click or tap and hold here to  do wnload pictures. To help p ro tect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

  

On Fri, Mar 9, 2018 at 1:12 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SKB 5113J 

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18002331/Aua3 
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Dear Sukyi, 

  

ACCIDENT ON 02/02/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 1246G AND SKB 5113J 

  

We refer to the below matter. 

  

Our insured has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the negligence of your client. 

  

Our Insured was driving along the drive way and your client vehicle exiting out from MSCP and collided onto our 
insured vehicle. 

  

Your client also reported that he was exiting out from MSCP and collided with our insured vehicle which was 
travelling along the drive way. 

  

Traffic on main road has precedence and vehicle approaching main road should exercise greater caution. Attached 
herewith our insured’s sketch plan for your perusal. 

  

Under such a circumstances, we are denying liability and unable to look into your client’s claim.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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