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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 RAFFLES QUAY #29-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583

Ref : CC3QBE18002330/K1ja3

Date : 06-02-2018

| NIAFA

Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XD 6056 Veh. Inspected SHC 8261A
Policy No. B-V0010826-MVA-R0O02 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 06/0272018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/02/2018 |Inspection Date 05/02/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
Ba. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

— ——— e ———————

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 May, 2018 11:59 AM

To: Joy lrene (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD6056U (O1 : QBE - TBA) AND
SHCB261A (TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE18002330/K1ja3) on 02/02/2018

Attachments: ¥DBE0S6U-020218 pdf

Categories: HME

Hi loy

Please find attached as per requested.

Jenny Toh
Sanior Assistant, Claims

QBE Emerging Markets — Singapare
QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
Phone: +65 6477 1225

Email: jenny.loh@ghe.com
Visit us on the web at www.gbe com.sq

ATa il tvae RS T
Wecreate insurance solutd fao

Consftruction

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:loylrene@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 15 May, 2018 11:47 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@gbe.com>
subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD6056U (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHC8261A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/QBE18002330/K1ja3) on 02/02/2018

Dear Jenny,

TP repairer is chasing for settlement.

We would like to request for Ol GIA .

Kindly send us a copy.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
loy Irene | Case Handler



Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409,

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



COMFOR1 z
~ ENGINEERINC

ComFOR1 Date/Time: 05.02.2018 11:43 Page : 1

Team:  ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD sales Order: JCNO305113589
USTOMER REGN %CSZEH MILEAGE
me  COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD T fion
WSTOMER ?01Dﬂ45 WI | =S, 1. S
USTOVE"S83 SIN MING DRIVE T vy
' Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 ‘140 03.0%. 2018 '09: 30
EL -~ [H) 65508753 (o] YA OF Iﬁ.-g-lk_hﬂ 20 15 TARGET DATE

P . . -
CHASS COMPLETHON DATETIME:

oot RiEB41UMGU075507 |

JO8 DESCRIFTION

Accident Date: 02.02.2018
NATURE: 3P 02.02.2018

S/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION

THECKED & PASSED OUT BY:
SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGMATURE

knowladgemant Slip Exit Pas=
me:
P No Vehlcle No.:
eeng.  SHCS261A CHIANG @ SHC8261A
wma of Sarvice Adyisor Signaiure/Dats | Mame of Servioe Advieor Date

e returmed to Senvice Reception upon collection

To be kept by Seourity Guard



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO

SHC 8261A

b

DATE 5/2/2018 9:48

(V8P

MAKE {
MODEL : HYUNDAL i40 - 1'-/ \C L__C{
{gl:r Parts Description’ Labour Tvpe | Unit Price ) Amount
Rear Bumper _— ﬁ $  603.60
Rear Bumper Clips 10 pcs ol 5 22.00
Tail Lamp (RH) ~— " S 565.60
Rear Fender (RH}) — i“f % 2,020.10
Rear Fender Inner Panel (RH) % 1,190.50
R.ear Fender Inner Lining (RH) ?("': $ 164.40
Rear Windscreen Moulding = 3 60.00
Rear Door (RH) f"i % 135110
Rocker Pancl Outer Garnish (RH) e o % 483.60
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) — ftt $ 15070
SUB TOTAL A / $  6,61L60
LESS.20%| 2N/ 0 § 132232
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 5,280.28
Rear Windscreen Sealant /"’( = b 46.00 |Nett
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH) ~— a 5 80.00 |Nett -
S 126.00
Labour Charge e
Panel Beating 5 (1}
Spray Painting Charge g I/Dﬂfrﬁ‘l F2e.
Wiring Charge $ 5060 | E -
Tuft Kote $ S;Hi(f S
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear i . cofsulianis hefice notify 5 l:}O-.ﬁ'U- o=
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass|  the Repairer pf the followinag: b I.'Eﬂ»@ﬁ"f L
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor e F'"” S 120407(2°
Transfer of Door G % 120.6671.0®
Rear Wheel Alignment { gk Prejudice’” basky $ 12086
T * SUPHEAR (ra(s] TRSLER IEnaTIe 0.
kﬁ. L\ l"{ A TOTAL EXBOIRY' approval irof insurance Lompany 5 3.330.00
f'/‘!%{ /i el Acknowledged by Repairer
ESTIMATE TOTAL 8 3,?45.13
4L ﬂ? I Dale: e =
& . {:Z,
%ﬁf’ F P
This 1s an munal estimate based on-a visual mspection of the above vehicle. The final TCRaIF Uanium il

be prepared after the vehicle 1s surveyed by a motor Surveyor appoimnted by the insurance company,




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

YEHICLE NO : SHC 8161A

Ll .

DATE 5/2/2018 9:48

MAKE £, .
MODEL : HYUNDAIL i40 N4 L VAL M
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Tvpe Unit Price | | Amount
Rear Bumper _— S 603.60
Rear Bumper Clips 10 pcs - S 22.00
Tail Lamp (RH) »~— b 565.60
Rear Fender (RH) — % 2,020.10
Reai Fender Tinier Panel (RE), X667 § 1,190.50
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) 5 164.40
Rear Windscreen Moulding =~ S 60.00
Rear Door (RH) ~— $ 135110
Rocker Panel Outer Garnish (RH) XA~/ $  483.60
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) — b 150.70
SUB TOTAL i 5 6,611.60
LESS20%| )N/ 0 3 1,32232
DISCOUNTED 'i'DT.-lL $ 5.289.28
Rear Windscreen Sealamt  — % 46.00 |Nett
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH) ~— $ 80.00 |Nett
$ 126.00
Labour Charge e
Panel Beating 5 000
Spray Painting Charge S I/Lb?ﬁﬁ F2e
Wiring Charge b S0 2t
Tuff Kote $ 007 27
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery b 1M Ea
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass $ 12066 £2°
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor 5 1208677 2=
Transfer of Door 5 120667 S
Rear Wheel Alignment % 120867 X
[ fr (1 TOTAL LABOU 5 3,330.00
i /‘.7[ l, Vi ‘i’n-n’../...
ESTIMATE TOTAL| % §,745.28
4 o ——
%M /e V{’d
This 1s an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO
CUSTOMER: 7010045 REGN NO
ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD MILEAGE
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL
63508755 DATE OF REGN

DATETIME IM
ACCIDENT DATE

JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

Date: 07.02.2018
Time: 15:11:33
Page: 1

305113589
SHCAR261A
0000000000
HYUNDAI

[-40

06.08.2015
03.02,2018 09:30
02.02.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

FART REQUISITION
s

0001 04-01-0103-0579-G  140VC COVER ASSY-RRBUMPE 1 603.60 25.00 452.70

0002 04-01-0103-0585-A  140VC LAMP ASSY-RRCOMBO | 565.60 25.00 424.20

0003 04-01-0103-0575-G  140V2 PANEL ASSY-QUARTER 1 2,020.10 25.00 1,515.07
0004 04-01-0103-0595.G  140VC PANEL ASSY-RRDRRH 1 1,351.10 25.00 1,013.32
(005 (4-01-0103-0658-G  140VC CAP ASSY-WHEEL HUB 1 150.70 25.00 113.02

D006 28-01-0103-2013-A 40V APP LOGO REAR DOOR 1 80.00 2.50- 80.00
0007 04-01-0101-0111-G  HYUNDAI BUMPER COVERCLIP  10L 22,00 25.00 16.50

0008 04-01-0103-0671-G  [40VC MOULDING ASSY-W/SHL 1 60.00 25.00 45.00

- SUB-TOTAL
JOB NATURE

0000 L PANEL BEATING 200,00

0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 720.00

0002 17-01 CHECEK ALL LIGHTING 20.00

© 365981



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIED PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)
CUSTOMER: 7010045

ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
63508755

I0B / PARTS DESCRIPTION

0003 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS.

131'2]‘4 20-204 REMOVE/REFIX UPHOLSTERY ASST REPAIR
(s 20-06-210R REMOVE & REPLACE REAR W/SCREEN.
0006 20-22 REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR

00T 20-02

REMOVEREFIX DOOR PARTS TO ASSIST REP

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE

DATE : DATE :

Date: 07.02.2018

Time: 15:11:33

Page: 2
JOB NO 305113589
REGN N SHCHE2ZATA
MILEAGE OO0
MAKE ¢ HYUNDAI
MODEL 140
DATE OF REGN 06.08.2015
DATETIME IN 03.02.2018 09:30

ACCIDENT DATE 02.02.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

20,00
50.00
100.00
20.00
50.00
SUB-TOTAL 1.780.00
TOTAL 5,439 8]

AUTHORISED : YES / NO

SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref No 305113589
£ ' ComfgnDelGro Engineering Phe Lid
Date D2/07/18 59 Loyang Drive Singapone 508369
= Fax: G546 B168
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Attn KALVIN
Vehicle Reg No. SHCE261A 02/02/18
The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-
%, The repair job shall il to: XD6056U
2 The finalized amount shall be:
(a) Spare Parts after List discount $3.650.8%
(b)  Labour Charges $1.780.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost §5,439.87
(.} Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: 20%
Final Lumpsum Repair cost
3. Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 working days.

4. We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within 7

working days
5. Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimates and
l.f finalized amount
,
= =)
.'l
Signalure ! Signature :
Mame . CHIANG ™~ Name i K‘-‘L
Tel 62148314 Date 8o/t
Fax . 65468156
For Official Use Only
Document
ltem Amount Attached ESC:H::;E ;EE}; Remarks
Yes or No g
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paid M
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fea
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
6 Owverrun

Remarks:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg Mo, 19-8607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref © CC3/QBE1B002330/K1ja3n2
s e owe: rasaoe [ LHFIN
Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XD 68056U Veh. Inspected SHC 8261A
Policy No. B-VD010826-MVA-R002 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC011158 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 C.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUO75507 Colour BLUE
Odometer 210004 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 BRIDGESTOMNE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
By General Information
Accident Date  02/02/2018 ]Inspactiun Date 05/02/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL FERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 8261A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607186R GST Reg. No. 15-9807198-R

Page No:1of 2

: Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshnp?:}} {5!:4
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 603.80 £03.60
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 22.00 2200
1| TAIL LAMP (RH) CRACKED 565 60 565.60
1|REAR FENDER (RH) DENTED 2,020.10 2,020.10
1|REAR FENDER INNER PANEL (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 1,190.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER LINING (RH) SERVICEABLE 164 40 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|REAR DOCR (RH) DENTED 1,351.10 1,351.10
1|ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARNISH (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 483,60 -
LABOUR
1|REAR WHEEL HUP-CAP (RH) GRAZED 150.70 150.70
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,322.32 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1,193.27
5,280.28 3,579.83
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 46.00 -
1|REAR DOOR COMFORTDELGRO & APPS STICKER (RH) |NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
{SN)
126.00 80.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,600.00 800.00
FENDER INNER PANEL (RH) AND ROCKER PANEL
OUTER GARNISH (RH).
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 1,000.00 720.00
WIRING CHARGE. 50.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 20.00
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY . 150.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. 120.00 100.00
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 120.00 20.00
TRANSFER OF DOOR 120.00 50.00

Report Ref No. CC3/QBE18002330/K1ja3n2




74 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406333

#___l_l_l

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R Page No.:2 of 2

5 Estimate By | Our Adjusted

Descri of Parts Condition
o i Workshop (§))| ()

REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 120,00 "
3.330.00 1,780.00

GRAND TOTAL 8,745.28 5,439.83
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I | | 5,439.83|

Report Ref No. CC3/QBE18002330/K1ja3n2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN

Automotive Assessor [ Investigator

el

( i

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ks made solely for the use and benefit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Report.




