
i'. 1

I .,

:=,. _ g{rltg

i-ii-rs
Caieula:io.n fer irai u=i! ;:-,:
a-.---^ ri.,--J:i dij= ljl v

iii:i:t,::!.1::: I l:
;rrll;iir.ii.,i ,

icl.:f=tion for Prape,ssesseei vai-j;ie :

h demar.e vehjci=:,, .V:-.1Uc .S

t :-'.r,'E: 1::-f

': .*+ a

li-
!

;

ilii-rs



Veron Chen LKKAuto

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Kitty,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Tuesday,6 February 2018 10:20 AM

Kitty Teo Poh Guek

'ANG Yvonne'; Jas Tan Siok Thiew; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg; winnie'ho@axa'com'sg;

SUR

RE: Check Market Value (MV) - S7M003P9 / gG 1348K/ DOA: 30.10.2017

The market value for sJG 1348K is 59.5K-510.5K (EST) as at Oct 20t7.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315 
:

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue t,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: G race Ho [ma i lto:su rveyad m i n5 @fta.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 5 FebruarY 2018 7:16 PM

To:,admin,<admin@lbs-auto.com>;'chowauto'<chowauto@singnet.com.sE>;'rta'<rta@rta.com.sg>;'admin'
<admin@autoprobe.com.sg>; 'cynthia.ong' <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; LKK Valuation

<valuation @lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'ANG yvonne' <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; Jas Tan Siok Thiew <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; birdie.ong@axa'com.sg;

winnie.ho@axa.com.sg; kitty.teo@axa.com.sg; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com'sg>

subject: check Market Value (MV) - S7MO03P9 / SJG L34SK| DOA : 30.10.2017

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours'

Thank you & warm regards

Grace Ho

FormTeam ConsultancY Pte Ltd

No. 33 UbiAve 3,#O2-I5 Vertex, Singapore:408868

Tel : (55) 6509 1788 Ext.905 ' rax: (65) 6509 622L

Email : motorsurvev@fta.com.sg
Website: www.fta.com.sg
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[fi ptease consider the environment beforc prit]ting this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged.. lt is intended solely for the identified

recipient(s) to whom it is add-ressed. lf you are not an intenoeo recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system'

vou maynot copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
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0510212018

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owncr lD Type:

Owner lD:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.;

Vehicle to be FxPorted:

lntended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

, Vehlcle Model:
t\

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power OutPut:

Open Market Value;

0rigina I Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

t\ ActualARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details

PARF ElieibilitY:

PARF EligibilitY ExPirY Date;

PARF Rebate Anrount:

lntended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE CategorY:

COE Periocl(Years):

QP Paid:

. 
COE Rebale Arnount:

Total Rebate Arnountr

PARF/COE Re$ale Enquiry

Singapore NRIC

5492E

sJG1348K

No

05 Feb 2O18

MITSUBISHI

LANCER 1,5 MIVEC GLS 4AlT

White

2008

4A910100421

JMYSRCY2A8UOO8117

8o.0kW (107bhp)

$16,230,00

23 Jun 2008

23 Jun 2008

1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

bq: :olrufta
(4fq)

$16,230.00

Yes

22 Jun2O18

$8,115.00

A - Car (1600cc & below)

10

$15,701,00

$597.00

$8,712.00

qgJo - lofiic

iittps:i/vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/actlory'snquireRebate ByPublicBefsraDereglnpul?FUNCTIoN-lD=F0304009TT
1t2


