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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Am B B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

F{Bg Mo 199607198R GST Rﬂg. Mo. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CS/EQI18002300/T1td3
5 MAXWELL ROAD
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date : 06-02-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110
Code: EQI

=

Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE

Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected YN 3T41E
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. OM18HOO0302EC Excess ($) 1,000.00
Assign From MERIMEN (ELAINE CHEONG) [Assign Date 06/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 |lnspa:tion Date D6/02/2018
Survey held at ASMAUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
2 KWONG MIN ROAD
SINGAPORE 628705
5a. Remarks
A)THE MARKET VALUE 15 S§-————-- (EST. AVERAGE)
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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51 URIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: DM18HO00302EC Date: 7/2/2018
Our Ref: CS/EQI118002300/T1td3

The Motor Claims Department

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, YN 3741E

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 6/2/2018 _ at the premises of M/s __ASM Automotive and have the
following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$ 50.143.24
Revised Estimate Amount :8%  24.950.69
“Check” Items Amount +8%  23892.54
Market Value - S%  55,000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value :S§ 31.033.00
Mett Value - S%  23.967.00

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front o/s.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

We have not authorized repair.
Repairer agree on lump sum $22,000/-

Yours faithfully

Taufikh

Automaotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

h

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 3:36 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: Own Damaged Claim: YN3741E ; DOA: 26.01.2018 (CLAIM REF: DM18H0O00302-
EC)

Attachments: YN3741E - SAS (180126).pdf; YN3741E - Q.pdf

Dear All,

Please refer to the attached.
Kindly contact Ms Jaclyn Lai from M/s ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd to arra nge for the survey.
We enclosed the following documents for your perusal:

. Our insured, YN3741E - GIA report
. Repair estimate

Policy excess: $1,000,00

Kindly acknowledge receipt. Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong

i
eqr%&m rance
EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel ] fax

B oo B o \gé‘—-/ you've got o |

SConfidential information may be contaired in this message. If vou aee nol the intended ret iptent, pleose notify the sender immegdiotely and delete olf co

From: Janet Tan

Sent: Monday, February 05, 2018 1:33 PM

To: Elaine Cheong

Cc: jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg

Subject: FW: Own Damaged Claim: YN3741E ; DOA: 26.01.2018

Elaine,
For your necessary action. Thank you.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

‘...-’-M;'mt-rr;rfﬂ-r'.:.ﬂﬁ '::@ e

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}

From: ASM - Jaclyn [mailto:jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, February 2, 2018 7:44 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Own Damaged Claim: YN2741E ; DOA: 26.01.2018

Dear lanet,

Our client, the owner of vehicle YN 3741 E wish to file claim under their own insurance policy.

We hereby append a copy of our estimate and SAS for your kind perusal. Kindly arrange survey for the said vehicle.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jackyn Lai

Customer Service & Motor Claims Executive
ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Add: No. 2 Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705
H/P: 9236 8218

Tel: 6265 0980

Fax: 6265 6068

Web: www.asmauto.com.sg
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Denise Ta! (LKKAuto) :

From: ASM - Jaclyn <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 10:20 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); alex@asmauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: YN 3741E REPAIR LMIT

Dear Taufikh,

We accept your offer at $22,000/- as mentioned below.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Jaclyn Lai

Customer Service & Motor Claims Executive
ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Add: No. 2 Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705
H/P: 9236 8218

Tel: 6265 0980

Fax: 6265 6068
Web: www.asmauto.com.sg

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:tauﬁkh@lkkautu.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 9:26 AM

To: 'ASM - Jaclyn’

Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'

Subject: YN 3741E REPAIR LMIT

Hi Jaclyn,

Please take note repair limit for this lorry is $22,000. Please revert if your side can repair within the limit, as my side
need to revert to Insurance. Thank you.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto



Denise Ta: (LKKAuto) ,

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February 2018 8:44 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Own Damaged Claim: YN3741E; DOA: 26.01.2018 (CLAIM REF: DM18HO00302-
EC)

Attachments: PRELI ADVISED YN 3741E.PDF

Dear Denise,

Please proceed to authorise repairs up to $22,000.00.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eé]nsuronce

l"-'f.-,.. Yt frF - :’:-u\:d-'

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Rlock MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 656223 4190

wWiaw.eginsurance.com.sg
\'i A Member of Citystate (ﬁ"———"'

Privileged,/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [rnaiItu:denlsetav@lkkautu.mm]

Sent: Tuesday, February 20, 2018 5:18 PM =
To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.cnm.sg>

Subject: FW: Own Damaged Claim: YN3741E ; DOA: 26.01.2018 (CLAIM REF: DM18H000302-EC)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ul Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

sent: Tuesday, 13 February 2018 9:30 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; 'Elaine Cheong' <glaine.cheong@eginsurance.com.sg=;
assignments <assignments Ikkauto.com>




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February 2018 915 AM
To: '‘ASM - Jaclyn'; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Ce: ‘alex@asmauto.com.sg’

Subject: RE: YN 3741E REPAIR LMIT

Dear Jaclyn,

Please take note repair at not more than lump sum 522,000/-

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd -
Phone: 6256-3551 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 February 2018 9:13 AM

To: 'ASM - Jaclyn' <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: alex@asmauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: YN 3741E REPAIR LMIT

Dear Sir,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle YN 3741E (Excess $1,000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ASM - Jaclyn [mailto:jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg
Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 10:20 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; alex@asmauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: YN 3741E REPAIR LMIT



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

1 of2

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDe...

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Qwner |D Type:
Owner 1D

WVehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years);

Company

6625N

YN3741E

Mo

07 Feb 2018
MITSUBISHI
FEG3BEASRDEA
White

2012
4M42891478

FEB3BEAZ20%92

$31.571.00
10 Apr2013

10 Apr 2013
1

$1.579.00

Mo

$0.00

0% Apr 2023

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

10

7/2/2018, 9:18 AM



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

QP Paid: $60,000.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31,033.00
Total Rebate Amount: $31,033.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Feb 2018

OK

2aof2

hieps:/fvrl.lta.gov.sg/ lta/vrl/action/enquire RebateByPublicBeforeDe...

T/2/2018, 9:18 AN



MCDT 1601 4345 ) ComianlialGne Enginooring Pie Lid - Pandan
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 230112018 17:35
SUBMITTED BY: Wong Choo Wel

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report commactly the datails of the accident to speed up the claims process

&, Thig Form must b complated by the Polioyhalder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Informatien provided must be as ruthful and accurale as possible. Any willul misrepresentation or withokling of material facls ntay allow insurance companies 1o
repudiate oclicy ability.

4, The issue snd acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admissien of policy kabllity on the part of the insurance companies

5. Any Talse reporting may be referred to the Police for Investigation.

B. This report will be forwarded by e insurers of the GIA Records Managerment Centro astablished by ihe Ganeral Ingurance Associalon of Singapors (GLA) for
archiving and that copsess of this report will, for a fee. be made availzhle upon application by inlerasted parties

7. By the lodgemend of this repart fo the insurers, you heraby consent to the archiving of tis report al the cealre and to copies of tha repart being made availabla
aloresaid,

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repor 28/01/2018 17.35

Date OFf Accident 26/01/2018 15:20

Exact Location Of Accident ALONG SIME AVENUE
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Mumber YNITHE
InsuredPolicyholder

MName Of Registered Owner APPLIED LOGISTICE PTE LTD
Co Reg Mo 201216625N

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone Mo OFFICE-G8630727
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer MITSUBISHI

Model CANTER-3.9 D FEG38 (M)

Exacl Purpose for which vehicle was haing used at
time of accident

Are you claiming undar your own insurance policy YES
for repair to your vehicla?

If Mo, Please state aclion to be taken

Vehicle Calegory COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
Type OFf Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy MO

Policy Number DMCFHQT-000141

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver MUHAMMAD YUNOCS BIN HADLI
MRIC Mo S7918748H

Date Of Birth 21/06/1974

Oceupation QUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 07/05/2013

Driving Experience 4 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS
Gendear MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-86495363

Fax Number

Contact Numbaer

EMail Addrass YUNOSHADLIEGMAIL.COM

Page 1 of 11




Address
Fostoode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company

It Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Cwn Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any forelgn vehicle invalved in this accident?
Mumber of vehicles invelved in the accident

Was any body injured In the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported o the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was nobice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accldent

refer to attached skelch plan

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos avallable for attachment?
Was thera any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

BLK 484AB CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 5 #06-36 SINGAPORE

BE2404
YES

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
RAINING
WET

NO

NO
ND

YES

YES
NO
NOD

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Mumber
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

MName of Driver
MRIC/Passport Number
Contact Mumber

Address

Fastcode

Insurance Company Mame
Mature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YM230P
ISUZU | UNKNOWN / WHITE
NO DAMAGED
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
HOU CHENGQIANG
653396500

84944170 (ATER)

Page 2 of 11




Sketch Plan Pg, 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form rmust be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Autharised Driver

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability,

A, The |ssue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the Insurance
roimpanies

5. Any false reporting may be referrad to the Police for investigation.

6. The regort will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Assaciation of Singapore (G14) far archiving and that coples of this rapart will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested partias.

7. Bythe lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid,

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protaction Act {PDPA)
I understand, acknowledge, agres and consent that:

{3} My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA") may/are permitted ta collect, Use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out In this [form] and any other personal infermatlon
provided by me or possested by my Insurer [collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have Insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all Insurer{s} who have insured
vehicle(s) Invalved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the *Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyersflaw firms, the
Monetary Authorily of Singapore and any relevant government agency/autharity (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of @

(I} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the clalms and any necessary
Investigations relating to the claims;

{ii] investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(i} carrying out and/or dealing with my Instructions or responding to any enguiries by me;

[} admministering my claims [ineluding the mailing of correspondence, statements, involees, reports or notices 1o me,
which could invalve disclosure of certain personal data sbout me to bring about daivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v} complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims. [collectively the
“Purposes")

b} allinsurers) wha have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accldent and the Insurers' lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
te collect, use, disclose and/far process my Persanal Infermation for one ar more of the above Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agentsiincluding their lawyers/Taw firms), which may be sited autside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes,

(4} my Persanal Information will also be collected and used to compile clalms history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investigation and management in present and all future claims,

(e} the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosad:

() toall insurars and/ar any ather third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, contralling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, ar

{ii} for complying with requirements under any reguelations, laws or court orders,

o s EMSERRAG PIE LI
CONFORI D S0 ERSHER BRI

mfm_ﬂﬂilliﬁ
e § SIGIMIRE /
rED’-"-. 3 HAE I
(( \% ' e
(=]
|=u|icyn‘oé%gf fgture Driversisil|ature " Reporting Centre Personnel's Signature
Date & Tinfe——" (IF driver is ok the palicyhoider) Names\\WiO M CHEE WE)

Date & Time: }Cc-' : [ W ’-]‘:50 NRICIFIN No.15) 220 00,

Page 3 of 11




Sketch Plan Pg, 2

SKETCH PLAN
JeAZ) afve
o

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

.

—
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ee— e ]

DECLARATION

1/We de:lare 1|1g fure,gumg partlculars are true in wﬂ\mnm.

b

Pni:',.'ho[d?!rg -re

river's Reporting Centre Personiel's Signature
Date & Tine: rrr s the poln:w: Mame: W"}H{‘ CHEE W=,
Date & i NRIC/FIN No.: £ ;Iz/([?a??é
H
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ASM Automotive Services Pte LLtd -~
Mo 2. Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705
Tel: 6265 0980 /| 8265 BBOE Fax: B265 BOEE

Email: enquiry@asmauto com sg b(%ﬁik
- [ .

Co. ! GST Reg. No.- 201203813C

FROM : Jaclyn Lai DATE : 02.02.18
TEL. NO. : 6265-0980 / 9236-8218
EMAIL ! jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg VEHICLE NO. t YN3THME
MODEL NO. : MITSUBISHI FEE3BEGSRDEA
TO : EQ Insurance Company Ltd CHASSIS NO. : FES3BEAZ0992
ATTN : Motor Claim Department ENGINE NO. : 4M42A91478 (2977 cc)
TEL. NO. 1 6223-9433 LTA REG DATE : 10-Apr-13
FAX : 6224-3903

CLAIM TYPE : Own Damaged
cc : Applied Logistics Pte Ltd D.0.A : 26.01.2018
CLAIM REF NO. : asm/AC18016/JL

Quotation for Accident Repair

el R —— ———— e e,
SIN SPARE PARTS QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 Cabin assy 1 $ 1815024 § 18,150.24 be—
2 Combination meter 1 5 266098 S 266098 7 - ows
3 Steering wheel 1 3 58899 3 588.99 #t—
4 Airbag module 1 $§ 212532 5 2125327 khw
5 Steering shaft 1 ] 168308 35 1,693.00 7 | vt
6 Steering column dust cover 1 g 10044 % 109.44 by —
7 Steering column cover ] 5 69.73 § 69.73, -
8 Power steering assy 1 $ 598008 § 5980087 bE7
9 Brake booster 1 $ 200474 § 2004747
10 Engine control unit 1 $ 16,201.31 3§ 16,201.31 74
11 Heater assy 1 $ 357048 $ 357048 a4
12 Blower assy 1 $ 102815 § 1028157 ("
13 Instrument panel core 1 $ 110154 §  1,10154ple
14 Combination meter bezel 1 $ 183.77 § 183.770% —
15 Instrument panel, upper center 1 5 24047 § 240.4?&;
16 Glove box assy 1 $ 32792 $ 327.92 ol
17 Parcel, tray 1 3 12042 § 1294240~
18 Instrument panel, assistant side, lower 1 3 50356 $% 503.56 =L~
19 Instrument panel, center lower 1 g 40030 % 400.300L0_—
20 Instrument panel, driver side, lower 1 3 96.14 § 96.144p
21 Fuse lid 1 $ 2972 § 20.72 7/ ww
22 Front signal lamp, RH 1 3 21136 § 211358 —
23 Headlamp assy, RH 1 3 57347 % ST3.47 pa_~
24 Clearance lamp, RH 1 3 18413 § 18413 &
25 Front bumper 1 $ 986.64 $ 986.64 bt .~
SUB-TOTAL : $ 5915098
LESS 25% : $ 14,787.75
BALANCE : 5 4436324
LABOUR CHARGES %o
1 Dismantle damaged cabin, replace new cabin, transfer wiring harnesses into new cabin, 5 4,200.00

replace other damaged parts, re-align cabin. Re-fill aircon gas, top up steering oil etc.
( $280 x 15 days )



ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

No 2, Kwong Min Road. Singapore 628705

lel: 6265 0980 / 6265 8806 Fax: 6265 6068 ’ o
Email: enquiry@asmauto com 59 éfz%ﬁj_}_
Co./ G5T Reg. No.: 201203813C JAIL _

(qo.

2 Perform computer diagnosis and re-setting fault code 5 180.00
Ll

5 1,300.00

3 Spray painting whole cabin

4 Towing fee $ 1/¢1nn.uﬁ W

TOTAL LABOUR : K 5,780.00
GRAND TOTAL : $ 50,143.24
—_—

T.@«JFM\ ﬁ#‘{?’ﬁl‘f’j
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ASM Automotive Services Pte Litd

Ne 2, Kweng Min Road, Singapore 628705

Tel: 6265 0980 / 6265 BBO6 Fax: 6265 6068 '
Email: enquiry@asmauto.com.sg 6 rw

Co./ GST Reg. No.: 201203813C 3
FROM : Jaclyn Lai DATE : 020218
TEL. NO. - 6265-0980 / 9236-8218
EMAIL + jaclynlai@asmautn.com.sq VEHICLENO. : YN3T41E

MODEL NO. . MITSUBISH! FEBIBEGBSRDEA

TO : EQ Insurance Company Ltd CHASSIS NO. : FE83BEAZ0G92
ATTN : Motor Claim Department ENGINE NO. 1 AMAZAS1478 (2977 cc)
TEL. NO. 1 B223-9433 LTA REG DATE : 10-Apr-13

FAX : 6224-3803

CLAIM TYPE : Own Damaged
cC - Applied Logistics Pte Ltd D.0.A - 26.01.2018

CLAIM REF NO. : asm/AC18016/JL

Quotation for Accident Repair

= =T e
SIN SPARE PARTS QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ~ AMOUNT
" 1Cabinassy mEe———1 ] § 1615024 [ § 18,150.24 bur—
|~ 2 Combination meter T et . (e 11| . e 2660987
3 Steering wheel | [ 5 58809 S 58890 4f
4 Airbag module = i [ 1 '$ 212532 (§ 2125327
. & Steering shaft i e '§ 169309 § 1693097
6 Steering column dust cover . ] 1§ 109.44 § 109.44 clg.—~
7 Steering column cover _ . ] 1 '§ 6973 s 6973 -
/B Power sleering assy | = |'§ 598008|§% 5980087 v
./~ 9|Brake booster : | 1 s  200474|§ 2004747 v
| 10/Engine control unit = 1 s 16201318 1620131 7 V
11 Heater assy — I . N § 357048 | § 35704827
412 Blower assy 1 |$ 102815]% 1,02845%
43 Instrument panelcore 1 s 110154 §  1,101.54g0
14 Combination meterbezel | T s 18377 § 183770k —
15 Instrument panel, upper center 1 % 24047 S 240.474¢
.16 Glove box assy e ] $ 327.92 | § 327.92 okt~
17 |Parcel, tray O T =S b ] 12942 | 3 128.424
18 Instrument panel, assistant side, lower 1 |§ 50356 |S  503.564
" 19/Instrument panel,-center lower sl 1 § 40030 § 400.304.—
20 Instrument panel, driver side, lower === T 1§ 9614 $  96.14de_~
+ 21 Fuse lid ' S ST $ 2072 | § 29.727
22 Front signal [amp, RH 1 5 211.35 | 3 211,35 e —
23 Headlamp assy, RH - 1 $ 573.47 | § 573.47 o~
. 24/Clearance lamp, RH B -1 $ 18413 | 5 18413 o™
25 Front bumper - _ B 1 g 08664 5 986644t
SUB-TOTAL : § 59,150.98
LESS 25% : $ 14,787.75
BALANCE : 5 44,363.24
LABOUR CHARGES %o
1 Dismantle damaged cabin, replace new cabin, transfer wiring harnesses into new cabin, § 420000

replace other damaged parts, re-align cabin. Re-ill aircon gas, top up steering oil etc.
(5280 x 15 days )



ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Mo 2, Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705

Tel: 6265 0980 / 6265 BBO6 Fax: 6265 6068 i
Emall: enquiry@asmauto.com.sg 5 rZS’ﬁFF
Co. | GST Reg. No.: 201203813C ]
[3o.
2 Perform computer diagnosis and re-setting fault code & 180.00
o0
3 Spray painting whole cabin b 1,300.00
4 Towing fee g 100,00 C
TOTAL LABOUR : 5 5,780.00
GRAND TOTAL : $ 5&43.24
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref © CS/EQIMBO02300/T1td3e?

A

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 23-04-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EOQI
1. Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected YN 3741E
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO00302EC Excess |:$] 1,000.00
Assign From ELAINE CHEONG Assign Date 05/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI FUSD c.c 2977
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. FEB3BEAZ0992 Colour MULTI COLOUR
Odometer - Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |7.00 R16 FIRESTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[7.00 R18 FIRESTOMNE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |7.00 R16 (D) FIRESTOMNE B/& mm
L/H Rear Tyre |7.00 R16 (D) FIRESTONE 6/6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 [Inspection Date 06/02/2018
Survey held at ASM AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
2 KWONG MIN ROAD
SINGAPORE 828705
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE MARKET VALUE IS 5$55,000.00(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 16 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BA B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4215
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YN 3741E
Estimate Qur Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | = mhop%} [si}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|cABIN ASSY BUCKLED 18,150.24 18,150.24
1|COMBINATION METER CRACKED 2,660.98 2,660.98
1|STEERING WHEEL BENT 588.99 588.99
1|AIRBAG MODULE NOT NECESSARY 2,126.32 -
1|STEERING SHAFT NOT NECESSARY 1,693.09 ;
1|STEERING COLUMN DUST COVER DEFORMED 109.44 108 44
1|STEERING COLUMN COVER DEFORMED 69.73 69.73
1|POWER STEERING ASSY BENT 5,9680.08 5,980.08
1|BRAKE BOOSTER BENT 2,004.74 2,004.74
1|ENGINE CONTROL UNIT DENTED 16,201 31 16.201.31
1|HEATER ASSY CRACKED 3,570.48 3,570.48
1|BLOWER ASSY NOT NECESSARY 1,028.15 A
1|INSTRUMENT PANEL CORE DEFORMED 1,101.54 1,101.54
1|COMBINATION METER BEZEL DEFORMED 183.77 183.77
1|INSTRUMENT PANEL, UPPER CENTER DEFORMED 240.47 240.47
1|GLOVE BOX ASSY DEFORMED 327.92 327.92
1|PARCEL, TRAY DEFORMED 129.42 129.42
1|/INSTRUMENT PANRL, ASSISTANT SIDE, LOWER DEFORMED 503.56 503.56
1|INSTRUMENT PANEL, CENTER LOWER DEFORMED 400.30 400.30
1|INSTRUMENT PANEL, DRIVER SIDE, LOWER DEFORMED 96.14 96.14
1|FUSE LID NOT NECESSARY 29.72 .
1|FRONT SIGNAL LAMP, RH CRACKED 211.35 211.35
1|HEADLAMP ASSY, RH CRACKED 573.47 573.47
1|CLEARANCE LAMP, RH CRACKED 184.13 184.13
1|FRONT BUMPER BENT 986.64 986.64
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -14,787.75 -13,568.68
44,363.23 40,706.02
LABOUR
DISMANTLE DAMAGED CABIN, REPLACE NEW CABIN, 4,200.00 3,360.00
TRANSFER WIRING HARNESSES INTO NEW CABIN,
REPLACE OTHER DAMAGED PARTS, RE-ALIGN CABIN.
RE-FILL AIRCON GAS, TOP UP STEERING OIL ETC. ($280
x 15 DAYS)
PERFORM COMPUTER DIAGNOSIS AND RE-SETTING 180.00 120.00

FAULT CODE.

Report Ref No. CS/EQI18002300/T1td3e2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-4 v = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
escription of Parts ond
2 i Conditon | workshop ()| (5)
SPRAY PAINTING WHOLE CABIN 1,300.00 900.00
TOWING FEE. 100.00 100.00
5,780.00 4,480.00
GRAND TOTAL 50,143.23 45,186.02
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 22,000.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
LESS EXCESS -1,000.00
NETT LIABILITY 21,000.00
Report Ref No. CS/EQI18002300/T1td3e2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M_MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solety for the use and benefit of the Cllent named on the fromt page of this Repaort.

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATAI
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