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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SLM578P (C0469501)

 [SHF639G]
 TP

 GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
 Feb 1 2018 7:00AM

 [TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
 Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

  
 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 29/01/2019 10:43 AM.
To   AXA_SG; AXA_LynnKhong
CC   Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Subject   <SEEK MANDATE> Re: TP settlement - C0469501/P1680520
 
Dear Lynn,
 
We refer to the subject matter.
 
PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL AS BELOW:

 COR(w/gst): $3,531.00
 LOU           : $   210.00 ($70 x 3 days)-below 1.6cc

 TOTAL        :$3,741.00
 REMARKS   : BOLA 5 - OID turning at junction

 
For your approval and/or further instructions please.
 
Thank you.
 
Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG
Sent On: 11/01/2019 08:53 AM
Subject: TP settlement - C0469501/P1680520
 
Dear MARCUS CHUA,

  
Please proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

  
Regards,

 Lynn Khong


