Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

T e e e B e e e . M S .

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.coms

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 9:58 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (Ol : CTI - SNM1BD007R0CD2) and

SJIB42R (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We approve offer at $3867.45,

Pls let us have your usual bill and documents for payment.
Thank you,

Regards,
Chong Boon Sen

Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email. boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its cantents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in @ written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whale or portial, /s prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the messoge, please notify the sender immediotely.

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July, 2018 2:02 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred
Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving $JG2044E (Ol : CTI - SNM18D00760C02) and S1J842R (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below matter.

Kindly let us have your approval as TP is keep on chasing us for settlement.

Thanks.

Best Regards,



Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 2:16 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@seg.cntaiping. com>; Alfred
Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident involving SIG2044E (O1: CTI - SNM18D00760C02) and 5JJ842R (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18002245/Aual) on 28/01/2018

Importance: High

Your Ref: SNM18D00760C02 "Without Prejudice”
Our Ref: CC6/CTI18002245/Aual

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIG 2044E AND SJJ 842R ON 28/01/2018

We refer to the above accident.

Ol collided to rear portion of TP vehicle.

We did clarify with Ol the nature of accident. We had informed Ol about TP claim.

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

summary of offer made to workshop New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repairs §15,253.00 S 3,500.00
2. Loss of Use (560 x 6 days) 5 360.00 S 360.00
3. LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 s 7.45

5 15,620.45 5 3,867.45

Enclosed herewith the relevant supporting documents for your kind perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email; thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.entaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 18 May 2018 1:26 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (OI : CTI - SNM18D00T760C02) and 51J842R (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Please refer to the above attachment as per requested.

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65)6222 7175

Email: lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Simpapore sinee 1938

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid, except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately,

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 18 May, 2018 1:08 PM

To: Lucas Lee; Chong Boon 5en

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (01 : CTI - SNM18D00760C02) and SJJ842R (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Importance: High

Dear Lucas / Boon Sen,
wWe refer to the above matter,

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured'’s accident report for our necessary
action.



Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2560 | email: thinthin@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 3:15 PM
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (OI : CTI - SNM18D00760C02) and SJJ842R (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Insured not yet reported the accident fyi.

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3, Anson Road, #16-00

Springleaf Tower,

Singapore 0732309

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax 6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping, ¢om
Email: lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping com
Website: www sg.cntaiping.com

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April, 2018 7:17 PM

To: Lucas Lee; Chong Boon 5en

Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (01 : CTI - SNM18D00760C02) and SIJ842R (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Dear Lucas / Boon Sen,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary
action.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
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Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 20 February 2018 12:17 PM

To: Lucas Lee <lucas lee(@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chon .cntaiping.com=
Ce: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (Ol : CTI - SNM18D00T760C02) and S1J842R (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

Dear Lucas / Boon Sen,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary
action,

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailtu:1ucas.Iee@sg.cmaiping.mml

Sent: Friday, 9 February, 2018 9:04 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJG2044E (Ol : CTI - SNM18D00760C02) and S1J842R (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/CTI18002245/Aual) on 28/01/2018

Dear Mei Kwan,

Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Chong Boon Sen

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3, Anson Road, #16-8@

springleaf Tower,

Singapore 879589

Co. Reg. No. 20882883B4E

DID: 6385 6181



Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Email: lucas.leefisg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 5 February, 2018 4:43 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIG2044E (O1: CTI - TBA) and 5)J842R (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18002245/Aua3) on 28/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected the vehicle S]] 842R at M/s New Hock Teck Motor Workshop - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report and claim reference for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan @lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
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| NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTELTD.

Our Ref : NPLT1804-0079/ 5JJ842R 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Your Ref :S1G2044E Blk C #01-43 Autobay@KB
Date : 26" April 2018 Singapore 417883

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079808

Dear Sirs,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ842R & SIG2044E AT CTE ON 28.01.2018, 13:00HR

We are instructed by LU JUN to claim damages and losses against you in connection with the
above captioned road traffic accident which our client’s vehicle S$JJ842R was damaged by
vehicle 5$JG2044E driven by your insured at the material time.

We are instructed that the said accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and/or
management of the vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and
our client has been put to loss and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

1) Repair Costs 5 3,500.00
2} Loss of Use for 06 days (5 + 1 Weekend) 5 360.00
3) LTA Search Fees 5 7.45

) 3,867.45

A copy each of the following supporting document is enclosed:

1) Final Repair Bill
2) LTA Receipt

Please let us have your cheque for the sum $3,867.45 made payable to us, NEW HOCK TECK
MOTOR PTE LTD in the next 14 days.

Yours faithfully,

L

NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE-LT['}
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51 UHIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (63) 62563561 FAX : (065] 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18002245/Aua3

03 MAY 2018

OP3 CREATIVE PTE LTD
15 KIM CHUAN TERRACE
SINGAPORE 537037

Dear Sir'Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJG 2044E & SJJ 842R ON 28/01/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
THIN THIN HLAING
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108
Email: thinthin/@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Litd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd
K aki Bukit Avenue 6

Blk 1 #01-43

Singapore 417883

Dear Sir,
& ] II'I'. F. ¥ 'l.. 2 |
Accident on 7t el ¥
& ¥ =1 A= T l'.-l 'I’..
Involving Vehicles SR vl A 00 LUVME
"TE
Along \C
I/'We. the registered owner/driver of vehicle registration no: LI IEN 2R _

have mvolved in the above accident.

I/We hereby authorize New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd to commence repairs of the said vehicle
forthwith.

I/'We agree to assign the whole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
solicitor, - o . to act on my/our behalf in respect of the
above matter. And if applicable, my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to
pay the amount as deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and
client basis.

I/'We undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claim is successful.

I'We also authorize vou to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers In
relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.

Yours truly,

[
Owner’s Signaturall
(Company’s stamp if applicable)

| Lu Jun
MName:
NRICNo.: CH1bp%0! ]S
Date: llll_)’!ml%




Assignment

To: New Hock Teck Motor Pte Lid ~ (Workshop)

O TN LR
; p 3 ; ; ; ih L
In consideration for your agreement to repair my motor vehicle registration no. > J VA

and to defer demanding for payment of the cost of repair, l/'we the undersigned do hereby
irrevocably assign absolutely to you all the proceeds of my/our claim(s) including damages, interest,
costs and expenses (including legal costs / disbursements payable on a party and party basis which
are to be paid to the parties so entitled including solicitors, vehicle appraisers and other experts /

consuliants),

I/'We further confirm that payment to you only or to any person authorised by you lo receive
payment shall constitute a good and effectual discharge of the obligations by any party of the

aforesaid proceeds of my/our claim(s).
['We authorise you expressly to give notice of this assignment to the party concerned.
I/We confirm that by this assignment, I/we shall not be entitled in law to receive any payment. If a

cheque is sent to mef/us, l/we shall return same to the sender as l/'we am/are precluded from

accepling any payment.

Dated this_ UL ayer UL 20 13
Signature : % é‘jtj
Name : Lig Judun
ID No. : - ¢r1ELS01
Address
]
Witness Signature /k
Witness Name s CAW 1"“ L.')'\ o
Witness 1D : LG Y H
Witness Address : 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-43

Singapore 417883
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Poliey No @ DMBECENI040231700 Claim Ho § SHM1BDOTTOOCOR/2
Glaimant ¢ LU JUH
Amount ;8% 3 80G.00

Singapore Dollars Three Thousand and Eight Hundred Only

1¥wWe: agree o aTcept the sabeve mencloned amount to be pard e melfus in foll

final asettlement of .all glaimé, costs § disbursements for injuriés [ damages
sustained by me/us through an aceéident davolving

Claimant Vehicle No. § 333 S42F
Insared Vehicle Moo ¢ 5JG Z044E

fate of Loegs s ZE/01 42088
Place of Accident ¢ CTE TOWARDS BAYE

IN CONSIDERATICON of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHIMA TAIPING IMSUERANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD., I/Wwe agreae absolutely to
discharge CHINA TATIFING INSUBANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD.. and/fox

Inzured Name + . OF3 CEEATIVE FTE TLD
Driver Hame v EOH BODH. THUAN

from all claime, present or fature in respect of all less, Injury or damage
sustained by ms/us arising out of the said accident.

1 ackiowledge that thia payment is made without admiseion of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGRFORE} PTE. LTD.

Global Eum 2 58 3,800.00
Total . 55 3,800,900
Claimant Mam=: LU JUN HRIC No 3 Sqlbtgblj
5\

Signature - '.l"h Date : _J."g 5’2 { f""ﬂ"lg
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NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@~Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Email: admin@nhtmotor.com  Website: www.nhtmotor.com

Tel: 747 6241 Fax: 6741 7276
UEN: 201718370K

TAX INVOICE

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Invoice No NPL1804-0079

3 Anson Road #16-00 Date 26-Apr-18

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909 Date of Accident 28-lan-18

Vehicle No. SJJI842R

Client: LU JUN Model Type Peugeot 308
Descriptions Amount

Lumpsum Repair Costs 3,500.00

| Total 3,500.00

SIN DOLLARS: THREE THOUSAND AND FIVE HUNDRED ONLY




Recemm

lofl

hitps:/Avrl la. gov sg/Masvrl/action/completePavment TFUNCTION

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

G5T Registration Mo. : M4-0006529-2

Print DateTime ;

02 Feb 2018 / 15:40:57

Receipt Date/Time . 02 Feb 2018/ 15:40:57

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt Mo. : ITNET-00000-180202-001338

Previous Receipt No. :

S/IN Item Description/ Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before
No. GST (5%5)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SJG2044E
As at 28 Jan 2018/13:00:00
Insurance Co: CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) FTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SJG2044E
Enquiry Fee 7.00
20180202154019628405
Sub-Total 7.00
Total Before Rounding 7.00
Rounding Difference

Total Amount Payable

Paid By

GST
Amount
(S5)

0.49

0.49
0.49

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
(Internet Banking)

20180202154024581

Total

Cash Change

Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOLU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount
After GST
(S%)

7.49

748
748
0.04
T.45

7.45

7.45
0.00
745
0.0

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt 0K Save as PDF

2/2/2018, 3:41 PM



