Vic (LKKAuto)

#

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 8:48 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: OUR REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020369 ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SCZ 8610 P AND YOUR INSURED SKM91908 DATED ON 02/02/2018

Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent; Saturday, 30 June, 2018 2:19 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: OUR REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020369 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCZ 8610 P AND YOUR
INSURED SKM9190B DATED ON 02/02/2018

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020369
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18002213/Ahb3

Dear Gerald,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKM 91908 (OI) AND 5CZ 8610P (TP) ON 02/02/2018 ALONG UPPER THOMSON
ROAD

We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 5™ February 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a clear-cut case where Insured vehicle had rear-ended to the TP vehicle. As such, liability is not to our
Insured’s favour.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 5,590.75 5 3,969.70
Loss of Use ($80 x 3 days) 5 240.00 5 240.00
GlA Search Fee [ 2.00 S 2.00
TOTAL | $ 5,832.75 5 4,211.70

Breakdown of days is as follows:



Our surveyor’s recommended days to repair 3 days
TOTAL 3 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)
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SLERET WETT Save the Earthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 9 March, 2018 9:51 AM

To: MT_Claim_5SG; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: llong@lonpac.com; ericwoo@lonpac.com; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020369 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCZ 8610 P AND YOUR INSURED SKM91508
DATED ON 02/02/2018

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020369
LKK ref : CC4/LPC18002213/Ahs3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a third party direct settlement case.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SCZ 8610P
Date of survey: 07,/03/2018

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirtey Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall; ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
2



Premium Automobiles

Lonpac Insurance Bhd Norah Khai
300 Beach Road 6768 9927
#17-04/07 6841 1183

The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Your Ref: CC4/LPC18002213/es3

nora.khaif@premiumauto.com.sg

Body & Paint Dept

PA/TP/0149/2018/MAS

12 June 2018

Dear Sir, 1
RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SCZ 8610 P, Audi A4 1.8T FSI MU

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SCZ 8610 P, claimant,
Ms. Yang Yueh-Tsen please find the related document as per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no, 85012590 - $53,969.70

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client
3. A copy of the Letter of Authority duly signed by client
4. Loss of use - $$ 240.00 (S$100.00 x 3 days)

5. A copy of GIA search — 532.00

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at

6768 9927,

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

MNorah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

Lonpac Insurance - SCZ 8610 P

from
Telephona +&5-
Telefax  +63-
EMail

Our department
Qur Ref

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automaobiles Ple Lt

Showroom

9 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 1529090
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408698
Telephone (65) 6366 2323
Telefax  (65) 684 11183



Your ref: CC4/LPC18002213/es3
Our ref: PA/TP/1492018/K5
28 March, 2018

Ms. Yang Yueh-Tsen
144 Countryside Road
Singapore 7898635

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road

#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 1995535

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Accident involving SCZ8610P & SKM9190B
Along Upper Thomson Road Heading City Near Pierce Sec
On 2 February 2018.

I am the registered owner of SCZ8610P.
I confirm that I will be claiming for Rental Charges / Loss of Use and
hearby authorize your esteemed company to settle Rental Charges / Loss of Use

and repair bill directly with Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd.

Your kind attention will be greatly appreciated.

Y ours faithfully.

Ms. Yang Yueh-Tsen

Copy to Norah Khai, Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 17/18/18/VPUS/020369
DATE : 04 JULY 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

'We, YANG YUEH-TSEN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SKM 9190B the sum of Singapore Dollars
Fﬂuﬂhoumn Two Hundred Eleven and Cents Seventy Only (34.211.70) in full and
final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to mefus
upon' the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SCZ 8610P on 02 FEBRUARY
2018 along UPPER THOMSON ROAD.

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (SOH CHAI CHIN /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

“ I \ i
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]

Name of vehicle owner/Date
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Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

. Audi Centre Singapore Alaxandra Service Contro Ubi Service Cantre Customer Service
IR Alnxardra Road 207 Alerandns Aoasd 55 Wb Aoad 1 Servve Appoirtert B366 F373
Tingapare 159930 Singapers 150035 INS sfipbal wogizi U 3 T T Biboue Breabidon Sarvce 2870 1211
Vo ety G e et Conpany THERNG b0z Y e
Page | 15:% G5T Reg. Moo 199%02271W
Invoice: A5812530 Account: LDBR3 (T il I
LONPAC INSURANCE BMD LONDOC INSURANCE BHD
MOTOR CLATW DERT Date @ Q&/06/2018 MOTOR CLAIM DEET
300 BERCH ROAD, 300 BEACH ROAD,
#17-08/87 Ordor & GCIBRIARP #17-04/07
THE CONCOURSE THE CONCOUREE
SINGAPORE 159555 199555 Tervm @ 3 SINGRPORE 1593555
Regn No.; SCIGEIBP (V20195 Fegn Bate: £9/@172913 Mileags: SB46 WIP No,: 54602
Models A% 1,87 FS1 MU BKZ@3H ATTRACTI  Chassis: WAUITIBKZDRITETES Engine: CJE B43268 Dept: U
V5B Mo, :
You have been assisted by := UB-Jiayeze a7 )
Details City Unit Price Amount
5 | BODYWORK N1 2h@, 08 1.8 2Be. 02
TC REMOVE AND TRANGSFER RERR PRREING AI.
CHECH FUNCTION
S | BODYVWORK H: 530, 00 1. 00 G0d, 89
TO DIGMANTLE AMD RENEW RERR BUMPER. REDRGANISE
HEAR CRASH MAMABEMENT COMPOMENTS. REINSTALL
ALL PARTS REMGVED
5 | BODYWORK i 500, 1.0@ E8. B
T0 RESPRAY REAR BUMDER
£ | BODYWORM M 192,00 100 152,09
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECH
¥ | ABHSBATBRTA GRU BUMPER 1.9 28348, oo 2, 0348, 00
Parts  2,038,00 Stib-Totel 3,710.00
Labour 8.8
Sublet 1,672, 00 7% GST 59, TR
Henus 2, &
Lubricant 0. 8 Grand Total 3,965, 70
Received by For & on behalf af

Presium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Customear
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Invaice

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Our Ref No: GR-18-018673

Date of Request: 02/02/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408698

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 02/02/12018

Enquiry By Mastura Binte Osman Basah

TP Vahicle Mo. SKM2130B

Accident Date 02/02/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Pericd of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKMa180B Lonpac Insurance Bhd 01/08/2017-31/07/2018 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided lo you
Singapore and we take no res

or in connection with the reports or their images.

are taken from the original reports forwarded to the cenire by
pansibility for thelr accuracy of contents and shall be under no

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

h11|:|n_“:ffsingapul‘e.I'I"lerlr‘nel't.mfclaimsﬁndEI.E[m'?fUEEbﬂl= MTRsasafuseactio

he members of the General Insurance Association of
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

n=dsp_geninvip&refid=17 14461 &CFID=27BTE5684CF TOKEN=855 172
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Invoice

\ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

> G |N5URANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

QOur Ref No; GR-18-018672

Date of Request: 02/02/2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Prermium Automobiles Pte Ltd

55 Upi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 020272018

Enquiry By Mastura Binte Osman Basah

TP Vehicle No. SKM2190B

Accident Date 02/02/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$) ]
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[X] GIRQ [] Cash [] Cheque
hrtpsz.":'singﬂpore.m&nmsn.mmfclaims.-'inde: c.frn'?fusebox=l‘u‘|TR5a5&r'us-eactiun=dsp_gsmmrtp&rafm=1?1-1-161&(3 FID=27A7656B4CFTOKEN=855... 22



