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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 8:41 AM

To: Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: 'ANG Yvonne'; 'Jas Tan Siok Thiew'; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg; winnie.ho@axa.com.sg;
. SUR

Subject: ' RE: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - SGZ 1988Z / S8M00860 DOA: 30-Jan-2018

Dear Kitty,

The market value for SGZ 1988Z is $105K-$110K (EST) as at Jan 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elise Chong [mailto:surveyadmin6@fta.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 3:36 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; '‘admin' <admin@lbs-auto.com>; ‘chowauto'
<chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'rta’ <rta@rta.com.sg>; 'admin' <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>; 'cynthia.ong'
<cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'ANG Yvonne' <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; 'Jas Tan Siok Thiew' <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg;
winnie.ho@axa.com.sg; kitty.teo@axa.com.sg; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Betty Chew
<surveyadminl@fta.com.sg>

Subject: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - SGZ 1988Z / S8M00860 DOA: 30-Jan-2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours.

Please find attached Parf Rebate for your refer.

Thank yow & warmw regords
Elise Chong

FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

No. 33 Ubi Ave 3, #02-15 Vertex, Singapore 408868
Tel : (65) 6509 1788 « Fax: (65) 6509 6221

Email: motorsurvey@fta.com.s

Website: www.fta.com.sg
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2/2/2018

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

sok : s0\|ig
r\rlehicle Owner Parrticrzrurlarsr | Sy
dwner]bfyﬁé: - Singapore NRIC - o
Ownér Ib:r | | - 7149C |
Vehicle Details B
Vehicle No.: SGZ19882 N
Vehicle to be Exporfed; i No
Intended De-registration Date:  02Feb2018
Véhicle Malr(ézr o PEUGEOT
VehlcleModeI 73008 ACTIVE PURETECH 1.2 EAT6
Primary Colour: 7 Gr;.ay; -
- ;&é;\ufééturing Year: 2017
Ernkgin;emNo.: - WJ:(SS(TA40808118
Cha;;is No VF3MRHNYWHS255902

Maximum Power Qutput:

Open Market Value:

96.0kW (128 bhp)

Ofiginal Regist’ra’ti’on Date:
First Regisfration Date:
Trang%er Couht;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: ‘

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Cétegory:

COE ’l"eriod(\r(ear;):r -
| QI5 Pari;lrzr - ‘

COE Rebafé Arrﬁount:A W

Total Rebate Amount:

0

Yes

$10,680.00

30 Nov 2027

$23,029.00

otpec20or7 0109

01 Dec 2017

$14,241.00

30 Nov 2027

. A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$42,801.00

$42,063.00

$52,743.00

https:/ivri.lta.gov.sg/lta/vri/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT 1/2



2/2/2018 PARF/COE P<bate Enquiry

The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Feb 2018

oK

https:/ivrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vri/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereginput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT
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