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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 8:26 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto); Pauline Tham; SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value for FBL3159U - DOA 22/11/2017
Dear Pauline

The market value for FBL 3159U is $20K-$25K (EST) as at Nov 2017

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) :

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 11:47 A

To: Pauline Tham <paulinetham@tokiomarine.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Market Value for FBL3159U - DOA 22/11/2017

Dear Pauline,
Thank you for your email.

Dear Veron,
Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Tham [mailto:paulinetham @tokiomarine.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, February 02, 2018 11:32 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <Janicelee @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value for FBL3159U - DOA 22/11/2017

Dear Janice,
We would like to request for the market value for FBL3159U.

Accident date : 22/11/2017



Thanks.
Regards

Pauline Tham
Executive, Motor Claim Department

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6401 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are not
the named addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate, distribute or
copy this email. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake
and delete this e-mail from your system.



~PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Page 1 of 2

Y

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner D Type:

Singapore NRIC

- .\ﬁ

 OwnerID: 8295C
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: FBLSiS?U
Vehicleto be Export;ed: Yes
Intended De-registr.ativon Date: 30Jan 2018 .
Vehicie M;:ake: | | .APRILIA
Vehicle Model: TUONO V4 1100 FACTORY
—_—
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacfuring Year: 2016
Engine Né.:v | AV4GO4012
Chassis No ZD4TYH008G5061078 |

" Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

$13,736.00

25 Aug 2016

First Registration Date: 25Aug2016
. Transfer Céunt: 1 |
Actual ARF F"aid: $2,061.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
: pARFEhg,bmty S NO
. PARF Elgibilty Expiry Date: :
PA% FRebate Amount S $000- ) e
tended COE Rebate Detalls
httns://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vr}/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTI... 30/1/2018
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
COE Expiry Date: 24 Aug 2026
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10
- QP Paid: _ $6,503.00

$5.202.00

Total Rebate Amount: $5,202.00

COE Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct asat 30Jan 2018

. OK

https://vrl.lta. gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInout?’FUNCTT...
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