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LABOUR & MISCELLANEOUS:

[

To remove damaged body panel with all necessary components/attachments
apply hot-works where necessary straighten fronl panel repair/reshape

bodv dented panels in accordance with factory specifications replace new
parts refit and align imo position refit all necessary components/attachments

To spray paint replaced’repaired body panels inclusive of preparatory
works and painting materials

To remove,replace suction hose vacuum system and recharge gas

To conduct headlamp alignment

AMOUNT S5

cfﬁﬁ}_,m

65-'-' o 1,000.00

o1 1 X 150.00

v 0

S

GRAND TOTAL : §

SINGAPORE DOLLARS : NINE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED SIXTY SEVEN & CENTS

Vfix Auto Eunri:g_jtgj:td

TWENTY ONLY

2,380.00
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s'hirlgz Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Angie Foo <angiefoo@sg.cntaiping com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 3:52 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A: Jowyn Tay

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving XE3483) (Ol - CT1 - TBA) AND XD9938E
[TP: LKK REF - CC3/CT118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018

Attachments: MSR118016452-XE3483) pdf

OUR REF: SNM18D00640C02/3

Dear Hsiao Tong.

We refer to your emall of 6" February 2018 and our telephone conversation a moment ago pertaining to the above
matier.

We attached our Insured’s SAS Report for your immediate action,

Please check with third party, their insured had hit on to our Insured’s vehicle rear portion and they still claiming
agalnst our Insured's policy.

Awaiting for your reply
Thank you

Regards

Angie Foo

Exacutive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
3 Anson Road #16-00
Spnngleal Tower
Singapore 079809

Co Reg No 200208384E
DID: 6388 6186

Fax B224 7478 /6224 7175

Email angie foo@sqg.cntaiping.com
Email claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com
Website: www sg cntaiping.com

Dracismirnesy

Thia MeLinog i3 o pnficaninl s conpends do not conaitils a corramirant by CHifla ",—..-'-..-,-:q P SIS |5r|l;lﬁh?ﬂ‘!r Py Lig accmn wiere prowided oo a
wiiten agreement belvwean you and Ching Teguny Insurance (Singapore] Fle Lig Any unsuthorised discicgun iss or dusaminalion siter v whois or
portisl o5 prahsied I pon e nod ihe rdenced rediplent of it mestane plesse robfy the serosr immecately

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, & February, 2018 3:15 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1; Jowyn Tay

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483) (01 : CT1 - TBA) AND XD9938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jowyn,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle XD 9938E at M/s Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Beat Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: ShideyHiew @Ikkauto.com | fax: 65741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubl Indwstrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

T'his email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:www symanteccloud.com




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 5 May 2018 1:.09 PM

To: ‘vfix auto’

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD9938E 8. XE3483) ON 01/0./2018 **~ LKK REF -
CC6/CT118002127 /ps3

URGENT without Prejudice

HiIrene.

We are still pending for a clearer copy of your client's video footage.

Appreciate an early reply.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 1:56 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD9938E & XE3483) ON 01/02/2018 *** LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002127/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please find attached Letter of Demand for your kind perusal.

Thanks
Irene

Viix Auto Services Pte Ltd
60 Kok Bukit Ave 6 ArkiPKB Singapore 4176592 | E vinauto@gmail.com | T: +85 84552957 | F: +65 64452368

On Mon, Feb 12, 2018 at 12:31 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

URGENT Without Prejudice



Hi Joane,

Kindly send us the clearer copy of your client’s video footage.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 9 February 2018 5:59 PM

To: 'vfix auto' <vfixauto @gmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD9938E & XE3483) ON 01/02/2018 *** LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002127/ps3

Without Prejudice

Hi Joane,

Kindly send us the clearer copy of your client’s video footage.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhtd@lkknuto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 9 February 2018 9:27 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD9938E & XE3483) ON 01/02/2018 *** LKK REF - CC6/CTI118002127/ps3

Dear Shirley Hiew

Please find attached video footage for your reference,

Thank you.

Best regards

Joanne




Error! Filename not specified.

Viix Auto Services Pte Lid
60 Kaki Bukit Ave & Ark@@KB Singapore 417892 | E: viixasuto@gmall.com | T: +65 BA552957 | F: +65 64457368

On Fri, Feb 2, 2018 at 5:44 PM, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Irene,

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: E366-0055 | email: ShirlevHlew®|kkauto.com | fax 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto @gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 2 February, 2018 12:19 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD9938E & XE3483) ON 01/02/2018

Dear Catherine

Please find attached copy for your arrangement.

Thanks

Irene




Hsiao Tuna !U{I{Autu!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 13 April 2019 12:19 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483J (O1 : CT1 - TBA) AND XD9938E
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002127/Upb3) on 01/02/2018

Attachments: XDS938 video footage.mp4

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly refer to the attached video toctage from third party for your perusal. We have requested o clearer

copy from them but no response from third party up-to-date.

We are of the view that the attached video footage is iInconclusive. This is a total 4 vehicles chain collision
whereby third party was the last vehicle and he had rear-ended our insured vehicle. Therefore, our insured
is not liable for the accident.

As such, we seek your approval to reject third party claim.

Kindly let us have your instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturday, 10 February 2018 8:34 AM

To: 'Angie Foo' <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto)
<Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483) (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND XD9938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018

Hi Angie,
We reler to your below email,

We were informed by third party that our insured lorry has no brake light to alert third party driver and
resulted the collision.

We are cumrently pending for video footage from third party.

We will get back to you once we receive the video.
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To: CHINA TAIPING INS (SPORE) PTE LTD
3 ANSON RD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 072808

Dear Sir [ Madam,
Claimant:

ACCIDENT INVOLVING __ XDOOIBE  AMD _ XE3483)  ON _ OVO22018 AT
JURONG TOWN HALL RD CLEMENTI AVE &

I/We, PENG CHUAN ENGINEERING CONSTRUCTION P L. win/are the registersd owner of
molor ¢ no, ADG9ABE |

Please be Informed thit | have assigned all compensation menies due to mefus in the above
#ccldent fo WFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD,

I/We hereby suthorized you Lo ielease all monles pedaming 1o 1he above mentioned acddant
to VFIX ALITO SERVICE PTE LTD and lorward the settiement chaguis Lo VEIX AUTOD SERVICE PTE
LT whom I/we have authorized to caflect the said compensation moni&s

Thank you,

, % .1
Signatwre of Claimant & Signature of Witness
Company Stamp i gpplicable

ICno: 200304394R ICro: 515275521

Date  27/04/18 Pale.  27/04/18
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept®sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 10:06 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Alfred Toh

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483) (O1: SNM18D00640C05/3) AND
X[9938E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118002127/Upb3) on 01/02/2018

Attachments: XD9938 video footage.mp4

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18002127/Upb3
CTl REF - SNM18D00640C05/3 (XE34831)

Dear Hsiao Tong
We refer to your emall pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to reject the third party claim by XD9938E (vehicle behind Insured)

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sqg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: A F¥i4% Taiping SG

Disciaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it is Intended only for the named reciplents and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorzed disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are notf the intendea
reciplent, please natify the sender Immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 13 April, 2019 12:19 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483) (O1: SNM18D00640C05/3) AND XD3938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18002127/Upb3) on 01/02/2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the obove matter.

Kindly refer o the atached video footage from third party for your perusal. We have requested a clearer

copy from them bul no response from third party up-to-date.

We are of the view that the attoched video footage is inconclusive. This is a tolal 4 vehicles chain collision

whereby third party was the lasl vehicle and he hod rear-ended our insured vehicle. Therefore, our insured
Is not liable for the accident.

As such, we seek your approval o reject third party claim.

Kindly let us have your instruction.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phane: 6742-3197 | email: chewlht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturday, 10 February 2018 8:34 AM

To: ‘Angie Foo' <angie.foo@sg cntaiping.com>
Cc: Jowyn Tay <iowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto)

<Zaini@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483) (01 : CT1 - TBA) AND XD9938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018

Hi Angie,
We rafer to your below email.

We were informed by third party that our insured lorry has no brake light to aler! third party driver and
resulted the collision.

We are currently pending for video footage from third party.

We will get back to you once we receive the video.

Hest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@l|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Angie Foo [mailto:angie. .cntaiping.com

Sent: Friday, 9 February 2018 1:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Jowyn Tay < n .cntaiping.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483J (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND XD9938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to our email of 7" February 2018.



Kindly update your status, have third party withdrawn claim since they had hit onto our Insured’s rear portion
before we issue assignment letter to your company

Thank you

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Mator Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleafl Tower
Singapore 072908
Co.Reg.No.200208384E
DID; 6389 6186

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com
Email. claimsdept@@sg cntaiping.com
Website: www sg cntaiping.com

Discimrmer.

This measage s confidennial; 43 contents do nof conalitule @ commitment by China Tasping Inzurance {Singapore) Fle. Lid excep! where provided forin a
writhan agreement batween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapans) Pte. Lid. Any unautfonzed disciosun, e OF CRSSOTUMENON, aithar in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplant of the message pleasa notify the sendsr immadiately

From: Angie Foo

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February, 2018 3:52 PM

To: ‘Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zainl (LKK Auto); Admin A; Jowyn Tay

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483J (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND XD9938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018

OUR REF: SNM18D00640C02/3
Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your emall of 6™ February 2018 and our telephone conversation a moment ago pertaining to the above
matter.

We attached our Insured’s SAS Report for your immediate action.

Please check with third party, their insured had hit on to our Insured’s vehicle rear portion and they still claiming
against our Insured’s policy.

Awaiting for your reply.
Thank you.

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid



3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909
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Dizclaimar

This message is confidential’ ifts contants do not conatifile a commitmant by Ching Taipmg insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid. except where provided for in &
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From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) to:ShirleyHi uto.co

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February, 2018 3:15 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Jowyn Tay

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE3483) (Ol : CT1- TBA) AND XD9938E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI118002198/K1hs3) on 02/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jowyn,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle XD 993BE at M/s Vfix Auto Service Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: ShireyHlew®|kkauto.com | fax: 5741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5{408533)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www svmanteccloud.com
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Hsiao Tcm.; (LKKAuto) —5

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 15 April 2019 11:27 AM

To: Irenelsk@viixauto.com.sg

Subject: Your Ref: XD9938E *Our Ref CC6/CTI18002127/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE

3483J(CHINA TAIPING) / XD 9938E/ OTHERS ON 01/02/2018]

Your Ref: XD9938BE Without Prejudice
Qur Ref: CC4/CT118002127/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 3483J(CHINA TAIPING) / XD 9938E/ OTHERS ON 01/02/2018

wWe reler 1o the above malier,

We are of the view that your client video footage Is inconclusive. This is a fotal 4 vehicles chain collision
whereby your client was the last vehicle and he had rear-ended our insured vehicle. Therefore, we are of
the view that our insured is not liable for the accident.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unabile to look into your client’s
matter,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)



VB 74l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- v 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Singapore 408333
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg MNo: 199507198R GST Reg. No. 19-98071%8-R

Afiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaoblie

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Rel CCB/CTMBEO0Z127/Upb3g2
e roesenasoreorssos oo osos=e | [N
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XE 3483 Veh. Inspected XD 8938E
Paolicy No. DMCVSN1341891704 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D00G540C05/3 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/02/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ISUZU FXZTTM c.c G839
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JALFXZTTMETOD0117 Colour GREEN
Odometer 3128M Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GO0D
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |285/80 R22.5 TRANSTONE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |295/80 R22.5 TRANSTONE 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |10.00 R20 (D/D) TRANSTONE 5/5/5/5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |10.00 R20 (D/D) TRANSTOME 5/5/5/5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 01022018 Inspection Date 05/02r2018
Survey held at VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD
60 KAKI BUKIT AVE 8, ARK@KB, 417892 KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417892
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Lbi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R Page No.i1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XD 9938E
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Workshop (8)| __(5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED 1.322.00 1,322.00
1|FRONT LOWER GRILLE CRACKED 422 00 422 00
2|CORNER PANEL RH+LH @%$1120.00 CRACKED 2.240.00 2.240.00
1|FRONT BUMPER BENT 2.,088.80 1,685.00
1|HEADLAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 747 60
1|SIGNAL LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 503.60 -
1|SIGNAL LAMP TOP BRACKET LH TO REPAIR SEE 65.00 -
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP RIM RH MISSING 115.00 115.00
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 28500
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,557.80 -1,156.80
6.231.20 4 627.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT 35.00 14.00
1|AIR CON SUCTION HOSE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 28500
B|CORNER PANEL CLIP @$7.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 56,00
B|FRONT GRILLE CLIP @$7.00 (SM) MECESSARY 56.00 56.00
4|FRONT LOWER GRILLE CLIP {@%5.00 (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
4|HEADLAMP RUBBER MOUNTING @$18.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 72.00
4|HEADLAMP RIM CLIP @$8.00(SN) NOT NECESSARY 32.00
556.00 80.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE DAMAGED BODY PANEL WITH ALL 1.200.00 BA0.00
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS APPLY
HOT-WORKS WHERE NECESSARY STRAIGHTEN FRONT
PANEL REPAIR/RESHAPE BODY DENTED PAMELS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH FACTORY SPECIFICATIONS
REPLACE NEW PARTS REFIT AND ALIGN INTO POSITION
REFIT ALL NECESSARY
COMPONENTS/ATTACHMENTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF SIGNAL LAMP TOP BRACKET LH
TO SPRAY PAINT REPLACED/REPAIRED BODY PANELS 1.000.00 650.00

INCLUSIVE OF PREPARATORY WORKS AND PAINTING
MATERIALS.

Report Ref No. CCG6/CT118002127/Upb3g2




' Vd 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
KA‘ TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg Mo 19-0607198-R Page No.2of 2

Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjusted

o : Workshop (§)) (s)
TO REMOVE REPLACE SUCTION HOSE VACUUM NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -

SYSTEM AND RECHARGE GAS.

TO CONDUCT HEADLAMP ALIGNMENT 30.00 30,00
2.380.00 1,560.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,167.20 6,277.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS = 5,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) '

Report Ref No. CCE/CTI18002127/Upb3g2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appralser

MISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES - This Reper s made salely for the use snd beneill of the Clisn ramed = the frant pege of ikis Repon




