Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 11:48 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALISE OF VEHICLE SKZ 9336E (DOA: 29/01/2018)
Hi Ms Chan,

We accept amount $3750.00 (before GST) and 06 repair days.
Thanks & Regards,

Ms Phang

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722
ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

On 31 May 2018 at 17:36, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Chan,

Offer Lump Sum $3,750.00 before GST and 6 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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