Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 20 September, 2018 2:33 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SFF2818S - DV SIGNATURES

Dear Mei Kwan
Both the signatures (in accident report and DV) belong to our customer.

Please proceed with payment.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Yan Ching

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 5:05 PM
To: Teng Wai Khan

Cc: Han Kwan Yong; PBSP

Subject: Re: SFF2818S - Addendum form

hi Mr Teng,
pls see attached the signed Discharge Voucher.
pls advise when i would receive the payment from Sime Darby for my car rental fee.

Thanks.

Yan Ching



