Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Erofia Motor - LeelLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 January, 2019 7:26 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FW 8239J_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV 5478B AND FW

8239J) ON 27/01/2018 LKK REF CC4/AIG18002001/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Poh Kin

Do not have any investigation yet

By the way, case already handed to client’s solicitor
Thus my end do not handle anymore

Thank you

Regards

Leelee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Tel: 67527740
Fax: 67528669

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 31 January, 2019 6:00 PM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg; erofia2@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FW 8239J_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV 5478B AND FW 8239) ON 27/01/2018 LKK REF
CC4/A1G18002001/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Lee Lee,

We refer further to our below email.

Please advise if your client had received any Traffic Police Investigation result.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-



This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 1:36 PM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg; erofia2 @gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: FW 8239)_ ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV 5478B AND FW 8239J ON 27/01/2018

Your Ref: FW 8239] “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
Our Ref: CC4/AIG18002001/Uhb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKV 5478B AND FW 8239) ON 27/01/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Our Insured reported that there was no collision between both vehicles when your client loss control and fell o the
ground. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate either party’s version. below is a copy of our insured's
accident statement for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

TN A s TR TR R

Circumstances of Accide

Circumstances Of Accident #others, Upload the drawing sketch plan "On the 27th of January 2018, at around 1520 hrs, Iy
Bedok North Drive in my dark grey Subaru (SKV5478B). | was on the right side of the 2 lane road and looking to turn right i
There was a bus looking to turn into the bus interchange on the opposite side and it was blocking my view of oncoming ve
inched forward and decided to go ahead with the right turn as | did not see any oncoming vehicles. However, a molorcycle
suddenly appeared and | quickly braked to avoid a collision. The motorcycle lost control and fell on to the road, though ther
collision. | signaled to the motorcyclist to wait while | parked my car, and then got out to see to him. He had moved his bike
was standing and moving without assistance. He mentioned that he was okay, and that he was not angry, but that we sho
particulars and contact details. He gestured to his leg on which | noticed a palm-sized scratch on his leg. He took out his ¢
photographed my NRIC card while | did the same for his. | also took a photo of his bike, which seemed fine to me. We sub
exchanged phone numbers and | left first. At about 1600 hrs, | recieved a text from him that he was heading to hospital, the
damaged, that his phone screen was cracked. He also mentioned his leg, and that he wouldn't be able to work for a few d:
was his only main income. At about 1700 hrs, he texted again to indicate that he had just reached the hospital. At about 18
police report of the incident.”



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



