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Hsiao Tong

From: Ernest Tay <ernest.tay@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 March, 2015 6:17 PM

To: Hsiao Tong; Khor Saw Theng; Shirley Tan Chai Geok

Subject: RE: Our Ref: C0271220MC/SAW | *Your Ref: CC3/AXA13009752/Kpm3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SGX 774R (OI) & SHD 5634Y (TP) ON 28/05/2013]  

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

 

This case is under Saw Theng. Kindly seek her advice instead. 

 

 

Hi Saw Theng/ Shirley, 

 

Fya – under policy number P1262990. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

With regards, 

Ernest Tay 

Executive - Motor Claims 

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd 

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 

Email: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg 

Phone: 1800-880-4741 (Option 3) 

Website : www.axa.com.sg 

 

 
___________________________________________ 
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you 
and AXA. Any unauthorised disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the 
message, please notify the sender immediately. 
____________________________________________   

� Please consider the environment before printing this email   
 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, March 16, 2015 9:19 AM 

To: Ernest Tay 

Subject: Your Ref: 11853663 *Our Ref: CC3/AXA13009752/Kpm3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGX 774R (OI) & SHD 5634Y 

(TP) ON 28/05/2013] 

 

Your Ref: 11853663 

Our Ref: CC3/AXA13009752/Kpm3 

 

Dear Sirs, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGX 774R (OI) & SHD 5634Y (TP) ON 28/05/2013 
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We refer to the above matter. 

 

Kindly advise if the taxi driver injury claim has been resolved.  
 
If so, we would appreciate if you could advise us the percentage of the settlement(BI) as TP repairer, Trans-cab Auto 
Services Pte Ltd would like to wait for the settlement of BI claim first before we can settle the PD claim. 
 

Thank you for your kind assistance and early reply. 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

 

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided 

for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either 

whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender 

immediately. 


