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] L7 L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdm B - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubr Indusirial Park, Singapare 408933
- TEL. 6256 3561 FAX' 256 4315
Reg No' 189607198R GST Reg No. 18-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation internationale Des Exparts En Automobile
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/.CR18001959/pb3
ChaRTISBILONG VTR
CHARTIS BUILDING Date: 31-01-2018
SINGAPORE 078120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SLO2840S Veh. Inspected SKH 469J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 3110172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/01/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at HUI YANG MOTOR SERVICE
BLOCK 176 SIN MING DRIVE
#04-02/03
SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
S5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




n ala

LRIETHL

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Contact Add : SIN MING AUTOCARE Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Singapore 575721
Tel: 64515752 (2 Lines) . Fax: 64514658
Reg No. 201629438M /7
o7 AlTh,-
4-’4:-{_/

29/01/2018
J-) f&f(
Owner: ALLIANCE LEASING PTE LTD Loy A ﬁﬁ— -v'%:«iy
bty
ESTIMATE TO REPAIR MAZDA 6 2.0L - SKH469J
spray painting £ 600.00 ‘&15#{1
lubour charges § 40000 Zos -/
Total S 1,000.00

-



Hsiao Tnna !LI{I{Autu}

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, T February 2018 3:57 PM

To: ‘hui_yang_motori@hotmail. com'

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 29405(AIG) & SKH 469) ON 29/01/2018 *Our Ref:
CC4/LCR18001959/Kpb3

Attachments:; Statement of SLQ 29405 pdi

Your Ref: SKH 469) Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/LCR1800195%/Kpb3

Dear Sirs

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 2940S(AIG) & SKH 449 ON 29/01/2018
We refer fo the above matter,

Please be informed that liability is unclear as our insured driver reported tha! your client cut into his lane and
resulted the coliision. Attached here with a copy of our Insured driver accident report for your easy
reference.

We would like to reques! a copy of video foatage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary
aclion.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affectfinfluence on the lssues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Pest Hegards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(4089739)



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto) —

From: Hul Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 4:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLO 29405(A1G) & SKH 469) ON 29/01/2018 *Qur Ref
CC4/LCR18001959/¥pb3

Attachments: vic-record-2018-01-29-10h23m18s-07230017 . AVI-av

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Attnched video fyna.
I5 it possible to forward us vour insured's video footage?

Thank you & Regards,
Sandm

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2018 3:57 PM

To: hul_yang_motor@hotmail.com

Ce: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLO 29405(AIG) & SKH 469) ON 29/01/2018 *Our Ref: CC4/LCR18001959/Kpb3

Your Ref: SKH 469 Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/LCR1800195%/kpb3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 29405(AIG) & SKH 449) ON 29/01/2018
We refer to the obove matier.

Flease be informed that liability is unclear as our insured driver reported that yout client cut info His lane and
fesulted the colision. Attached here wilth a copy of our insured driver accident repori for your easy
reference.

We would like to request a copy of video foatage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary
action,

Appreciote an early reply.

“hindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on o without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resnlving the matter amicably without partics resorting to legal proceedings. No sdmission of linbility, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferved from this negotiation of termssettlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially alfectinfluence on the
isuwes of labiliny/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/seltlement.”



Best Rigurds,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Coase Hamdler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

PMhoni: brgz-107 | eoaall: ghewht@lkkagto.com | o 624i-4108

K 51, Pova Uln DIdustrmd Park, Ul Avenue 1, w0225 | S(ao8g31)



Hsiao Tnna !I.I(I(Autn!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March 2018 7:57 AM

To: Tee, Chee-Wah (Chee-Wah. Tee@aig.com)

Subject: <SEEK INSTRUCTION > Your Ref: 40914783545G *Our Retf: CC4/LCR18001959/Kpb3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLO 29405(01) & SKH 4691(TP) ON 29/01/2018]

Attachments: SKH 469) vs 5LQ 29405 - Ol VIDED.mp4

Your Ref: 409147B3545G
Our Ref; CC4/LCR1800195%/Kpb3

Dear Sirs/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 29405(0Il) & SKH 46%J(TP) ON 29/01/2018

We reler to the above matter,

Third porty reported that he was stationary to wait for traffic light to turm green, Atter a while, he felt an
impact from behind. Third party driver alighted from his car and saw OID was trying to squeeze in from his

right

OID reported that he was on the 1" lane queuing to proceed right tum from AMK Ave 5 towards AMK Ave
10. Suddenly third party filtered into his lane and collided onto his front left portion.

Based on Ol's video footage. third party cut into the right lane where OID was traveliing with right of way.
In view of this, we are infending to reject third parly claim based on BOLA scenario 15,

For your approval/comments/instruction.

Bist Remards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

PMhone: rgz-4107 | el ghowlhib@ ikauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, U Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S{4n80133)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) — e ————

From: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March 2018 10:49 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK INSTRUCTION > Your Ref: 40014783545G *Our Ref;
CC4/LCR18001959/Kph3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 29405(01) & SKH 469)(TP)
ON 29/01/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Thanks for your emall.

Please proceed to reject TP claim as Ol has the right of way.

Regords,

Tes Chee Wah
AlG
Aamplex Claims Examingr
Llaims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

'8 Shentan Way AIG Bullding #06-16 Singapore 072120
Tal +64191089 | Fax +68357418

Chee-Wah Tee@ain com | www.2ig.com.sq

IMPORTANT NOTICE
ifemrnptman i ive emall (and any alactments) & conficantnd, JF s am nor e el0nsed rcicnl. yodu muEl nod use or dissaminai the
bwmghin M Pl secmiapned Bag sareid v papne pule s weckadedy contify e By ":",l'"r" mpsand amd pormaneny celde the ongrl an
1 prantoil s thevegd  ARMOued) s omaid aid on e b e Prg f Arry wit oy dadnc! dhat nuoht affss! o
vcnrend angd onened y of it rivcpemn! fo wosire el if i3 wis ee and no seeponsabiil

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, March 28, 2018 7:57 AM

To: Tee, Chea-Wah

Subject: <SEEK INSTRUCTION> Your Ref: 409147835455 *Our Ref: CC4/LCR1B001959/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 29405(01) & SKH 469](TP) ON 29/01/2018)

Your Ref: 40914783545G
Our Ref; CC4/LCRIB001957/Kpb3

Deaar Sirs/Modam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 29405(01) & SKH 469J(TP) ON 29/01/2018

We refer to the above matier,

Third party reported that he was statfionary to wall for traffic light to turn green, After a while, he felt an
impact from behind. Third party driver alighted from his car and saw OID was tying to squeeze in from his

nghit.

OID reported that he wos on the 1V lane queuing to proceed right tumn from AME Ave 5 fowoards AMK Ave
10. Suddenly third party fillered into his lane and collided onto his front left porfion,

Based on Ol's video footage. third party cut into the right lane where OID was travelling with right of way.

i



In view of this. we are intending to reject third porty claim based on BOLA scenario 15,

For your approval/comments/instruction,

Best Regarnds,

Hsine Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: frg2-3197 | emolll chewht@lkkouto.com | fos; 6741-3108

Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{(408931)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The infermation in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must

not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emall in error, please immediately notify me by
“Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
respansibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising In any way from its use.



Hsiao Tnna !LKI{AutDJ

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 March 2018 9:08 AM

To: "Hui Yang Motor'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 29405(AIG) & SKH 469] ON 29/01/2018 *Qur Ref:
CC4/LCRTBOD1959/Kpb3

Attachments: S5KH 468) vs 5LQ 29405 - OI VIDEO.MP4

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Modam.
we refer to the above matier,
Attached here is a copy of our Insured video footage for your easy reference.

We have reviewead ihe matter and we are of the epinion that our insured driver should not be blamed for
the accident. Based on our insured's video footage. your client cut into the right lane where our insured
driver was travelling with right of way.

I view of this, we regret to inform your thal we have our principal insfruction 1o deny liability ond unable fo
laok irito your client claim.,

Thank you,

Naote: This video footage is salely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You undertake to preserve
its confidentiality and will not disclose, provide or moke available the video footage in whaole or in part, 1o
any third porty.

Best Repards,

Hsinn Tong, Cliew | Case Handlor

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 674z-q197 | emaoil: chewht@lidenuro.com | fux: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrin] Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #og-25 | $(q08953)

From: Hul Yang Motor [mailto:hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com|

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 4:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com:

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 29405(AIG) & SKH 469) ON 29/01/2018 *Our Ref: CC4/LCR18001959/Kph3
Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,



Attached video fvna.

Is it possible to forward us your insured's video footage?

Thank you & Regards,

Sundrn

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2018 3:57 PM

To: hui yang motor@hotmail.com

Ce: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 29405{(AIG) & SKH 469) ON 29/01/2018 *Our Ref: CC4/LCR18001959/Kpb3

Your Ref: SKH 459) Withou! Prejudice
Out Rel: CC4/LCR1B0O0175%9/Kpb3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LG 27405(AIG) & SKH 449] ON 29/01/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Flease be informed thot linbility s unclear as our insured driver reported that your clignt cut inlo his lane and
rasulled the collision, Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy
reference,

We would like to request a copy of video footage os stated in your cllent accident report for our necessary
action,

Appreciate an early reply.
“Kindly note that this negotintion between parties un this matter ks purely on o without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
reselving the matter amicalily without parties resorting to legal proceedings, No admiission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed

mferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

T the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/inMuence an the
issues of lability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negutistion terms/settloment.”



Best Regords,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Hanller

LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Litd

Phone: brg2-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ui Industrial Parck, Ubl Avenue 1, 202-25 | ${4o89:43)



LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Attn: Thin Thin / Jas

Bik 31 Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Ave | #02-25

Singapore 408933



JEdid =
ENGG 4 o 2 1 A
HUI YANG MOTOR PTE. L.TD.

Contact Add : SIN MING AUTOCARE Blk |76 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Singapore 57572
Tel: 64515732 (2 Lines) . Fax: 64514658
Reg No. 201620438M

Date: 100022018

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
Motor Claims Department

78 Shenton Way

#08-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH469J & SLQ29408 ON 29-01-2018
ALONG RD 1 ANG MO KIO AVE §

SETT, ¥ OUR IM FOR SKHA{69.

repair cosi as recommended by surveyor { TPO298 ) ) 2.00
2 days Loss of Use @ $100.00 per day § 20000
Toral £ 84200

*The above claim applies only to vehicle damage and expressly exclude all personal infuries
and other consequential loss.

Please let us have your reply soonest possible, thank you

Best Regards,

Marco Neo

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

DID: 64515752

Fax: 64514658

email: hui_vang motor@hotmail com



AUTHORIZATION LETTER

I'O WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

UWe, Aliante Laosing hereby declare and agree to use the
address of Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd, that is at Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive, #04-02 Sin Ming
Autocare Singapore 575721 in all my/our correspondences with any party in connection with

my/our claim arising from an accident involving my/our motor vehicle registration number
S L) and other vehicles registration number - s along

eonA ¢ | g 5 . By Py | & L ; an

I'We, further grant authority to Messrs Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd or any of their
representatives to open all my/our letters and to negotiate my/our claim on my/our behalf.

I/'We wish to inform you tha you could issue the cheque payment in favour of my/our repairer
Messrs Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd.

ALLIANCE LEASING PTH LTD
201706503M |\ AN

saspa L P

Signature of registered owner



 HUI' YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

Bill To: TAX INVOICE
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd TP Claim Invoice No: TPO298
Moror Claims Department Bill Date: 10/02/2018

78 Shenton Way
#08-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Description Amount

Date of Accident : 29/01/2018

Chvner  ALLIANCE LEASING PTE LTD
Vehicle No . SKHA69J

Make & Model MAZDA 6 2.0L

repair cost as recommended by survevor 5 Al 0f
Sub-Total : | § R
Add 7% GST : | § 42,00
Total Amount SGD : | § 642,00

Reg No.-200829438M

GST No:20f 6294180

HUI YANG M{H; ORPTELTD
I A
Ly
\"jl \
(.'-.
Authorised Signature

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd

Sin Ming Awtocare Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive
#(4-02 Singapore 57572]

Email: hwi_yang moror@hormail com

H/P: 98623891 Office: 64515752 Fax * 64514658



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revolked | No settlemant

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING |
| Case |Wotned 'F_w Submitted | Adj Assigned | Ad{ Rpt [Ad] Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
| B N30 seg0n.00 | sas00.00 Pending for Survey ‘
Main 00:00 | Report
| kit heg | | | EMMMH| | mzum_||_vu_«n_u| cancet Cose |

Hain Aeferance

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - [Created by adjustar]
Insurea JLWIT‘ILT!I. Co, Reg. No.: -
M
|Clabmant:

|Yahicle Reg,
N SKH469)

ALLTANCE LEASING PTE LTD, Co. Reg Mo 201706500M

25/01/2018 07:00 - 5%
B |[114 Months and § Days From LTA Reqg Date [Man Yr}]

Policy/Cover
!W J A00147EI5450G Nte MGt 0939995070

Date of Loss:

Paley Na.

[Claimant}; 50BBAT0343-01

1 - —— Excess: -
Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) L76 Sin Ming Drive #04-02, Sin Ming AutoCare, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 64515752

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Express] - Tel 65-8419-3000 . [Handled by Tes, Chee-Wah] Ches-wWah, Tee@aig.com

!ﬂ::f:'"r' | NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HG) - Tel:

(Adjuster | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561  [Handled by KENNETH KONG] . [Final Rpt due 09/02/2018]
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mail |
| There are no mail for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Creats New Task | Compiete |

| Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Craated On Dona?
|
No results

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 16/5/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*SKH4569) (40914783545G)
[SLQ2940S)
™
ALLIAMNCE LEASING PTE LTD
Jan 29 2018 7:00AM
[LCRF PTE LTD]
Hul Yang Motor Pte Ltd

Upload Documents | _Upioad Photos | Compase Mew Letter | _Upload video | _ upioad Ausie | View [View i Browses [~ ]
oo iperpepe ]| M
{No_ | Finalized On | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [5G) Thumbnail| Print
10203180832 | Video - Accident B [ BT
Assessment Reports - N L par =
INL ;Fi_niﬂail}n _| l&lﬁ Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [52] Thumbnall | Print

7 | Accident Statement

b [OVOABOUIT | poumh - . M SLGIOAGS, Cimimais ACRF PTELTD @ | Lasarm
F_lllﬂﬁl'l-__ ri_:l“lﬂl_ - 3 per page b E
Mo Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbeail | Print
1 |29/03/18 09:03 General View 0D | adws | M
2 29/0%/18 09:0% | Geners! View D  iloswsc | K
3 19/031809:00 | Genersl View D tesdwe | #
4 | 29/03/18 09:03 General View - - D | oo PG
5 2903180903 | General View D | tosdws | A
& 29/03/1809:03  Genaral View D | saws | &
7 19/03/18 09:03 | General View g Load G | B
8 I9/03/1809:01  Odometer Reading O | esdws |
8 2901/18 0903  Chassis Mumber D lsdws | H
10 29/00/1809:03  Reinspection Photo O wars | @
|n |29/03/18 09:03 | Reinspection Photo 0 | toawc | M
[
‘Documentation iperpage | v]| B
I“F _|Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbrnail| Print
1 31DI/18 18:03 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 31012018 Load POF
2 310U/ 18:03 TP EST & GIA REPORT = | Load POF
'3 0R0X181914 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED @ | Losdror
4 29/03/1809:02 | Emall from AlG dd 280318 8 Load POF
§ 29/0U1E02.10 | Emall to TP whsp_Reject dd 200318, Load POF

Documents Checklist

Auset | save | prot |

|Thars are no decument checklias configured.
|

ur Remarks - LEKK Auto Consuliants Ple Lid (HO)

Show Ramarks To! O Handling Insurer
fasta BaraAT ATE [FSELE LrAes cie thow § L Sthe SRt
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg we 10ss07128m)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto.com:assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/LCR1BD01958/KPB30Q2

Date: 168/05/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No: 0899995070
o TR Ve gith 400 insured Vehicle No: SLQ2040S
Date of Loss 28/01/2018 Nalture of Claim; TP Claim No. 4091478354506
R |
Reg Na: SKH489J
Make & Modsl MAZDA B, 20 SDN V (A) Engine No:. LF20226445
Reg Date: 24/07/2008 (Man_ Year 2008) Chassis No: JMEGH10F 180110033
Colour Metallic Black Cdometer: 248258 km
Engine Capacily: 1999 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable)! Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size: 225/45 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45 R18
Front Left Side: Toye 7 mm Rear Left Side: Toya 7 mm
Front Right Side: Toya 7 mm Rear Right Side: Toyo 7 mm
The abowve vallies raprasnt e remaiming fyre neacds deoth
'Cd_SI OF E_LEIEE E!E!i_l;uf'q Aﬂjmhr_'u_ Difference Diff %
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous lems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.,000.00 600.00 400.00 40.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S§) 1,000.00 600.00 400.00 40.00
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmeni mizo1e
Date Inspected: 05/02/2018 Inspected At Hui Yang Mator Pte Ltd (HQ)
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02, Sin Ming
AutoCare
Singapore 575721
Eslimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG
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NOTE: This report represants our fingings af the Bme and place of ingpection stated hereir. Such inapecion has beon carmed oul fa the baal af our
knowiedge and abiity bal any other habdify under any ofher circumetances ¢ haredy @rpressly excluded,
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

There are no new pans selected.
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 16/5/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no now miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 SPRAY PAINTING New £00.00 400,00
2  LABOUR CHARGES New 400.00 200,00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,000.00 600.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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