Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 5:09 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; KKLau

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF: SNM18D00512C02/3/LKKDS & YR REF: (TP
LKK REF - CCE/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18001932/Aea3)
CTI REF -~ SNM18D00512€02/3 (SDM33635)

Dear Asher
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 513,829.00 computed as follow:

Cost of repairs 512,840.00
Loss of use (12 days x $80.00) S 960.00
Search Fees 5 29.00
Total $13,829.00

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.
p/s Jowyn no longer in service with CTI.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 63826183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 4:28 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF: SNM 18D00512C02/3/LKKDS & YR REF: (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

Hi Sir,
We refer to the email dated on 10/09/2018.
Third party chasing for offer / settlement.

Please kindly let us have your instruction / approval if any.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher 5ng | Case Hondler

LKE Auto Consultants Pie Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email; oshersng 8lkkc com | fox; 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408733)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 12: 3D PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsedept@ ;!.; cntaiping.com>

Cc: Jlowyn Tay' <j .t.;.-,'_&':1;1_.-'=".:a:|_'- ni=: '"Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com:

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: DL.IR HEF 5NM18DG{]512C02!3{'LK1{D5 & YR REF: {TP LKK REF -
CCh/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

Hi Sir,
We refer to the email dated on 10/09,/2018.

Third party chasing for offer / settlement.



Please kindly let us have your instruction / approval if any.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | emal: asherng@ikkauto.com | fox, 6741-4108

8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uni Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 September 2018 12 04 PM

To: 'Claims DEPthCTI < | o cntaiping.com>

Ce: 'Jowyn Tay' <jowyn tay@sg.cntaiping.com>, .&Ifred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: [MAND#&TE REGUEST] RE: OUR REF: SNMlBDDDElECDHS{'LKKDS& YR REF: (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

Hi Sir,

We refer to the email dated on 10/09/2018.

Third party chasing for offer / settlement.

Please kindly let us have your instruction / approval if any.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Phe Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: gshesnag@ikkouto.com | fax 4741-4108
Bk 51, Poya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Averue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 2:51 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping com

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF: SNM18D00512C02/3/LKKDS & YR REF. {TP i LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

Your ref : SNM18D00512/C01/3/LKKDS
Our ref : CC6/CTI18001932/Aea3n2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter,



The accident occurred when our insured lost control and hit third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA
scenario 36 is applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " MG SOLUTION PTE LTD" at $ 14,069.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $ 28,106.28 $12,840.00
2. Loss of Use (12days x 5100) S 1,200.00 5 1,200.00 (12days x 5100}
3, LTA Search Fee 5 29.00 5 29.00
Total 529,335.28 5 14,069.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
For your approval please.

Thank You.

gest Regards,

Asher 5ng | Cose Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashesng@lkkauio com | fox: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408%33)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 20 July 2018 4:13 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Jowyn Tay' <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com:>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>
Subject: RE: OUR REF SNMIEDDDEIZCDZIS,J’LKKDS& YR REF: I[TP LKK REF - {IE,I"CTHBU[HQBZIAEEE}DH 26.01.2018

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed following document for your necessary action.

Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Thank You.

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 4841-60581 | emoil; gshesng@lkkauio.com | fox: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3[408933)



From: Angie Foo [mailto:angie foo @sg cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 1:15 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewhi@lkkalito com=; Admin A <admin
a@Ikkauto.com>; Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay{@sg.cntaiping.com=; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=

Subject: OUR REF: SNM18D00512C02/3/LKKDS & YR REF: (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

Dear Mei Kwan,
We refer to your email of 1* February 2018.
We attached our Insured’s SAS Report and Assignment Letter for your necessary action.

Please take note, the claim handler on this case is Jowyn Tay 63896174.

Thank you.

Regards,

Angie Foo
Executive

Mator Division
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co.Reg.No.200208384E

DID: 6389 6186

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: angie. foo{@sg.cntaiping,com

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com

Discilaimer

This message Is confidenttal iis conlents do not constitute a commitmant by China Taiping insurance {Singapore) Ple. Lid except where provided for in a writtan
agreamant between you and China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Litd. Any unauthonzed disclosure. use or dissemination, either in whole or parfial, 15
prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the massage, piease notify the sender immediately

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto) [mailto:Meikwan@|kkauto.com
Sent: Thursday, 1 February, 2018 6:18 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Zaini (LKK Auto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDM33635 (Ol ; CAl - TBA) AND SKG562C (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18001932/Aea3) on 26.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.



We had inspected TP vehicle SKG 562C at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed here with a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwan@@ kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.syvmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com




MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933

Teol: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

Date : 14/05/2018

Your Ref - CC6/CTII8001932/Aeal (SDM33638)

To - CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Attn : Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm.

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKG562C & SDM3363S ON 26/01/2018 AT
SLIP ROAD FROM CTE (SLE) TOWARDS TPE (PIE).

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1) Proforma Bill No.188134 (@ $512,840.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
2) Loss of Use (@ $$1,200.00 (12 Days x §5100)

3) LTA Search (@ $529.00

4) Authorisation to Act

3) GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.
Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

Sharon

Sharon Chia

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solution@ gmail.com



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name . HEN( LENG LENG
Address . BLE IS HOW6ANG AVE |
#0F (316 S (530115)

Contact No

TD: CHINA FAIPING \NSURANCE (SNGAFORE) pTC LTp
Dear Sirs,
accipent invoLving Kb 563 C AND DM 35E3L gy M"h‘"{}m'}

At/ ALong, ST ReAD FROM (TE ( SLE) TowARDS TpE (pIE)

|/We, HENG LENG LENG , am/are the registered owner of

Sta KLy

maotar car no.

Please note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

I/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-meantioned
accident to M/S MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlement chegue to M/S MG SOLUTION
PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation maonies.

Thank you

Signature of Claimant Witness By



G
ik}

MCTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy' No t DMECSNII1ZGELTOL flaim Wo & SMMLEDOOSIZ/ CHL/3/LEKDS
Claimant & (EERG LENG LENG
Bmeunt r 8513,828.00
DOLLARS THIRTEEN THOUSAND EIGET HUNDRED AND TWENTY HNINE
ONLY .

I/We zgree to sccept the ahove mentioned amount to be paid to mefuz in full &
final settlement of =211 cisims, costs & disbursements ‘for dnjuries / damages
-gustained by me/us through an accident lavolving

Claimant Wehigle No. 't BEG EHEC

rnsured Vehlcle No,. @ SDM 33638

Date af Loss = Z2H/0LF2018

Place 'of AcCcident : ©TE [SLE) TOWARDS TPE (BIE)

IN 'CONSIDERATION of the paymenit msde to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURARNCE (SINGAPORE)] PTE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely o
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE)} PTIE. LTID. and/or

Insured MName  ICHONSG CHIM HING
Driver Name » ZHANG GUIACNG

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury -or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

T acknowladge that this payment is made without admissicn of liakility on the
part of CHINA TATIFPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE}) FTE. LTD.

(1) Gensral Damages 5%
{2) Cost of Repair/Bxeess 85 12,.840.00
(1) Loss of Use/Rental iBarring ES 960.00
(4} GIA/Police Reports/

Investigatisn Hesults/Searth Foes 83 28:00
{5} Madical Reports/Expenzes 53
{6} Burvey Fees/Towing Fee/Disbursement 55
{7} Cost including Disbursement 55

TOTRE: e o & i 4 55 & s e midieiE S H o m D 13,829.00

Claimant Name ; HENG LENG LENG NRIC Mo 0 ST0Z0791E
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Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427344-N)

MG SOLUTION PTELTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933

TAX INVOICE

Bill To:

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
NO. 3 ANSON ROAD

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 079909

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

INVOICE No : T1 189292

PB No: 188134

Date : 15-November-2018

Vehicle Number : SKG 562C

aTy DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation 12,000.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 12,000.00
7% GST 840.00
TOTAL 12,840.00

Cheque should be made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd

Co's stamp & Authorised Signature




e ¥ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
- GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
— G Raffles Quay #18-00. Singapore 048580
g INSURANCE Phone: +85 5524 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
© ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Reqistration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Cur Ref No: GR-18-015508
Date of Request: 20/01/2018 Your Ref Na: WALK IN HONG

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 KAK| BUKIT AVENUE 4 #02-03B, VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE
SINGAPORE 415932

Dear SirfMadam,

Your Vehicle Mo SKG562C
Date of Accident: 26/01/2018
Flace of Accident: SLIP RD FROM CTE TWDS TPE

Involving Vehicle No; SDM33835

DESCRIPTION |AMOUNT (SS)

E-File Search Fee (Public) I 14.02
GST Amount 0.98
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 15.00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1GIRC [X] Cash[] Chegue




wﬁlﬁ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
¢ g GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
; FE INSURANCE Fhone: +65 6224 Q010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
. ASS0CIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: Ma00017735

"""l""n"]

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Dur Ref Mo GR-18-015008
Date of Request: 30/01/2018 Your Ref No: WALK IN HONG

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 #02-038, VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE
SINGAPORE 415933

Dear SirMadam,

Date of Accident: 26/01/2018

Vehicle No: SKGhG2C

Placa of Accident CTE (SLE) TOWARDS TPE (PIE)
Involving Vehicle Ma:  SDM33835

With referance to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reports as requestad:

| DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION |PER DOC (S8) QTY |AMOUNT (S$)

|SDM33635 CTE (SLE) TOWARDS TPE (PIE) | 14.00/1 13.08
{GST Amount 0.92
| Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the membars of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsosver for
any loss or damage arising cut of or in connection with the reparts or their images.

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
' [1GIRO [X] Cash [] Cheque



