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F LA LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408333

- TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 188607198R GST Reg. No 19-9507198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Ret CC4/11118001918/R1ps3
05.02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE 049711 Do SvalEe Ii“"‘lmﬂll‘ﬂ" m
Code: 2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBB 6076H Veh. Inspected FBM 3456G
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 31/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine Ne. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
LIH Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/01/2018 |Inspection Date 01/02/2018
Survey held at SOUTHERN MOTOR
BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2 #01-10 SINGAPORE 158762
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Hsiao Tunﬂ [LKKAutn!

From: Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 4:46 PM

To: ‘Southern Motor’

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: FBM3456G *LKK REF: CC4/1118001919/ps3
Attachments: Statement of GBB 6076H pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed thal liabiity is unclear as our insured driver reported that yvour client hit him from behind
Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.

Kindly let us have evidences [ie: video footage/ scene photos [ PIR) in order for us to look into the matter
Appreciate an early reply.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred

from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/Influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Hindler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhté@lkknuto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ukl Avenue 1, s02-25 | S{go80:39)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 10:13 AM

To: 'Southern Motor' <soumotor@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FBM3456G *LKK REF: CC4/11118001919/ps3

Without Prejudice

Hi,

We are looking into the matter and will get back to you asap.
Hi Shirley,

FYNA, CC4/I118001919/ps3



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handlor

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phoine: fr42-3197 | email: chewht@kkapto.com | fx: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Povan Ubs Indostrinl Fark, Ut Avenue i, #02-25 | S{qo8033)

From: Southern Motor [mallto:soumotor@hotmail.com)
Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 10:08 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewhl @Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FEM3456G

Dear Sirs,

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know whether
the above motorcycle No FBM3456G is authorized for direct settlement.
Thank you,

Yours Faithfully,
Southern Motor



222018 Mariman a-Claims

Claim Audit

- AUDIT TRAIL
0
! f_rl.i;; 2018 cim veh Model Changed (205464) YAMAHA CZD300A / XMAX300 292¢c. H'::-'
Fung
Reg No: FBM3456G. Acct Date: 2018/01/18. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India Internati J.:L
7 311802018 oy created anal Insurance Pte Lid (HQ). TP Insurer: EQ Insurance Company Ltd (HQ). Worksho o
MR p: Southern Motor (HQ) Fun];
Al
3 z;:;.an H18 adj co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ): I-::'-:
Fung
[A]
4 31002018 a4j Mext Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt Due Date:2016/02/09 ﬁ::
Fung
[Al
S JLET 0T Ad) Mandate set Appraved:0.00.Reinsp:Ad) dedides Nay
Fung
[A]
& i}.-js? 018 Label Added (30651);:Vehicle Not In,( 30653} Direct Settlement *,'f{::‘
| Fung
[A]
¥ i;-;“ 2018 adj Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID ﬂ::
: y
[A]
8 ‘:;_;fé’n 2018 eim DUl Modified Clalmant's Name: -> STARHUB CABLE VISION LTD. Claimaint's [D: -> 199103398C. *:‘,r::
Fung

Cur.Req:0.00:FODS Liability: 0% Remarks: [nsured driver reportod that third party b ':.[:.élw

9 E:::.h 20 Adj Mandate Request it him from behind. The damages sustained to insured vehicle was on rear bumper, HEIAD
) We are Intending to reject third party claim. For your approval/instructian. TONG

ACTIVITY
Na record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Mo billing items

hips-/isingapore. medmen comiclaimadindex. cimPlusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dap_viswhistoryScassid=BR003580xtd=2633088CFID=2T86_.. 112



2FR20B

= AUDIT TRAIL

1 31 Jan 2018
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05 Feb 2018

1 hg:a4

ACTIVITY
No record

Manman e-Claims

Claim Audit

[A] Hiew
Clm Veh Model Changed (205464 ) YAMAHA CZDI00A / xMAXIO0 292cc. ;ur
ung
Reg No: FBM3456G, Acct Date: 2018/01/18. Claim Type: TP, Insurer: Indla Interna [A] Hiew
Clm Created tional Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: EQ Insurance Company Ltd (HQ), Warks  May
hop: Southern Motor (HQ) Fung
[A] Hiew
Adj Co Assigned LKK Adte Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)! May
Fung
{A] Hiew
Adj Next Rpt Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date: 2018/03/0% May
Fung
(] Hiew
Adj Mandate Set Approved: 0,00, Reinsp:Ad) decides May
Fung
[A] Hiew
Label Added [30651):Vehicle Nat 1n,(30653): Direct Settlement. May
Fung
[A] Hiew
Adj Adjuster Assigned [None] -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID May
Fung
. o S [A] Hiaw
Cim Otl Modified EIIMIHE s Name: -> STARHUB CABLE VISION LTD. Claimaint's D! -> 199103398 May
Fung
Cur,Req:0.00:PODS Liabllity: 0% Remarks; Insured driver reported that third party ﬂ[:élw
Adj Mandate Request  hit him from behind, The damages sustalned to insured vehicle was an rear Bumpe HSIAO
. We are intending to reject third party claim. For your approval/instruction. TONG
[t
Adj Next Rpt Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/02/09 Lalitha
Erishnan
[t}
Adj Mandate Set Approved:0,00 Laiitha
Krighnan

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

o blliing tems

hitps 'singapore merimen com/claims/index cfmHusebox=MTRadjusterAfuseaction=dsp_viewhisloryAcaseid=6800358exlid=26339BACFID=281
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Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

Fram: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 2:18 PM

To: '‘Southern Motor'

Subject: Your ref: FBM 3456G *Our Ref: CCA4/1178001919/R1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB
BOTBH(IN) & FBM 3456G ON 18/01/2018]

Attachments: Statement of GBB 6076H.PDF; Damage photo. pdf

Your ref: FBM 3456G WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Rel: CC4/1118001919/R 1 ps3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 6076H(IIl) & FBM 3456G ON 18/01/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was coused due fo the entire negligence of your client
who hit onto our insured vehicle from behind. The damages sustained to insured vehicle was on rear
bumper, Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report and damage pholos your easy
reference.

In view of this. we regret to inform your that we have our principal instruction to deny liabilily and unable to
look into your client claim,

Thank you.

Best Reganils,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Hundler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-9197 | emall: chewhté@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Ik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1 #02-25 | 3{408937)



Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: Maotor Claim - [l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January, 2018 4:32 PM

To: Southern Motor; 'sur@Ilkkauto.com’; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc Lalitha Krishnan - III

Subject: RE: FBM3456G

Attachments: 20180126150336.pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FEM34565 and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Lalitha.

"Kindly upload this survey request emaill o merimen,

Thank You.
51.0! ]U‘l'l @ } H—\')m
i
oyl Do M M

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Street | 205 108 Bullding | Singapore 045711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Southern Mator [mailto:soumotor@hotmail.com]
Sent: 30 January, 2018 3:54 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FBM3456G

Dear Gabriel Wee,
We have choose LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the surveyor.
Thank you.

From Southern Motor

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com. sg>
Sent: Friday, January 26, 2018 4:12 PM

To: Southern Motor

Subject: RE: FBM3456G

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We propose using one of the following maotor surveyors:

1



Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Autoprobe Consultants

VP Appraisal

Quantum Risk Management

Ajax Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd
Infiniti Appraisal 5ervice

JP Knights Adjusters

LBS Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Premier Appraisers Services
Priority Services

RT Appraisal

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

@ @ & & & & & & & & @

Please natify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

&4 Cecil Street | #05 108 Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Southern Motor [mailto:soumotor@hotmall.com]
Sent: 26 January, 2018 3:27 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @lii.com.sg>

Subject: FEM3456G

Dear Sirs,

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know whether
the above motorcycle No FBM3456G is autharized for direct settlement.

Thank you.

Yours Faithfully,
Southern Maotor

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

2



If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached

- you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, Kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept linbility for any errors or omissions in the content of this

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBM3456G (MC20182059)

[GBBEO76H]
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Jan 1B 2018 8:00AM

[STARHUB CABLE VISION LTD]

Southern Motor
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co seg ne 1essor18er)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No:  CC4/I118001919/R1PB30C2

Date: 18/04/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid Policy Na: Ma54789
paimant Vehicle ramassec Insured Vehicle No :  GBBB076H
Date of Loss. 18/01/2018 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No:  MC20182059
Rl N & | IFICA H
Reg No: FBM3456G
Make & Model YAMAHA CZD300A / XMAX300, 292¢cc Engine No: H33sEQ020278
Regq Date 27/08/2017 (Man. Year. 2017) Chassis No MH3SHD81000015390
Colour: Black Odometer: 7868 km
Engine Capacity: 282 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$); Market Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steenng (Serviceable); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condifion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 120/70-15 Rear Tyre Size: 140/70-14
Front Left Side; Dunlop 3 mm Rear Left Side Dunlop 3 mm
Frant Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side 0mm
Tha shove values reprasent the remaining e reacs deoth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2,9908.70 2,335.50 66420 2214
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 280.00 210.00 70.00 25.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (5§) 3,279.70 2,545.50 734.20 22.39
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 22958 178.18 51.39 22.38
MNett Amount (S$) 3,509.28 2,723.69 785.59 22.39
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 3110172018
Date Inspeclad: 01/02/2018 Inspected Af. Southern Motor (HQ)
BLK 10068 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2. #01-10
Singapore 158762
Estimated Penod of Repair; 2.0 days
Adjuster; MOHD RASUL Manager: CHEW HSIAO TONG
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NOTE: Thia report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection siated herain. Such inspaction hos been cormisd ouf (o the bes! of our
anowledge and ability St any other Eabifity under any other crcumstances i hamby expressly asciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

|PII‘I Source:; (Last Synchronised: 18 Apr 2018)

IFlrll: MNIA YAMAHA CZD300A / XMAX300 292cc (Modal not available in database)
Labour: Repairar's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FBM3456G)

Validity:

|Further Info:

Thesa estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the las! estimale page
llems/values not in reference catalogue are prefived with an asterisk

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo.  Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 "WINDSCREEN Missing 2B0.00FL *2B0.00FL
2 1 *BRAKE LEVER Scratched 75.00FL *75.00FL
a 1 *SET MIRROR Scratched 180.00FL *180.00FL
4 1 *FRONT FAIRING Scraiched 450 00 FL “450.00 FL
5 1 *SET CENTRE FAIRING Scralched 560.00 FL *560.00 FL
6 1 *LOWER COWLING Scrailched 28500FL *285.00 FL
7T 01 *EXHAUST PIPE GUARD Scraiched 185.00 FL *185.00FL
g8 1 "SET FOOTREST PLATE Mot Necessary 360.00FL *-FL
8 1 *SIDE BOX Scralched 580.00FL *580.00 FL
0 1 "MAIN STAND Not Necessary 158.00FL *FL
1 1 *HANDLE BAR Mot Necessary 220.00FL *FL
F=Franchise par. L=_istiemDisc
Sub Total (S$) 3,333.00 2,595.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S5) 333.30 258,50
Total Parts (S§) 2,999.70 2,335.50
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out ]
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 18/4/2018
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thete are no new miscellaneous llems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TRANSPORT New 30,00 30.00

2  LABOUR New 250,00 180.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 280.00 210.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES »
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