Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 August, 2019 3:31 PM

To: Aileen Tan Lee Noi

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [Reminder] [Counter Offer] AIG/LKK Ref: 4100670552SG-003 CDGE Ref:

T0118/SHC8019J/AT >> Acc on 27.01.2018 invlg SHC8019J & GW8098L [AIG] LKK
REF CC3/AIG18001894/K1hb3
Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Aileen,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and we have strict instruction from our
principal that both parties should be equally liable of the accident.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability, we will
withdraw any offer made previously and we propose for a global sum of $1,550.00 (all in) to settle your client’s
claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back to us for our principal to process payment.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi [mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 10 April, 2019 8:46 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A



Subject: [Reminder] [Counter Offer] AIG/LKK Ref: 41006705525G-003 CDGE Ref: T0118/SHC8019J/AT >> Acc on
27.01.2018 invlg SHC8019) & GWS8098L [AIG]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Ms Joy Irene
M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

We refer to subject matter resting with AlG's email dated 29 March 2019.

Please let us have your reply to our email of 14 March 2018 which contained our counter proposal to settle the
matter at a global sum of $$3,000.00.

Your early attention and reply is awaited. Thank you.

Best Regards

Aileen Tan

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 10:55

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Aileen Tan Lee Noi; Cecilia Lee Peng Geok; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GW8098L & SHC8019J On 27/01/2018 | 41006705525G-003

Hi Joy,
Kindly refer below and fyna please.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok [mailto:cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com]

Sent: 29 March 2019 10:47

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Cc: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: Accident Involving GW8098L & SHC8019J On 27/01/2018 | 41006705525SG-003
Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear Bernard



Our record shows we had counter proposed to LKK and pending their reply.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 10:29 AM

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: Accident Involving GW8098L & SHC8019J On 27/01/2018 | 41006705525SG-003

Dear Sir/Madam,
We are the insurer of Heng Choon Construction Pte Ltd (“Insured”) at the material time of the Accident.

We note that you are acting for COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, the owner of SHC8019J, in his claim
for damages (“Claim”) against the Auto Insurance Policy of our Insured as a result of the above Accident.

The Claim has been outstanding for more than 12 months. If we do not hear from you in writing within the
next 10 working day from the date of this email, we shall proceed to close our file.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
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printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]




