Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Zoie,

Received with thanks.

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 31 January, 2018 11:37 AM
account@kkimhin.com.sg

Admin A; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

RE: CONFLICTING DATE OF ACCIDENT - SJU4406 &SJB600)J
TP LOD.pdf

As spoken, kindly provide us LOD and workshop invoice with the correct DOA.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: account@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:account@kkimhin.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 31 January, 2018 11:32 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: CONFLICTING DATE OF ACCIDENT - SJU4406 &SJB600J

Hi,

As requested, a copy of addendum is attached.

Thanks & Regards,
Zoie



