Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Kian Meng <KianMeng.Chan@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 January, 2018 11:43 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: #6242495402SG003#027#FW: Conflicting Date of Accident - SJU4406H &

SJB600J *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG15019170/Kya3q2

Dear Mei Kwan / Jas,

Appreciate your kind assistance; Report is sent back.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Chan Kian Meng

AlG

Express Claims Adjuster I

SG Claims Operations | AlG Shared Services
Tel: 8001206556 | Ext 1012206

Kianmeng.chan@aig.com| www.aig.com

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 10:40 PM

To: Chan, Kian Meng; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: #62424954025G003#027#FW: Conflicting Date of Accident - SJU4406H & SIB600] *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G15019170/Kya3q2

Dear Kian Meng,

We refer to the above matter.

Please refer to the attached TP’s addendum form.

TP repairer will provide us the fresh LOD and invoice.
Kindly assist to send back adjuster report in Merimen.

We will proceed to settle the TP claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 31 January, 2018 11:17 AM



To: 'Chan, Kian Meng' <KianMeng.Chan@aig.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: #62424954025SG003#027#FW: Conflicting Date of Accident - SJU4406H & SJB600J *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG15019170/Kya3q2

Dear Kian Meng,

Thank you for your email.

We have contacted TP repairer and requested the accident scene photos taken during DOA.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Dear jas,

For your information and necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chan, Kian Meng [mailto:KianMeng.Chan@aig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January, 2018 5:04 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: #6242495402SG003#027#FW: Conflicting Date of Accident - SJU4406H & SJB600)

Good day LKK,

We refer to TP claim - 6242495402SG with DOA 08/11/2015, which used to have a discrepancy in DOA.

Now that there’s a confirmation on DOA, appreciate if you can assist to acquire new LOD and finalize this claim for
us to proceed with the TP claim.

Let me know if there’s anything | can help further as well; thank you for your kind attention.

Best regards,

Chan Kian Meng

AlIG

Express Claims Adjuster I

SG Claims Operations | AlG Shared Services
Tel: 8001206556 | Ext 1012206

Kianmeng.chan@aig.com | www.aig.com
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