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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uki Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ui Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo; 199607198 GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CS/GAI1BDD1853/T1vd3
15! CENTENNIAL TR
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 31-01-2018
SINGAPORE 039150
Code: GAIl
1z Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  FBC 5768T Veh. Inspected GBC 9808H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess () 0.00
Assign From KELWYMA NGIAN Assign Date 31/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre i
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at SEAH MOTOR TRADING CO
BLK 9 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-53 SINGAPORE 628481
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Bl 7d 7
- Consultants
Bl S = Py Lid Company Registration Mo, 199607188R

SLUBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL FARR, SINGAPORL S05933 TEL ; (065) 62563361 FAX : {065) 62564315

Your ref: PLEASE ADVISED
Our ref: CS/GALIBO01853/T1vd3 Date: 2/2/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.GBC 9908H

We thank you for your instruction on IW1/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
1/2/2018 at the premises of M/s SEAH MOTOR TRADING CO

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §%3,502.50

Revised Estimate Amount : 55244200

"Check” Items Amount 5%

Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage: i

The vehicle sustained damages at the -t
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 3:54 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna'; SUR; Sharon; Ng, Sharon

Subject: RE: CLMOMVMO00000180 : TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Dear Kelvyna,

Moted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 3:33 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Sharon
<sharon.ow@tlmotor.com.sg>; Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: CLMOMVMO00000180 : TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Hi Veron
Clm ref; CLMOMYMOOD000180

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, March 05, 2018 5:56 AM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna . Ngian@sg.gaig.coms>, SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>; Sharon <sharon.ow@timotor.com.sg>;

Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng(@sg gaig.com>
Subject: RE: TP survey: GBC9508H Insd:FBCS769T DOA 26.1.18

Dear Kelvyna/Sharon,

Kindly provides us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 9:18 AM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Dear Kelvyna,

Kindly provides us the claim number,

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 2:01 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Dear Kelvyna,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBC 9908H
Date of survey: 1/2/2018
Number of days: 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:47 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

2



From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:30 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Hi team
Please conduct TP survey

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Seah Motor [mailto:seahmtr@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 1:36 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: Re: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

LKK Auto Consultants

From: Nalan, Kelvyna
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 11:01 AM

To: seahmtr@singnet.com.sq
Subject: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
Our insured has not report, will arrange survey on WP basis.

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:-
1.  AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

P L.B.S. Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd

3.  Priority Services

4.  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5 LKK Auto Consultants

Please advise

Thanks & Best Regards,

Kelvyna Ngian

GREATAMERICAN,

INSURANCE COMPANY
Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190

M T Moody's Standard & Poor's
§ i) - A1 (Good) A+ [Strong)
Allrmaed b T8, 20035 At llarch 7 MW
h_— A+ (Superior)
Afrmmd May 17, Fo
For mare infermation on our financlal ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: MNgian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:30 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: TP survey. GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18
Attachments: 30012018172625-0001.pdf

Hi team

Please conduct TP survey

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Seah Motor [mailto:seahmtr@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 1:36 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: Re: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

LKK Auto Consultants

From: Ngian, Kelvyna
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 11:01 AM

To: seahmtri@singnet.com.sg
Subject: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
Our insured has not report, will arrange survey on WP basis.

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:-
1.  AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

2. LB.S. Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
3. Priority Services

4, RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5. LKK Auto Consultants

Please advise

Thanks & Best Regards,

Kelvyna Ngian

GREATAMERICAN,
INGURANCE COMPANY
Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190



AN, ' Moody's  Standard & Poor's
g i)) — : A1 {Good) A+ (Strong)

. Airmad Juw 1, 7005 Alfrmed e ! NS
\ A+ (Superior)

Asrmad May 12, 2006

For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments,

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. I vou are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited, If you recerve this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments,



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 February 2018 2:01 PM

To: ‘MNgian, Kelvyna’; 3UR

Subject: RE: TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18
Attachments: GBC 9908H PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Kelvyna,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBC 9308H
Date of survey: 1/2/2018
Number of days: 3 days

Best Regards,
amVeron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:47 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: TP survey: GBCI908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
P
a.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailm:KEh.r:gna.Ngian@sg.gaig,mm]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:30 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TP survey: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

Hi team
_Please conduct TP survey

Thanks
Kelvyna



From: Seah Motor [mailto:seahmtr@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 1:36 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: Re: GBCI908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18

LKk Auto Consultants

From: Naian, Kelvyna

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 11:01 AM

To: seahmtr@singnet.com.sg

Subject: GBC9908H Insd:FBC5769T DOA 26.1.18
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

Our insured has not report, will arrange survey on WP basis.

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:-
aml.  AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

2. L.B.S. Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
3. Priority Services

4.  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5. LKK Auto Consultants

Please advise

Thanks & Best Regards,

Kelvyna Ngian

GREATAMERICAN.,
INSLUAANCE COMPANY
. Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190

Moody's Standard & Poor’s
A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)

Afred Jorwt 157005 Atrwed March 10016

Atwmod May 11, 304

Eor mare information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

The contant of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not tha intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and Its attachments.

The content of this c-mail message and any atachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended salely for the addressee. 17 you are not the intended
. recipient, be advised thal any use, dissemination, distribution, o copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notity the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



MEATIRIYATED J Bng Ah Tee Moler & Panal Sarvice Pla Lid - Pionaer

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 20012016 1138
y SUBMETTED BY: [T Ba Canfirmiad)

MPORTANT NOTICE

(Draft)

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1, Please report correcily the detais of the accdent to speed up the claims [rocess

2. This Form mast ba

abdity.

4, The issue and accaptance of this Farm by Insurance companies is not an admission of policy liabilly on the parl of the insurance companies.

igad Dirivar,
3. Information provided must be as tnathiul and accurats as possible, Any wilkul misreprasentation of withalding of matesial facts may allow Insurance companies to repudiate pollicy

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

8. This repon will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapars (GLA) for srchiving and that copies

af tis repon will, for & fee, 0 made available upon appication by interested parlias,

7. By the lndgremant of this rapoert 10 e Insurers, you nerely consent 10 the archiving of this report at the centre and to coplas of the report baing rmade avallabe aforasaid,

Date Of Repon 20/01/2018 11:38
Date Of Acciden! 26/01/2018 17:00
Exact Location Of Accident BALESTIER RD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
ehicle Registrafion Mumber GECOS0EH

isured/Policyholder
Mame Of Ragistered Cwner
Co Reg No

85C VENDING SERVICES
53154283K

Email Address NOEMAIL
Mobile Phons No
Alternative Phone No Office-67628041
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer MISSAN
Model NWV350-2.5 D PANEL VAN (M)
Exact Purpose for which vehicle was baing used at time of
accident
Are you claiming yru:!er your awn Insurance policy for NO
repair to your vehicla?
If Mo, Please state action o be taken THIRD PARTY
Vahicle Categary GOODS VEHICLE
Insurance Company
.ame of Insurance Company CHIMNA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Flaat Policy WO
Policy Number DMCYSMN301 2781702
Cover Note Mumber
Drivar
Mame of Driver ANG HONG LEONG
MRIC No 87322163C
Date Of Birth 24/06M1973
Occupation OUTDOOR
Dale Of Driving Pass 24/08/1990
Driving Experience 27 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
Gandar MALE
Rabile Number (LOCAL) +65-967 18041
Fax NMumber
Contact Mumber
Ehall Address MNOEMAIL
Addrass BLK 32 MARSILING DRIVE #08-347

—— 730032



Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
R Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER
+ Vehicle Regisiration Number of Driver's Own Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

Ganeral Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
VWeather Conditions RAIMING
Road Surface WET

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle invalvad in this accident? MO

Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident’? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by ambulance? NO
VWas any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown parson(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. hc
lumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

\Was [he accidant reported to the police? N

if Yes Flease state which Police Station

Was nofice of intended Prosecution given? NG

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

ON 26/01/2018 @ ABT 1700HRS. IT WAS RAINING, | WAS TRAVELLING ALONG BALESTIER ROAD ON THE MIDDLE LANE. WHEN THE
VEHICLE IN FRONT OF ME STOP. | THEN STOF MY VEHICLE. AFTER | WAIT AROUND 1 MINUTE, SUDDENLY | FELT AN IMPACT FROM
BEHIND & FOUND THE THE MOTORBIKE FBCS7TEIT KNOCKED ONTO MY VEHICLE AT REAR. NO ONE WAS INJURED, THAT'S ALL.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for altachment? YES
Was thare any video captured by Car Camera? MO
Was thare any audio recorded? MO
| PTG LU ik i e L
"fghicle Registration Numbar FBCS788T
Vehicla Make/Model/Colour
Detalls Of Properties
Vahicle Calegory MOTORCYCLE
MName of Driver
MRIC/Fassport Mumoer
Contact Number
Addrass
Postoode
Insurance Company Mame
Mature Qf Damage
No. Of Passenger {Including Driver)
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Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature

Mame.
MRIC/FIN No.:



SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the daims process,
2. This Form must be the Policyholder and/or the Au Driver,

Infarmation provided must be as truthful and dccurate as possible, Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of materal
facts may allow Insurance companies to repudiate policy liabllity.

The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the Insurance
companies,

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance

Association of Singapore (G1A) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
Interested parties.

By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report belng made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

fa) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assaciation of Singapore (“GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal informatlon set out in this [form] and any other personal Infarmation
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Infermation to all insurer(s) who have Insured vehicle(s) Involved In this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the

Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i) processing, handling and/ar dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

{li) investigating the accident and/or my claims:
(1il) carrying out and/or dealing with my Instructions or responding to any enguiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the malling of correspondence, statements, invoices, reparts or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelapes/mall packages); and/for

(v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
"Purposes”)

{b) allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{c} my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes,

(d}  my Personal Informaticn will also be collected and used to complle claims history for the purpose of fraud detectlon,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

{e) theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared [ disclosed:

{i} toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencles as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(il) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

]

Palicyholder's Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: [If driver |5 not the pollcyheider) Mame:
Date & Time: MNRIC/FIN No.;

CHECK MY POLICY FOR MMORE DETA ILS.

L IAM AVWARED THATMY IN SURER MAY HAVE A 14 DAY S TIIEFRAN E FOR ME TO SUSH IT AN OWHN DA MAGE CLAIM UNDER MY OWHN POLICY. IMALL

R AT T o £l e W Y T - = r



SEAH MOTOR TRADING CO

BLK 9, PIONFER ROAD NORTH #01-53, SINGAPORE 628461
TEL:62660544, 62655865, 62664674, 62641601 FAX: 62619415
Specialise In Repairing All Kinds Of Motor Vehicles, Spray Painting,
Welding, And Agent To Claim Damages From The Motor Insurance

Email:iseahmtréésingnet.com.sg

Attn: Motor Claim Dept 29-Jan-18
Great American Insurance Company Date Of Ace. 26-Jan-18
3 Temasek Avenue Claim No. GBC9908H
#16-01 Centennial Tower Policy No. DMCVSN3012781702
Singapore 039190 Chasis No. INIMC2E26Z20001583
Contact : 6804-6000
rax: 6235-2616
Estimate Repair Bill For Vehicle No. GBC9908H / Nissan NV350
S/N DESCRIPTION-S/NETT ITEM QTY TOTAL
1 Rear Tail Boot 1pc b 5 1,742.00
2 Rear Bumper 1pc Y $ 60050
3 Rear reverse Sensor 1pc m”s 280.00%, /,:,,-‘
Total For §/Nett items $ 2 622 50
bo/s
Labour Charee & Miscellaneous Ilf “f““'
DESCRIPTION TOTAL
Labour charges to remove the affected parts & all g 380.00 300
revelant attachments & fiﬂ'ing}; to facilitate repairs;
knock-out, cut, heat/weld the necessary components
' including to panel beat & reshape affected areas; to
replace damaged components, reinstall and realign
the necessary parts; oo
To putty/ primer application and spray painting incl. S 500.00
touch-up affected areas with polyurethane paint; 12]14-40
2 rustproofing & cavities preservation to the replaced Foo
and repaired panels. /1474 ;:!,_e;;

Total For Material And Labour

w
Prepared by Emily/6265 5865
sor Seah Motor Trading Co

'ﬂ‘
ﬁ\ x\
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Encl. :
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the Repairer of the following:
JI an {hmnrafahﬂr Spray painting
- 'I'o play damaged panjs) dunng resurvey
2 raBESmation
:)]-h',r@[dmm 8 0N @ “Withou! Prajudice” bass
« No ilkegal modifications) is allowad
m'k‘ﬁ.ﬁﬁidﬁﬁﬂ&%ls; must be resurveyed sod

it subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowkedged by Repairer
Signature:

Diake:




y i LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
e e 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMFANY Ref : CS/GAI18001853/T1vd3n2
L
#16-01 CENTENMNIAL TOWER Dale: 08-03-2018
SINGAPORE 038190
Code: GAl
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBGC 5769T Veh. Inspected GBC 9908H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVMDD0000180 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KELVYNA NGIAN Assign Date o/ot/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  MISSAN NV350D c.c 2488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JN1MC2E26Z0001583 Colour WHITE
Odometer 133820 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195R15 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 MICHELIN B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195R15 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [195R15 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 Inspection Date 01/02/2018
Survey held at SEAH MOTOR TRADING CO
ELK 8 PIDNEER ROAD NORTH #01-53 SINGAPORE 628461
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdB BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Fage No.-1of1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBC 9908H

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Descriptio ndition
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAIL BOOT BENT 1,742.00 1,742.00
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 600.50 -
LABOUR
LESS 30% DISCOUNT - -522.60
2,342 50 1.219.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) MNOT MECESSARY 280.00 -
280.00 -
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE THE AFFECTED PARTS 380.00 300.00

& ALL REVELANT ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO
FACILITATE REPAIRS;KNOCK-OUT CUT HEAT/WELD THE
MECESSARY COMPONENTS INCLUDING TO PANEL BEAT
& RESHAPE AFFECTED AREAS.TO REPLACE DAMAGED
COMPONENTS REINSTALL AND REALIGN THE
NEGESSARY PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
REAR BUMPER.

TO PUTTY/PRIMER APPLICATION AND SPRAY PAINTING 500.00 400.00
INCL.TOUCH-UP AFFECTED AREAS WITH
POLYURETHANE PAINTRUSTPROOFING & CAVITIES
PRESERVATION TO THE REPLACED AND REPAIRED

PANELS.
880.00 700.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,502.50 1,919.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18001853/T1vd3nZ
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser




