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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ui Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
-..-*" = TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Ma: 1996071%8R GST Reg, No, 19-9807108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : CCB/CTI18001826/Uks3
?&Slgl?q%hts&ﬁ%m%ggmemoﬁ 079909 Paw: U0 I‘ ””'"Nl“"l"”” ml
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJN 94014 Veh. Inspected GED 7544G
Policy No. DMPCSN1008921707 Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D00565C05/1 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30/01/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer x Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
RfH Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5 General Information
Accident Date  27/01/2018 Inspection Date 30/0172018
Survey held at LBAAUTOMOTIVE PTE. LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#O2-47 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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¥ our ref: TBA Date: 31.01.2018
Our ref: CCa/CTITRO01826/Uks3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBD 75446
We refer to the above malter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 30.01.2018

al the premises of M/s LEA Automotive Pre Lid (Kaki Bukit) and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 8,750.84

Revised Estimate Amount : 88 6,.889.20

"Check" Items Amount P55 -

Market Value 185 -

LTA Reimbursement Value ] -

Nett Value ; 55 -

Description of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages at the :. L N
Front O/S Portion —

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6.0 days

Yours faithtully.

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Jul Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 9:571 AM

To: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd.

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: GBD 7544G ON 27.01.2018 / CHINA T, SJN 9401A
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the subject.

In the application of BOLA 28 (g), we will not be held liable to your client/ claimant owner of vehicle GBD 7544G.
There is no direct contact between our insured vehicle to your client’s vehicle.

In view of this, we are instructed by our principal to advise you to re-direct your claim to the insurer of vehicle FBC
25288,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.|t may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.|f you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



| 5hir'|ez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Angie Foo <angiefoo@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 2:25 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM18D00565C05/1 & YR REF: GBD7544G (TP : LKK REF -
CCR/CTINB001826/Uks3) on 27/01/2018

Attachments: SNM18D00565C01 20180308 TO INSURED -LKK ASSIGNMENT LTR.pdf;

MANC18014516-01-SIN9401A pdf

Dear Shirley,

Re-send

Thank. you

Regards

Angie Foo

Executive

Maotar Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Reoad #18-00

Springleal Tower

Singapore 078803

Co Reg No.200208384E

DID. 6385 6186

Fax 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email angie.foo@sg.cntaiping, com
Email claimsdeptifsg.cntaiping.com
Vebsite: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Angie Foo

Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 2:22 PM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Claims Dept of CTI; Zaini (LKK Auto)

Subject: OUR REF: SNM18D00565C05/1 & YR REF: GBD7544G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI118001826/Uks3) on
27/01/2018

Dear Shirley,
We refer to your email of 1% March 2018.

We attached our Insured’s and Third Party of 5AS Report and assignment letter for your necessary action.

Kindly take note, the claim handier for this case is Chong Boon Sen 6389 6171.

1



Thank you

Hegards

Angie Foo

Executive

Mator Division

Claims Depariment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #156-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co.Reg. No.200208384E

DID: 6388 6186

Fax: G224 7478/6224 7175

Email anale fopiEsg.cntaiping.com
Ermail claimsdept; cntaiping.com
Website, www.sg.cntaiping.com

| its contents 0o not canstitule a commiment by China Taping insurance (Singapore) Fle. Lid. except where provided for in 8
hina Taioing Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid Any unauthorized aisclasire. use or disseminglion. etherin whaole o
tanded recipient of the message. please nobiy the sender immedialaly,

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March, 2018 1:20 PM

To: Angie Foo

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIN9401A (O1 : CTI - TBA) AND GBD7544G (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18001826/Uks3) on 27/01/2018

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank yow.

Best Regards,;

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auta Cansultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-005% | email: ShirleyHiewi@Ikkauto.cormn | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 January 2018 4:42 PM

To: claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com; Chong Boon 5en <hoonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkaulo.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIN9401A (OI : CTI - TBA) AND GBD7544G (TP ; LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18001826/Uks3) on 27/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



We have inspected TP vehicle GBD 7544G at M/s LBA Automotive Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132,

To check availability of the case handler, yvou may contact the undersigned,

[hans you,

Best Regards

Shirley Hiew | admin

LKK Autc Consultants Pt Ltd

Phone: B366-0055 | email: ShirleyHisw@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Libi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://voww svmanteccloud.com
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1/29/2018

PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type:

Chwner |Dx:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.;

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value;
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Jan 2018

Company

A929K

GED7544G
Yes

29 Jan 2018
TOYOTA
DYNA ZOM
Silver

2014

1KD24654%5

KDY2318018040

£28,276.00
24 Apr 2015
24 Apr 2015
2

£1.414.00

$0.00

23 Apr 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$23,994.00
$17.363.00

$17,363.00

hitps:/ivrlta.gov.sg/iairlaction/enguireRebaleByPublicBefore Dereglnput PFUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner 1D Type:

Ohwmner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.;

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration
Date:

Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company

4929K

GBD75440G
Mo

30 Jan 2018

TOYOTA
DYNA3OM
Silver

2014
1KD2445495

KDY2318018040

$28,276.00
24 Apr 2015
24 Apr 2015
2

$1,414.00

Mo

40.00

23 Apr 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

423.996.00
$17,356.00

$17,356.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Jan 2018

oK

Page 1 of 2

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore DeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009... 30-Jan-18



Addendum Sheet Pg. 1

GEMERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE RECORADS MANAGEMENT CENTAE
' GENERAL & Raffbas Guay 81800 Singagare 092580

i INSURAMCE el [58) 62240010 Fax (55 6224 0030
 ASERCIATI DOperating Hours : Manday to Fridsy, 09:00=17.00

HECORDS MANAGELER CEXTAE UEM: SEESO0ONRG [ GST Neg, Mo, MEIGTITTIS

{a)

(B}

with wham you submitted the Original Report,

ADDENDUM

PARTICULARS OF PERSONMAKING THEAMENDMENTS:

Original ReportNo | _MAnL troiu €14 Vehicle Registration No: 200 Guv) P
Namess siownin hrig - 0w B ot NRIC/FIN/Passport No gq:;q__’,r.ggg L

{*Vehicle Driver { Wehicle Owner) (*} Please delete as appropriate

Leldress : Singapore|

A
Contact (Tel) 2 Mobile Na.:  EABISE

Emall Addrass

2300 110 1% bkosg

Date of Accident Time of Accident

Place of Accident = FER  Bedamerv  Rp  Tuewint T, blameY RD  Tuwotiol

Insurance Company: _CH9VE  Thndnul,

ADDITIOMNALINFORMATION fAMENDMENTS:

| have made a report an the above mentioned sccident and would like to include additional infarmation or
make the following amendments;

~d

— |
)
Folicyholder / Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signatu '
Date: Mame: ;
NRIC/FINMG.:
Cate:

Page 19 of 12



LBA AUTOMOTIVE PTE.LTD

NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-47
AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 417883
Tel : 6509 5521 / 65095524 Fax : 6509 5513

I'he Motor Claims Dept. l ESTIMATF
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD ;. 2/ W | DATE : 29.01,2018 7
3 ANSON ROAD VEHICLE NO : GBD7544G *
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER AL MAKE/MODEL  : TOYOTADYNA |
SINGAPORE 079909 A < ﬂ il ACC Df-EE N 27.01.2017
SIN9401A é ( ; f : o
PARTICULAR 22/ /,r UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 ! -
OTY ﬁﬂ-./akltf: ’4,@”“7_,“- S8 S$
LIST PRICE
1 1 FRT WINDSCREEN RUBBER 297.40 A 29740
2 1 FRT PANEL 1,100.30 ‘5-#{5 » 110030 _—
3 1 FRT PANEL STICKER 'DYNA' 74.10 ¢ 7310 __—
4 1 FRT PANEL CENTRE GARNISH 25845 11 258.45
5 1 FRTGRILLE 517.45 (~e 51745 __—
6 1 FRT GRILLE EMBLEM 'LOGO’ 85.90 nAe 3590 —
7 1 FRT GRILLE RUBBER SEAL 10320 7T2--= 10320 —/
8 1 FRT CORNER PANEL RH 330.45 oD 33045 __—
4 1 FRT CORNER GARNISH RH (BOTTOM) 99.85 St 99 .85 —
10 1 FRT CORNER GARNISH RH (TOP) 23060 T~ 230.605/
11 1 FRT HEADLAMP RH 868.00 “S-1o  868.00 —
12 1 FRTHEADLAMP LOWER RUBBER RH 3530 Te-a4 3530 —
13 1 FRT BUMPER 75590 Tw~; 75590 —
14 2 FRT BUMPER BRACKET RH/LH 161.45 A = 322,90
15 1 FRT BUMPER FOG LAMP RH 310.40 “ 4 310.40
16 1 FRT BUMPER FOG LAMPO COVER RH 12740 Sed 12740 2
17 1 FRT DOOR RH 1,528.70 2/Antf 152870 _—
18 1  FRT DOGR TOP HINGE RH 115.30 doery 11530 —
19 1 FRTDOOR RUBBER 198.05 ﬂ.&f_ 198.05 ‘__..--"
20 1 FRT DOOR SIGNAL LAMP 88.30 ere 88.30 _—
21 1 CHASSIS FRONT CROSSMEMBER 426.50 ¥l 426.50
tku"{ 7,874.45
LESS 25% ¥yl 1,968.61
: 5,905.84
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 1 FRT DOOR LETTERING STICKER 25.00 Aee 2500 -
LABOUR CHARGES :
i TO KNOCK OUT DENT, CUT/WELD FRONT PANEL, FRONT CHASSIS CENTRE CROSS 9003 1,000.00
MEMBER AND REPLACE ACCIDEN PARTS
2 TO SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT PORTION ?c?._j 1,200.00
3 TO CHECK WIRING 20 30.00
4 TO REMOVE, REFIX WINDSCREEN & . 12000
5 TO REMOVE, REFIX DASHBOARD /& o 28000
6 TO REMOVE, REFIX AIR CON BLOWER AND REFILL GAS /0o 10000
7 TO TUFF KOTE £ 90.00
2,820.00
PR
ESTIMATE PARTS AND LABOUR GRAND TOTAL: & 8,750.84



¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

.'H‘. :; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 100607108R GE5T Reg. Mo. 10-0607168-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : CCGB/CTI18001826/Uja3n2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Doy (SR ” ‘ININ”"IIHM m
Code: CTI
;1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJN 94014 Veh. Inspected GBD 75440
Policy No. DMPCSNM1006921707 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18000565C05/1/LKKDS Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30012018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYNA (M) c.c 2082
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KDY2318018040 Colour SILVER
Odometer 130783 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15 CONDOR B mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 CONDOR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [165R13 (D) CONDOR B/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |165R13 (D) CONDOR B/6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/01/2018 Inspection Date 30v01/2018
Survey held at LBEA AUTOMOTIVE PTE. LTD.
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#02-47 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT OM REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 7544G

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Lbi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

Page No.:1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {;}} l*J]

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRT WINDSCREEN RUBBER NECESSARY 297 40 297.40
1|FRT PANEL BADLY DENTED 1,100.30 1,100.20
1|FRT PANEL STICKER "DYNA" NECESSARY 74.10 74.10
1|FRT PANEL CENTRE GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 258.45 -
1|FRT GRILLE CRACKED 517.45 517.45
1|FRT GRILLE EMBLEM "LOGO" NECESSARY 85.890 85.90
1|FRT GRILLE RUBBER SEAL TORN 103.20 103.20
1|FRT CORNER PANEL RH DENTED 330.45 330.45
1|FRT CORNER GARNISH RH (BOTTOM) CRACKED 99.85 89.85
1|FRT CORNER GARNISH RH (TOP}) NOT NECESSARY 230.60 -
1|FRT HEADLAMP RH BROKEN 868.00 868.00
1|FRT HEADLAMP LOWER RUBBER RH TORN 35.30 35.30
1|FRT BUMPER TWISTED 755.90 755.90
2|FRT BUMPER BRACKET RH/ILH @%$161.45 NOT NECESSARY 322.90 -
1|FRT BUMPER FOG LAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 310.40 -
1|FRT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER RH SCRATCHED 127.40 127.40
1|FRT DOOR RH DENTED / BENT 1,528.70 1,528.70
1|FRT DOOR TOP HINGE RH BENT 115.30 115.30
1|FRT DOOR RUBBER NECESSARY 198.05 198.05
1|FRT DOOR SIGNAL LAMP CRACKED 88.30 88.30
1|CHASSIS FRONT CROSSMEMBER TO REPAIR SEE 426.50 -

LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,968 61 -1,581.40
5,905 84 4,744 20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|FRT DOOR LETTERING STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 25.00 25.00
25.00 25.00
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LABOUR
TO KNOCK OUT DENT,CUT/MWELD FRONT PANEL FRONT 1,000.00 800.00

CHASSIS CENTRE CROSS MEMBER AND REPLACE
ACCIDENT PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REFAIR OF
CHASSIS FRONT CROSSMEMBER.

TO SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT PORTION. 1,200.00 S00.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 30.00 20.00
TO REMOVE, REFIX WINDSCREEN. 120.00 60.00
TO REMOVE,REFIX DASHBOARD 280.00 160.00
TO REMOVE,REFIX AIR CON BLOWER AND REFILL GAS. 100.00 100.00
TOTUFF KOTE 80.00 80.00

2,820.00 2,120.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,750.84 6,889.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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