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\um Reporting lir {141}
Non- -Reporting Hr ( 2nd):

DATE/ PIC

Non-Heporting l (Fanalj
Maodification b (it no n_-_su-.l_m;r:

Call O ST EM;L
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Final Repair Hill:

|Cir Rental Invoice:

T owing I:|1.|u.|.;

!'T"L L1I.-\

‘.1.|:'-:|||..J; Bill
i

mickgle Reju.-cl Instruction

Payvment Breakdown Form

|
PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Illll\li/ Sent By: Wn\

Post=-Repair Photos:

]ﬂ.DNDUID*\IM\
pDHDDDDDD°HDUL_

s

FINALIZATION DateTime: Confirm with: Conlinm by

Repair Cost: 55 . i days) R{.dULiI{II’I o LEmail l_.l'ﬁ"” I:I__
FINAL SETTLEMENT  DatefTime: || K18  Confirm with {4 ¢ l [ &~ Email| | Calll

Final Liability |7 (DO - (Apreed / Assessed) BOLA S/N No. ¢ | s- [t NO or B 28, Asy. Lia:

Repair Cost: |55 3":"'* E* = _-rql'-':!'_

Toss ol Kental (LOK ) |55 55 Ty g q.5 days) ‘:f 15 It

Lowss of Use {LOLY |55 2 15.-00 {S 5(} a 4. 51.11\~I

Liss of Tncome (LOL). 53 days}

LOR only [ ] LOUonly [__JLOR +1 OL Ij LOR + LOI [__] (Tick only one]

GIA/LTA Scarch |ss 5.59 _

sedical: 55 |13 Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Misbursemnent :h& (e.g. Tow! Independent ) .2} Repon Format: |

Legal Cost 55 3 Survey fee:

Tnial:

5% H'-I-E-ﬂ'-?l‘ Global Sum 55: 4 4 60 . oD

FINAL PAYMENT

DateTime: Confirm with:

Emait | Calil

Payet 1
Payee 2: (Steike ifNAY
Payvee 3: (Stnke il NLA

|55 I{-L[ ﬁn-ﬂﬂ' Name |
|85 Mamie 2: |
55 Name 3

C(OMEORTDELGRD ENMINEERING PTE LTD
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Ma: 199807198R GST Reg. Mo 19-9B07198-R

C- a e i .=

i BA &

Affiliated to Eederation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) FTELTD Ref : CC3/CTI18001823/K1ub3
g?&ﬁ%ﬂ;&ﬁ%ﬁ;ggmmm% 079909 Date: 30-01-2018 Mlm‘ml\lmnm”‘l
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG 25447 Veh. Inspected SHC 72472
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 Inspection Date 28/01/2018

Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD

50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508569

Ba. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




ST AN T 1 #0223 Ay A TREINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 208933 TE]
Yourref: To Be Advised
Our ref: CO3/CTHEODIE23/K lub3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8) PTELTD

Dear SitMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above
at the premises of M/s Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd and have

Company Reglatration No, 198607 198R

S 62503501 FANX SRS n2E64315
Date: 30.01.2018
SHC72477.

mentioned vehicle on 29.01.2018
the following o report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8% 3,936.40
Revised Estimate Amount M 3,527.92
"Check” Items Amount L35 32.64
Market Value 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value ' 8% -
MNett Value o ] -

Description of Damage: - o =
The vehicle sustained damages at the i I y
N/S Front Portion T

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3

L

days

Y ours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

R ————

From: Lucas Lee <lucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 February 2018 2:48 PM

To: Shu Pei [LKKAuto)

Cc: Chong Boon Sen

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG2544Z (O : CTI - SNM18D00529) and
SHC7247Z (TP ; LKK REF - CC3/CTI1B001823/K1ub3 ) on 26.01.2018

Attachments: leeSZ_SNM180D00529C02-GBG2544Z-LKKDirectSettlementAccidentLtr CLCR95.259.pdf,

MEKH18014304-01-GBG2544Z pdf

Dear Shu Pei,

Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Chong Boon 5en

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3, Anson Road, #16-8@

Springleaf Tower,

Singapore 879989

Co. Reg. No, 2002883B4E

DID: 6389 6lB1

Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdeptiisg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January, 2018 5:31 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Admin A; Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG2544Z (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHC7247Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18001823/K1ub3 ) on 26.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Boon Sen,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 7247Z at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte
Ltd {Loyang).



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
¥ TP's GIA report
. Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0065 | email: shupei@lkkauto com | fax6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4085933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service,
For more information please visit hiip://www symanteccloud.com
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CHEAE REKFRE R BRAT]

CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

wcn Read #156-00 Spewgles! Towest Smghpoie 0700

CHINA TAIPING

Our Reference: SNM18D00529/C02/7

Date . 01 FEBRUARY 2018 via Ordinary & Registerad Mail
WENG'S PLUMBING & SANITARY CONTRACTOR

BLK 204 PASIR RIS STREET 21

#04-310
SINGAPORE 510204

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG2544Z AND SHCT7247Z ON 26 JANUARY 2018
ALONG UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Flease be advised that the third party vehicle, SHC7247Z , is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.
Yours truly,
Claims Department
(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)
CC : LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd
Attr THIN THIN
Ref CC3/CTIBO01823/K1UBS

Contact No © 68412360
via Email THINTHIN@LKKAUTO.COM

CC : Agent - (ANDSE9A) - TONG HAK POH

FO1/LKKDS-2013



COMFORIDELCRO
ENGINEERING

ComiortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

A membar of COMFORIDELGRO 2 5 Pl HO0d St ES00d0e G Dl Az * igaparn a9si
- Date/Time:™ 27, 012018709: 06 Fage : 1
Team:  ARC Repair TP(CFS0)1 JOB CARD :-1.: cvier JCNOJIT511100
‘CUSTOMER ' REGNNO. MILEAGE
SHCT2477
MH."MB C 1 T -il '-:-.“'J'_El PT 5 L r_rI.' . ELEL
CUSTOMER MO, 1010070 HYUNDAI SRS 7 I
e F = e = o s TN H !
appresg 363 SIN MING DRIVE MODEL DATE/TIVE IN
Singapore SINGAFCRE 5785717 I-40 26]01,. 2018 14:5
TEL @ C0230118E Q) YROFMANU. TARGET DATE
= 11.08. 20186
CHASSIS CODE | comeLEnoN DATET
DISCOUNT GARD NO, KMHLB41UMGUOSZ2627
BO TION
Myccident Date: 2o.01.2018
WwATURE: 3P 26.01.18
=2/ NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
-~
CHECKED & PASSED OUT BY:
SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
%
Acknowlsdgement Slip | Exit Pass
Marme;
VG Nos | Vehicle No.:
Wiehicie beo.; SHCT THINA LEF ' SHCTZ4A7E

Elgnatirs/Date



CITYCAB PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

= A

C WL

VEHICLENO @ SHC 72472 DATE 1/27/2018 10:18 =
MAKE X i
MODEL : HYUNDAI i40 bt
| Qty Parts Description/ Labour - Type __Unit Price Amount
Front Bumper Cover = 5-1,052.20
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) b 5 12240
Front Bumper Retainer (LH) 7 s \9.20
Headlamp (LH) — S5 1,388.00
Front Fender (LH} = $ -~ 619.00
Eront Fender Shield (LH) < $ 2 169.80
Front Fender Retainer (LH) B $1 920
Front Wheel Hub Cap (LH) — $ ~ 150.70
SUB TOTAL $ 3,420.50
LESS 20% S 684.10
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 2,736.40
Front Fender Advertisement Logo (LH) = $  100.00 |Nett
S 100.00
Labour Charge Yoo =
Panel Beating S 56000 | P
Spray Painting Charge 5 4,09:1]'0" fo
Wiring Charge S 308072
Tuff Kote S 5080 L
FRT Wheel Alignment S gu,ea"a'a
TOTAL LABOUR 5 1,120.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 3,956.40
. N/
S 2 renk
]
_-_-____'_'_'—'—u
ﬂ‘fﬂ.«” /"‘*2’4 7 /L # notify
Atkiadix |
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of t agéféérvéhicle.The final repair quantum will
| be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surve npos the insurance company




i LY EVi
CITYCAB PTE LTD C iﬂM&W
REPAIR ESTIMATE* Y
VEHICLEND  : SHC 72471 DATE 1/27/2018 10:18
MAKE ‘] %
MODEL : HYUNDAI i40 :
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Unit Price Amount
:_—=:=_"_—_
Front Bumper Cover =~ ¢ 1,052.20
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) s s 22.40
Front Bumper Retainer (LH) ¢ Call s 9.20
Headlamp (H], »=— % $ 1,388.00
Front Fender (LH) < fut B 5 619.00 |-
Front Fender Shield (LH) X S 169.80
Front Fender Retainer (LH) = rf 5 9.20
Front Wheel Hub Cap (LH) — hr $ 15070
SUB TOTAL $ 3,420.50
LESS 20% 5 684.10
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 2,736.40
Eront Fender Advertisement Logo (LH) /S(J““ $  100.00 |Nett
$  100.00
Labour Charge Yo
Panel Beating S 5,59:00'"'}
Spray Painting Charge $ 40000 fo
Wiring Charge 5 30802
Tuff Kote 5 5086 2e
ERT Wheel Alignment 5 !;B'G‘B"ﬁ‘o
TOTAL LABOUR $ 1,120.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 3,956.40
/ 2 9)cf€ ro2e ke
4 /v;rr
/“ZZHA,J uhtants hence notify
ihe followina:
& ND
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspectign q{mg*a,t_:ggg-:q.ehME.The final repair guanturn will
|_ he prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motdr Sw;a1}puanted by the insurance cCOMpPany. J
Date: .




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANTY - THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGHN NO
ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTELTD MILEAGE
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 573717 MODEL
(5551188 DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

JOB / PARTS DESCRIFTION

Date: 30.01.201%
Time; 19:23:08
Page: |

305111007
SHCT72472
0000000000
HYUNDAI

1-40

11.08.2016
26.01.2018 14:50
26.01.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-2202-G
Q002 04-01-0103-0781-A

0003 04-01-0103-0574-G

[40V3 COVER-FR BUMPER# 1

[40V2 LAMP ASSY-HEAD LH# 1

[40VC PANEL-FENDER LH# 1

1,052.20 2000 B841.76
1,388.00 20.00 1,110.40

619.00 20,00 495.20

0004 04-01-0103-0658-G  [40VC CAP ASSY-WHEEL HUB 1 150,70 20.00 120.56
SUB-TOTAL

JOB NATURE

0000 L PANEL BEATING 400.00

0001 L SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 360,00

0002 L WIRING CHARGE 20,00

0003 L TUFF KOTE 20.00

0004 L FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT 60,00

SUB-TOTAL

1 2,567.92

B60.00



COMFORTDFLGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER; 7010070

ADDRESS : CITYCAB FPTE LTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
65551188

JOB / PARTS DESCRIFTION

Date:; 30012018

[ime: 19:23:08

Page: 2

JOB NO

REGN NO
MILEAGE

MAKE

MODEL

DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

TOTAL

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE : DATE ;

. N AUTHORISED : YES/ NO
SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE

3427.91

305111007
SHC7247Z
0000000000
HYUNDAI

[-40

11.08.2016
26.01.2018 14:30
26.01.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref No ; 305111007
ComfortDelGra Engineering Pe Lig
Date 30.01.2018 59 Loyang Drive Sii'ngapom EO0SED
Fax B546 B1506
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Atin KALVIN
Vehicle Reg No. SHCT247Z Date of Accident . 26.01.2018
The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-
1 The repair job shall bl to: CHINA - GBG25442
2 The finalized amount shall be:
(a})  Spare Pars after List discount %2 567.02
{b)  Labour Charges $860.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $3.427.82
e Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: 20% $0.00
Final Lumpsum Repair cost
3 Estimated normal pericd for repairs: 3 working days.
4. We shall treat the above amount as Co 'gu:t and Confirmed if there iz no reply from you within
T working days i,
&, Thank you for your assistance. _a":_/ : We confirm the estimates and
V4 finalized amount
-{w__ {,:/.:L/ /
Signature : i/ Signature :
MName FAUZY MName K‘J{"L
Tel 62148319 Date 2.8
Fax B5468156
For Official Use Onl
Document
Item Amount Attached {CS:Imﬁ;r; rBe!; Remarks
Yas of No -
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paid M
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fee
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
& Owverrun

Remarks:




Addendum Sheet Pg. 1

; GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL & Ralfles Cuay W1E-00 Sngapore Q48580

INSURANCE  7¢(65)6224 0010 Fax {65} 6224 0030
ASECCIATION Operaling Hours © Monday to Friday, 09:00 - 17:00

AECORDS MANADEMENT CENTRE UEN: SEESS0020G / GST Reg. Mo M4ODp01 7715

IMPORTANT NOTE: Please submit the completed Addendum form to the same Authorised Reporting Centre
with whom you submitted the Original Report.

ADDENDUM

{A) PARTICULARS OF PERSOMN MAKING THEAMENDMENTS:
Original Repart Mo : 'THL’EH IE%ILE";T:\{ Wehicle Registration No: é?g{r'l 3"':-'11“-{"1
MNarmneias shownin NRIC): LU"\ |30 X5 A MRIC/FIN/Passportio : (:(il | | F] YLF‘F} j

=4
{ ‘Vehlcle@gﬁf Vehicle Owner) (*) Please delete as appropriate

Address : Singapore| !
H A 24
Contact {Tel) ; Mobile Mo, ?{3%?‘ :'?‘-" 12

Emall Address

Date of Accident - A ||r"l'~q‘] Time of Accident - thity Hee

Place of Accident U b LL‘\(;{V- Chocad Rﬁ’“‘r‘k— .

Insurance Company : [/ln.,ﬁ\{fn\ _TL»._‘?—._;E

{B) ADDITIONALINFORMATION / AMENDMENTS:

| have made a repart on the above mentioned accident and would like toinclude additional information or
make the following amendments;

1@1«(1 u-C(J_{l 5 1_-.’_,2_3.(1'” P L;.E{-Lx. {‘ﬁmmn,gj ! !.,w? % E‘lfﬁm :

3

dl,vk L [t Y ?‘WL L =
Policyhalder f Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
[ate A Mame: .
?ﬁ f"[l'k" MAIC/EIMN Mo ::_:';"E(l { 1‘?
Date:

Page 12 of 12



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Me. 19-9507198-R

“Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Ref :
Date: 01-06-2018
Code: CTI

CCCTIB001623/K1ub3n2

AR

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. GBG 25442 Veh. Inspected SHC 72472
Policy No. DMCVSN1747031700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D00529/C02/7 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 20/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUO092627 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 222674 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 205/60 R16 HAMNKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 HANKOOK 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 Inspection Date 29/01/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
ByIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




1Vl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 193607 186R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0607108-R Page No.:1of1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 7247Z
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | ESETae B “J}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER DEFORMED 1,052.20 1,052.20
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TCP (LH) SERVICEABLE 22.40 -
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER (LH} SERVICEABLE 9.20
1|HEADLAMP {LH) CRACKED 1,388.00 1,388.00
1|FRONT FENDER (LH) DENTED 619.00 619.00
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD {LH} SERVICEABLE 168.80 -
1|FRONT FENDER RETAINER (LH) SERVICEABLE 9.20
1|FRONT WHEEL HUB CAP (LH} GRAZED 150.70 150.70
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -G584,10 641,98
2.736.40 256792
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
100.00 -
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING. 560.00 400,00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 400.00 360.00
WIRING CHARGE., 30.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE 50.00 20.00
FRT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. a0.00 &0.00
1,120.00 B60.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,956.40 3,427.92

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS

’f

3,427.92|

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18001823/K1ub3n2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN

Automotive Assessor [ Investigator

ISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use ard Denalil of the Climnd nasmed on the front page of this Report.

v

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor




