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COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Our Jub Ref N : 305111471
o ComterDelGro Enginearing Pia Lid
Crate : 01/02/18 59 Loyang Drive. Singapars SO806D
SE— — = Fax' 6546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax
Attn - KALVIN ANG
Vehicle Regho. : SHBGT11L Date of Accident 26-Jan-18

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicie are as Tollows:-

1. The repair job shall bill to: EQ INS - FBB4561L

2, The finalized amount shall ba:
(8) Spare Parts after List discount
(b} Labour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cast

(e.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)

Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:  20% $3.350.00
Final Lumpsum Repair cost $3,350.00

3 Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 working days.
4 We shall treat the above amount as Comect and Confirmed if there is no reply from you

within 7 working days
5 Thank you for your assistance. Wea confirm the estimates-and

finalized amaunt
Ly

Signature : Signatura

Mame : LIMTS Name KALVIN

Tel 62148398 Date 21/

Fax 65468156
For Official Use Only

Document .
ltem Amount Attached | Gonfirm By Remarks
(Signature)
Yies or No
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Pald
4. LTA Search Fee
5, Medical Fees (on bahalf
of driver, if applicable)

6 Overrun

Remarks:




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD EG

1€

B MV oL

e

: 7 = e
REPAIR ESTIMATE* ’
VEHICLENO : SHB 6711L DATE 29/1/2018 15:21 [

MAKE H ‘ k
MODEL : MERCEDES BENZ VIANO (REAR) t: Kf ""br (A .
Qt;v Parts Dezcrigtiunf Labour Ty ype Unit Price Amount

Bumper R/H Side, RR. " $ 473.60

Tail Lamp Lower Garnish, RH X7¥ ;J'L $ 61.90

Tail Lamp Reflector Upper, RH -~ 2 ] 105.74

Rear Fender (RH) -~ ﬂa—f b 3.188.00

Rear Fender Protector (RH) x &~ 5 | 56.48

SUB TOTAL § | 388572

LESS 20% $ 777.14

DISCOUNTED TOTAL % 3,108.58

|
Labour Charge foo

Panel Beating 8 I/Dﬂﬁﬁfll

Spray Pamting Charge 5 SO
Wiring Charge $ S0
Tulf Kote & S0
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear 5 |36 |
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass (sealant) b Liﬁ"ﬂ'ﬂ'-
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor 5 1;.!_';!..&-3"
Rear Wheel Alignment ! 1 20-617]

TOTAL LABOUR % 2,140.00

ESTIMATE TOTAL 5 5,248.58

s

K// }?//fap I’T‘H’és-

3 /tﬁ 5
L)’
A By

[u fings appr

LKK A;m Consultants hence notffy

the Repairer of the following:

o To reafirvey baleslyhes Speay painting

» To diiglay damaged parip) dur iy resujvay

* Pans frioes aire dublect o confivmation

* Therd darty surs n # “Without Prngedice” &

* bt il moafoaton(s) s a%owed

& Sucallmentan e mest b e il et
lgsu el nort lnsuran 1

paged by Aopaimar

|':

This 15 an wihin] estimate based on s visual mispection of the abova vehicle: The [ual reparr quantum wall

be prepared after the vehicle s surveyed by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

————— e — e i

From: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 11:46 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Vivian Lau (LKKAuUto); Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuta); Janet Tan

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FBB4561L (OI : CTI - DM18HOO00556 )
AND SHB6711L (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI18001809/K1ja3) on 26/01/2018

Attachments: FBB4561L 26.01.2018.PDF

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mel Kwan,
Qur insured's report Is attached,
Regards,

Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

-

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 Tr———
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 EI
wWwWw.eginsurance.com.sg

[ —
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, June 22, 2018 11:15 AM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<loylrene@lkkauto.com>; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FEB4561L (OI : CTI - DM18HOO00556 ) AND SHB6711L (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/EQI18001809/K1ja3) on 26/01/2018

Dear Sir /Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report far our
necessary action,

Thank vou.
Best Regards,



From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March, 2018 5:20 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FBB4561L (O : CTI - DM18HO00556 ) AND SHB6711L (TP : LKK

REF - CC3/EQ)118001809/K1ja3) on 26/01/2018

Dear Mei Kwan
We refer to the above claim reference.
Our insured has yet lodge the GIA report.

Traffic Police has yet release his bike from TP compound.
In the meantime, can you kindly request and forward us video footage from SHBE711L.

Thank You.

Regards,
Lyvnn Ahmad

Executive | Claims

egnsurance

EQ Insurance Company Limited

P Ragd w1200 Tower Block MND Comples Singapore D610
did 65 &496 9881 | tel 656223 9433 ext 881 | fax 65 6223 4390
W SIS UTANCE COM S,
~.‘ A Mormber of Coynate (@_-}ﬁf I||I¢(.II'UP mt (o] :F'rlﬁr'rd

Frivilegedy/Confidential information may be confaired in thic messoge. (f vou gre nat the intended recipicnf, please natify the sender immedigtely ond delete ot copes af it

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 6, 2018 10:31 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FBB4561L (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SHB6711L (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI18001809/K1ja3) on 26/01/2018

Dear Lynn,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MejiKwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

3



DMFORT i LU | Kk
ENGINEERING
¢ of COMFORICILLCAD Date/Time: 29.01.2018 14:04  Page : 1
am: ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD sales Order: JCNo305111471
MER ' REGN NG a1 MILEAGE
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD R ey
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; 83 8IN MING DRIVE et meel
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R 555‘}3? 55 ) YR OF Wlb* 2{114 TARGET DATE
] s
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JOB DESCRIPTION
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KED & PASSED OUT BY.
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

o

REPAIR ESTIMATE®
VEHICLE NO : SHB 6711L

MAKE
MODEL

: MERCEDES BENZ VIANO (REAR)

L; C

DATE

Ly

29/1/2018 15:21

l‘* 5‘-{".4 v

ot

Parts Dnsnrigﬁnnf Labour

Bumper R/H Side, RR R A
Tail Lamp Lower Gamnish, RH X Hr"""
Tail Lamp Reflector Upper, RH —

Rear Fender (RH) -~
Rear Fender Protector (RH)
SUB TOTAL
LESS 20%%
DISCOUNTED TOTAL

Labour Charge

Panel Beating

Spray Painting Charge

Wiring Charge

Tuff Kote

Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear
Remove/Refix Rear Windsereen Glass (sealant)
Remove/Retix Reverse Sensor

Rear Wheel Alignment

TOTAL LABOUR

ESTIMATE TOTAL
K o5 1C—K

/ lq//fa" f‘:’ﬂirﬁ
3 /ﬁ?d

L
y s Yy p L

Type

Unit Price

Amount
5 473,60
5 61.90
b 115.74
& 3,188.00
5 56,48
$ 3.885.72
% 777.14
$ 3.108.58
boo
$ | 00
8 M Jt
% 30 24
b3 50607 2.
g ljﬂ:(ﬂr.ﬁ
s 15000
5 1;},],0&"4*
S 120007 X
% 2,140.00
S 5,248.58

LEK Auto Consultants b
Iha Repairpr of if ]

« T trasyry oo

Signalyne:
Dala:

ACkniwisdnai

nsultants hence nolify
raf the following:
Bfora’a e soray | ARG
- 1 WHINg FESUrgY
] i 1 F 10
whd

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




" [ Auto
- - . Gﬂn!lﬂbn‘fﬁ |
s BmE B Pie Lid Company Registration No. 1!5&1:7"“!!

51 UBIAVE 1, #12-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 308933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: TBA
Our ref: CC3/EQIISD01809/K 1ja3 Date: 31.01.2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHE 6711L

We refer (o the above malter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 29.01 Eﬁl 8

at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid (Loyang) and have the following to rcp(?n:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : 8% 5.248.58
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 4,183.87
"Check" Items Amount : 8% -
Market Value : S% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S% -
Nett Value : §% -

Description of Damage: i
The vehicle sustained damages at the
/S Rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

KEALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



TITR20E Status of Driving Licence

# e-Services (/content/policehubhome/homepage.html) Log in %

Status of Driving Licence

Qualified Driving Licence

Qualified Driving Licence Number
S59431073C

Status of Qualified Driving Licence
Valid

Class(es) of Qualified Driving Licence
2428

Expiry Date

Valid for lite unless revoked,suspended or disqualified
Provisional Driving Licence

Provisional Driving Licence Number
59431073C
Status of Provisional Driving Licence

Expired (Click here for explanation)

Claceiact af Draviecinnal Nrivina | irancra

HOME (hitps://'www.police.gov.sg/)

ABOUT US (hitps:/fwww, police. gov.sg/aboul-us)

SGSECURE (https://www.police.gov.sg/sgsecure)

|-WITNESS (htips://www.police.gov.sgfiwitness)

COMMUNITY PROGRAMMES (hitps://www.police.gov.sg/community-programme)
RESOURCES (https:/f'www.police.gov.sg/resources)

NEWS & PUBLICATIONS (https://www.police.gov.sg/news-and-publications)
JOIN US (hitps:/fwww_police.qov sg/oin-us)

FAQS (hitps://va.ecitizen gov.sg/cip/CuslomerPages/SPF/explorefaq.aspx)
CONTACT US (https:/www.police.gov.sg/content/contact-us)

E-FEEDBACK [/content/policehubefesdback/efeedback. htmi)

SITEMAP (https://www.police.gov.sg/sitemap)

hnps:.f.fes:aruiaas.pnnce.guv.sgfmnlmﬁpulimhubhﬂrrua-.n’hnrnapage.fehquiryfstatuwf—drwmg-llcanl:&.hlmF



TATIR08 Stalus of Driving Licence

Privacy Statement (hitps://www.police.gov.sg/content/privacy-statement) | Terms of Use
(hittps://www.palice.gov.sg/contentiterms-of-use) . © 2018 Singapore Police Force. A Member of The Home Team
*(https:hwww.mha.gov.sg).

hiips #esarvices.police. gov.sg/contentpolicehubhome/homepage/enguiry/siatus-of-driving-llcence. him|

22



[%j Oref TO118/SHB6711L/jw

Jim Weng See Pah  to; Joylrene O5/04/2018 11:57 AM
Fraim Jim Wong See Pah/cdge/delgronotes
Tar Joylrene@|kkauto.com
Dear loy

We refer the attached mail of 19.03.2018.

We further attached police Investigation result whereby action taken against your client,
together with video footage.

Look forward your favourable reply soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Jim Wong

Claims Department / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 62148374 / Fax: 62141843

& x A

img-=405112030-0001.pdl imiz-405112016-0001 pat SHBET11L VC (TS).avi



COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref . T0118/ SHBB711L [JW(st) ENGINEERING
Your ref : . ’ o .
Date 12-Feb-18 COGETaxiCINMS DSBS meeien Fome) S b
58 Layang Drive 4th Fir B |
EQ Insurance Company Limited Singapore 508568 Pioatiurindir i :
5 Maxwell Road, MND Complex s cdtia
#17-00 Tower Block g
Singapore 069110 Workshops
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE S8 B ‘f"
Dear Sir o E o
Loyang
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHB6711L YOUR INSURED FBB4561L Sinnapare ROADRS
AND OTHER ON 26.01.18 Sip :rrlll'l:_'q:

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor f

Vehicle No: SHB6711L which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured 45 Pa :j Road
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to 2l is
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters I f"'.“'
arising from the damage to the vehicle. A o

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving FBB4561L : Sery -‘I];'_'-'m
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants. ey rF' N
TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM  Sungs: Kadyt Way
1 Cost of Repair $ 3,584.50 Singpore {2679)
2 3 dayslossofRental@ _$ 160.31 perday § AADH3 e vibin Tt
3 Survey Report Fees [Surveyed by Mis LKK) $ - Singapore {68

4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.489

5 GIA/ Police Report Fees ¥ 5

& Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees

Sub Total: $ 4,07292
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 3 dayslossoflncome@ _$ 8000 perday $ 24000

Total Claims: § 4,312.92

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a4) Ornginal repair bill and photocopies of photographs | g pCs.
b) LTA search slip/s of : FBB4561L
c) GlIA /! Police reportfs of : SHBET11L

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Witness statement/s ( ) Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ X ) Photograph's of Accident Scene ( x ) Downlime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Raie letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Jim Wong

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Department

Tel: 6214 8374 Fax: 6214 1843 Emall : jimwong@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO Gy @ Q



ng Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAUtS)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 2:18 PM

To: 'iwanchubby@hotmail.com’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBB 4567L AND SHB 6711L ON 26/01/2018 ALONG RIE
(JURDNG)

Our Ref: CC3/EQI18001809/Kja3

REDUAN BIN ABDULLAH
Policy Holder

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBB 4561L AND SHB 6711L ON 26/01/2018 ALONG PIE (JURONG)

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the
claim against you under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% {20?6 for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.it may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



CDG.VARS.V LettolAuthorisation Page 1 of' 1

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VIANO (Maxi Cab) SHB6711L , FEB 4561 L ON 26-Jan-18 19:30
ALONG PIE TOWARDS JURONG BEFORE TOH GUAN RD EXIT
1/ We SABTU B SAWAM (Hirer) MRIC No.:  S1371697H
and/or (Relief) NRIC Me.:

Taxi Number SHBG6711L
hersby authorise ComfartDelGro Enginesring Pre Ltd{CDGE):

1. To submit myfour claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amaunt in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except parsonal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/four bahalf,
4. To accept any payment {claim proceeds] in respect af the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accardance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 27-Jan-2018
Mame of Hirer SABTU B SAWAM
Hirer MRIC S1371697H Signature : /%1’_1—’
Address 191 BOON LAY DRIVE 08-210
6540191
Contact No. 92386663

http:/edgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/ View CDG VARS.V Lettof...  27/01/2018



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

ComromDELCRD

A member of

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

B10325

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED

"'j_' g-,, 5 MANWELL ROAD TOWER BLOCK
JINGAPORE 069110

CONTACT NO: 62239433

. Description ik 2¢6.01.1E
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Our Ref. CT18010827

Lomlort

Date: 05 February 2018 ‘

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 26/01/2018 19:30 hrs

ALONG PIE TOWARDS JURONG BEFORE TOH GUAN RD EXIT
INVOLVING FBB 4561 L

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHB6T11L (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to SABTU B SAWAM IC NO
S51371697H a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $160.31 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
warkshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 8453 3183
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1/27/2018 Insurance Parliculars Enquiry By Agents Detail

Enquire Vehicle Insurer
Vehicle Mo.  Incident Date/Time Search Status  Insurance Company Code

FBB45&1L 24 Jan 2018 / 19:30:00 Successful E04

Previous OK

SHR bl L-

https:ivrlita.gov.sgiltaivrl/actioninsPartDetall By AATFUNCTION 1D=F1801043ET

Insurance Company Name

EQ INSURAMCE COMPANY LTD

"



SINGAPORE Trasts P

A% HUSINES 0 LUl Avenus 3
) POLICE FORCE s Lhist Singapore 408858
\E 290 ante Tel +68 6547 0000
05 MR 3 Fax +85 6847 0359
s . WY, PalicE oV S5
Our Rel STIAPASTI3120L8 T WAFETY
Date + 2 March, 2018 :
. RECFIVET]
SABIU BIN SAWAM 2] o APk 208
BLK 191 BOON LAY DRIVE
#08-210

SINGAPORE 640191

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB6T11L / FBB4561L / JPT8246 ON 26/01/2018 AT 1926 HRS
ALONG PIE

I refer to the above accident.
2. Please be informed that we have completed our investigations which shows that the
rider of FBB4561L has committed an offence of Careless Driving under Rule 29 Road Traffic Rules.
Action has been initiated against the rider for the said offence.

3 If you have any queries, please contact the Investigation Officer, TJEYATHESH at
telephone number 6547 6232 or email at Thabagesh JEYATHESH@spf.gov.sg.

Yours laitlfully ’}lﬂ FVE’E
\ 7%

Roslan Alunad, Stn lnsp < ‘P,
For Head Investigation '? VAP &
I'affic Police A
Singapare Police Force \

A FORCE FOR THE NATION NP 510

L —
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- . Cansultsnis
s A B Pte Ltd Company Registration No, 123807 198R
L UBLAVE ], #0225 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (045 62563561 FAX @ (065 6256315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 19/07/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicle No FBB 4561L (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HO00556
I ’
SHBG711L (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC3/EQI18001809/K1ja3q2
Date of Accident 26/M1/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost % 3,584.50
Loss of Income ¥ 125.00 2.5 days
Rental (If any) - 400.78 2.5 days
Others: '3 7.49
o

4117.77
Final Settlement Sum |: § 4,115.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD 5

4,115.@'0

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




' Vd 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-26 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 1006D7158R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Das Experts En Automobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCY¥EQI1800180%K1jadq2
o ToNER o AW
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date:  19-07-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 0689110
Code: EOI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBB 4581L Veh. Inspected SHB 6711L
Policy No, DMMPHG17-000943 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM1BHO00556 Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ VIANO c.C 2143
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WDFE3981323811341 Colour WHITE
Odometer 547699 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORCER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions uf'Tym
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/%60 R16C HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/60 R16C HANKODK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/60 R16C HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/60 R16C HANKOOK 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. Ganeral Information
Accident Date  26/01/2018 Inspection Date 29/01/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
£8 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
Sa, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

I i 51 Ul Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industral Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-B607158-R Page No:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 6711L
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | & mp% ‘;t‘}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER R/H SIDE RR DEFORMED 473,60 473,60
1|TAIL LAMP LOWER GARNISH RH TO REPAIR SEE 6190 .
LABOUR
1|TAIL LAMP REFLECTOR UPPER RH MISSING 105.74 105.74
1|REAR FENDER (RH) DENTED 3,188.00 3,188.00
1|REAR FENDER PROTECTOR (RH) SERVICEABLE 56.48 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 777,14 -753.47
3,108.58 3,013.87
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF TAIL 1,000.00 600.00
LAMP LOWER GARNISH RH
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 500.00 360.00
WIRING CHARGE 50.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE. 50,00 20.00
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY REAR 150.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS (SEALANT). 150.00 100.00
REMOVE /REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 20.00
REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
2,140.00 1,170.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,248.58 4,183.87
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,350.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC3/EQI18001808/K1jal3q2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor [ Investigalor Automotive Assessor

DISELAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart Is made salely for the use snd bensht of the Cllent named on tha front page of this Report.




