Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 8:31 AM

To: ‘Justin Wong'

Cc: SUR; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER
ROAD NORTH BELOW NANYANG FLYOVER

Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; photo.pdf; res photo.pdf

Dear Justin,
Please be informed that our survey report already submitted to you on 12/4/2018.

In case you still do not received we now forward a soft copy to you.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 6:05 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER ROAD NORTH BELOW
NANYANG FLYOVER

Dear Veron,

Kindly let us have the finalized survey report for this matter as we have received LOD from TP repairer.
Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

€q

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
Www.edinsurance.com.sg
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 2:33 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER ROAD NORTH BELOW
NANYANG FLYOVER

Dear Bazlin,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle FBL 4918P
Date of survey: 30/1/2018
Number of days:6 days

We have not authorise repair.

Driver’s Occupation is Site Supervisor under the work permit. Will there by any issue?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 1:53 PM

To: 'Bazlin Ahmad' <bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER ROAD NORTH BELOW
NANYANG FLYOVER

Dear Bazlin,

Noted, with thanks.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 1:43 PM
To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
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Cc: 'SUR' <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER ROAD NORTH BELOW
NANYANG FLYOVER

Dear Nivitha

We refer to the above OD claim, excess will be $300 before GST.

Thank You.
Regards,

Lynn Ahmad
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax J
~b‘ & Member of City state E@_._,_E\QL B __/I ':."Q"J“-"E' Q‘DT_ Q

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 10:58 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad; 'assignments'

Cc: 'SUR'

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER ROAD NORTH BELOW
NANYANG FLYOVER

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January, 2018 10:36 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: raymond@bhh.com.sg

Subject: OD CLAIM SURVEY FOR FBL4918P ACCIDENT ON 24.01.2018 ALONG PIONEER ROAD NORTH BELOW
NANYANG FLYOVER

Dear LKK

We refer to the above new assignment, please find attached for easy reference.
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Thank You.
Regards,

Lynn Ahmad
Executive | Claims

edinsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9881 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 881 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWWw.eginsurance.com.sg

5.‘ o Membor of City state @__BR/ I you've got a friend

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

Total Control Panel Login

To: bazlin.ahmad @eqinsurance.com.sg  Remove this sender from my allow list

From: veronchen @lkkauto.com

You received this message because the sender is on your allow list.



