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i, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubl Aya 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapors 408833
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX G256 4315

Reg Mo 199507188R GST Reg No. 18-8607198-R

Affillated to Federation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 RAFFLES QUAY #28-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583

Ref CC4/QBETB001748/M1jb3

Date: 29-01-2018

[RA

Code: OQBE
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKG 5225T Veh. Inspected SJN 4527D
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.0o
Assign From Assign Date 28/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No, Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/01/2018 |Inspection Date 29/01/2018
Survey held at CHEW GOONMOTOR
BLK 10 ANG MO KIO IND PARK 2A #01-15/16/17, AVE 5, AMK AUTOPOINT SINGAPORE
568047
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHCUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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Company Regiviration No 198607 198R

SPUREAVE | #U2-25 PAVA L HLINIMUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAMIRE 408900 TEL @ (0655 A2561561 FAN @ (005) 62564505

Your ref: To Be Advised
Owur ref: CCHOQBEIROOTT49/M 1 jh3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s QBE INSURANCE (INTEENATIONAL) LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer 1o the above matter.,

Date:

01.02.2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 29.01.2018
ut the premises of M/s Chew Goon Motor and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amouni . 5% 3,025.59
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,500.00
“Check” ltems Amount : 55 -
Muarket Value : 85

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value 1 55

Description of Damage:
The vehiele sustained damages at the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithfully,

MA CHIN FOOK
Licensed Appraiser
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Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A, Avenue 5

#01-15, 16, 17 & #03-05, AMK Autopaint Singapore 568047
Tel: 6484 16826 (24Hrs) Fax: 6484 0465

Business Reg, No: 221880/00C GST Reg. No: MX-0486007-A0

| N

Third P
To: QBE Insurance International Ltd Policy No: arty
Date 26.01.2018
Accident Date : 18.01.2018
Specialised In Car Painting, Welding, BN
Panel-Beating and Insurance Claim ESTIMATE {LH &M EREE
L * A g i # Amount &
Quantity DESCRIPTION Unit Price 1 cts,
Estimate Cost Of Repair To "Nissan Latio” Reg. No. SJN4527D
Claiming Against Your Insured Reg. No. SKG5225T
1pe PR — Al — sea00 N o
12pcs Rear Bumper Clips SVv 260 J..qtt — 3120 N £
2pes Rear Bumper Bracksts &)= 86.70 18340 N o
1pe Rear Bumper Auto Boot Sensor Receiver uJd 21500 N ~
1pc Rear Bumper Sponge Sye= [ A 4100 N o
1pc Bool Emblem kel ~— B850 N
1pc Bool Badge Latio g pd — 8200 N
1,185.10
Lass 10% 119.51
1.075.58
-
Tpe Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor 22 B —28000 SN X
1pc Rear Bumper Reverse Camera L n.:fl&" 2o p 3500 SN Y
To Conduct Electrical Check. Replace Reverse Sensors. Module. %’3‘) 42000 Wy
Rewnng Etc
Labour Charge - Panel Beating, Replacement Of Boot. End Panel -'Eya‘h} _—50000 2%\
and Farts Replacement p J
To Respray Affected Areas ’d‘é’t _7ea00 2 0%\
L H Total : 3,025.58
& Dadthon—p
LKK]Auto Consultanls hence notify \Q‘ !ﬁfﬁﬁﬂﬂ—
the Repaier of the following (2, | L& -
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' Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Hi,

Fyna. Thank you

Best Regards,
Shu Pel| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Shu Pei (LKKAuUto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Maonday, 29 January 2018 2:53 PM

assignments

Admin A

FW: SIN4527D Claiming Against Your Insured SKG5225T ; Date of Accident:
18.01.2018

SKG5225T pdf 3pm 241 1¢
"u'.t,'hitlnt_ ]'n
fmur\@ Gl"‘-*'-—t
Sur (™) Mr -MA

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupsii@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Uty industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1,-802-25 | 5(408933)

From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce.foo@gbe.com)

Sent: Monday, 29 January 2018 2:52 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SIN4527D Claiming Against Your Insured 5KG5225T ; Date of Accident: 18.01.2018

Cur Ref. VCO11106

Hi

Please assist to arrange for WP survey

Qur Insured

SKG5225T

Attached OI GIA report for your attention.

Be=1 Regaro
yyci |

A C iy

BE F - Singapore

i sk Em= 1SmgEDera) P
+85 B4TT 1184

Era |gyce foofigbe com

F TR weah gl
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From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) [mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 29 January, 2018 2:41 PM
To: loyce Foo <joyce.foo@agbe.com>; Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Ce: chewgoon@singnet.com.sg; Eric <eri h nmo
Subject: FW: SIN4527D Claiming Against Your Insured SKG5225T ; Date of Accident: 18.01.2018

Sent from Mail for Windows 10

From: Chew Goon Motor{ad3)
Sent: Friday, 26 January 2018 4:21 PM
To: joyce heng@gbe com; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman; lenny Tah

Cec: chewgoon@singnet.com.sg; Eric
Subject: 5JN4527D Claiming Against Your Insured SKG5225T ; Date of Accident: 18.01.2018

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Vehicle SINA527D is lying at our workshop.
According to your list, we will prefer LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey the vehicle.

Kindly arrange for survey.

Thanks & Regards,

Grace

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 24,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autapoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



"‘.’Z Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 2:05 PM

To: ‘Joyce Foo'

Subject: RE: OUR REF VC011106 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJIN4527D B SKG5225T ON
18.01.2018

Hi Joyce,

Noted.

We will now submit our report to your good-office.

Please be informed that due to slight contact observed and photos provided by our insured, we have re-adjusted
repair cost at 5400/~ labour only and 2 days for repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this emall is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

——Original Message-—

From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce foo@qbe.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 9:07 AM

To: loy Irene [LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF. VC011106 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5IN4527D & SKG5225T ON 18.01.2018

Hi loy
We have spoken to Insured who insisted that there was no contact.

Please proceed to reject the claim.

Thanks & Best Regards

loyce Foo

Senior Assistant - Claims

(BE Asia Pacific - Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Email: joyce.foo@qbe.com

Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg



Joy Irene SLKI{Auta]

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 1:47 PM
To: 'Chew Goon Motor{ad3)’

Cc chewgooni@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: SIN4527D Date of acc: 18.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,
We refer to our telephone conversation on 11.12.18.

As spoken, we request for a longer coverage of your video for our viewing, Our insured is strongly disputing of no
contact or collision,

On without prejudice basis, the repair cost is subject for review and our principal's approval due to this issue.
Meanwhile, pending for your further evidence, we have instruction to deny liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.|f you are not the intended recipient (or have received this emall in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email, Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Chew Goon Motor{ad3) [mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg)
sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 1:48 PM

To: loy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com=

Cc: chewgoon@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: SIN4527D Date of acc: 18.01.2018

Dear oy,

Confirm L/S amount $1600 and 4 working days.

Thanks & Regards,
Grace

Chew Goon Motor
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15 ,16 & 17,



Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047
Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Jov Irene (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 11:08 AM
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Cc: chewgoon@singnet.com.sg
Subject: RE: 5JN4527D Date of acc: 18.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,

As spoken, total is L/S $1,600.00

Best Regards,
loy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
ik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4085933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden,

From: Chew Goon Motor{ad3) [mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 5:37 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: chewgoon @singnet.com.sg
Subject: RE: SIN4527D Date of acc: 18.01.2018

Dear Joy.
We have already sent the question mark photos, kindly refer to the email dated on 31/05/2018.

Thanks & Regards,
Grace

Chew Goon Motor

Alk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

From: Joy lrene (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 5:24 PM



Joy Irene !LKH.AutuJ

From: Joyce Foo <joyce foo@gbe com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 9.07 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF. VC011106 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN4527D & SKG5225T ON
18.07.20718

Hi Joy

We have spoken to Insured who insisted that there was no contact.

Please proceed to reject the claim.

Thanks & Best Regards

Joyce Foo

Senior Assistant - Claims

QBE Asia Pacific - Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Emall; joyce.foo @qgbe.com

Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com,sg

----0riginal Message--—-

From: loy lrene (LKKAuto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 4:48 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qbe.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF. VC011106 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN4527D & SKG5225T ON 18.01.2018

Hi Joyce,

We have reviewed the video and noticed 2 jerks from the TP vehicle. We are of the opinion that there was slight
contact between both vehicles.

Repair cost is at lump sum 51,600/- and 4 days for repair.
Our insured would want us to reject TP claim,

For your further instruction.

Best Regards,

loy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | emall: joyirene @Ikkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5{408933)



All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.if you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this emall. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

~—Original Message—

From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce.foo@qgbe.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 11:47 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com:>
Subject: OUR REF. VC011106 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN4527D & S5KG5225T ON 18.01.2018

Hi Joy
As spoken, please do not settle TP claim. Please let us have TP's video footage for our viewing.

Attached LOD from third party for your retention.

Thanks & Best Regards

loyce Foo

Senior Assistant - Claims

QBE Asia Pacific - Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Email: joyce. foo@qbe.com

Visit us on the web at www.gbe.com.sg

—-0riginal Message—

From: 970313 <joyce.foo@qgbe.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 11:38 AM
To: Joyce Foo <joyce foo@qbe.com>
Subject: Scan Data from SG_FX7775_03

Sent by: 970313 [joyce.foo@qbe.com)
Number of Images: 16
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: SGORQL29_FX7775_03
Device Location:

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. if you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
emall or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information In this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is

2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
§1 Uni Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 2561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg No 199607198R GST Reg No 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE LTD Ref CC4/QBE18001748/M1jb3g2
e |
Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKG 52257 Veh. Inspected SJUN 4527D
Policy No. 8-VDO16618-MVA Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC011108 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOYCE Assign Date 29/01/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN LATIO c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JN1FAACT1Z0010324 Colour SILVER
Odometer 249227 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/50 R15 CsT 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/50 R15 CST 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/50 R15 CST B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/50 R15 CST B mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 18/01/2018 Inspection Date 29/01/2018
Survey held at CHEW GDON MOTOR
BLK 10 ANG MO KIO IND PARK 2ZA #01-16M1817, AVE 5, AMK AUTOPOINT
SINGAPORE 588047
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™WITHQUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408923
TEL: 8258 3581 FAX: 6256 4215

Reg. Mo 1899607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJN 4527D
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjustad
Py Workshop (8)| __ (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (N) TO REPAIR SEE 564.00
LABOUR
12|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @52 80 (N) SERVICEABLE 31.20
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS @8396.70 (N) NOT NECESSARY 193.40
1|REAR BUMPER AUTO BOOT SENSOR RECEIVER [N) NOT NECESSARY 215.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE (N) SERVICEABLE 41.00
11BOOT EMBLEM (N) NOT NECESSARY B8.50 -
1|BOOT BADGE LATIO (N) NOT NECESSARY 82.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -118.51
1,075.59
ISPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR({SN) NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE CAMERA (SN) NOT NECESSARY a50.00 -
630.00
LABOQUR
TO CONDUCT ELECTRICAL CHECK REPLACE REVERSE |NOT NECESSARY 120,00 -
SENSORS MODULE REWIRING ETC.
LABOUR CHARGE-PANEL BEATING REPLACEMENT OF 500.00 200.00
BOOT END PANEL AND PARTS
REPLACEMENT . INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BUMPER
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS. T00.00 200.00
1,320.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,025.59 400.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ ] 400.00|
Report Ref No. CC4/QBE18001748/M1jb3g2
|'II|': g
- Il J
MA CHIN FOOK HO LEOMNG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES - This Repart ls made solely for the usa snd benalli of tha Client named on the frenl page of this Report




