Jia Le (LKK Auto)

T ————— e R et |

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 2:40 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK

REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear lia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLle@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September, 2019 11:095 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3

Lonpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020353
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18001744/T1db3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
We have checked with our surveyor and the damages is consistent.

We have highlighted to your good office on 07/02/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Insured opened door and resulted accident. Liability is not in our driver's favour.
Summary to offer to third party repairer, "CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount  Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 7,110.15 5 4,146.25
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $100.00)(w/GST) S B56.00 S 749,00 (7days x 5100.00){w/GST)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee s 200 s 2.00

Total 5 7,968.15 54,897.25



**04days recommendation for repair + lweekend + 1PRS = 7days.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5(408933)

—---Original Message—-

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 8:55 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com:

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3

Dear Gerald,
Attached inspection photos for your reference.
We will check with our surveyor on the consistency of damages.

Thank you.

Dear Taufikh,
For your confirmation on damage consistency.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5{408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 5:28 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3
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Hi Joy,

Fyi. Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)

-----Original Message-----

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 5:26 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3

Dear Shu Pei,

Kindly advise if the surveyor look into the queries raised by us in our email of 31 January 2018.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

-----Original Message--——

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February, 2018 5:06 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****| KK REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Gerald,

We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected TP vehicle SKR 3688X at M/s Cycle & Carriage Kia Pte Ltd.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

-Preliminary advice

-TP estimated cost of repair

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 January 2018 5:33 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.coms

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18001744/jb3

Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020353

Dear Shu Pei,

We attached a copy of insured's GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

——-0Original Message----—-

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 January, 2018 5:20 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018 ****LKK REF:.CC4/LPC18001744/jb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear 5ir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pej| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)



—--Original Message-----

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 January 2018 12:00 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Ce: 'MT_Claim_5G' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018

Dear Mr Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue

1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

----- Original Message-—----

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 January, 2018 10:38 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: FW: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018

Our Ref: TBA
Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the survey and revert to them on direct settlement.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Coco Lu Ting [mailto:coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 29 January, 2018 10:25 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cec: Andre Chow En De; Don Bong Kiong Hua; Edwin Abcede Caina; Tay Jian Ye

Subject: our veh SKR3688X, your veh SIN2773Y on 26/01/2018

Dear officer in charge,

Please advise us the liability for this case, we attached the related documents for your reference.

Best regards

Coco LuTing



From: PGMFPO6 [mailto:pgmfp6@cyclecarriage.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 29 January, 2018 9:57 AM

To: Coco Lu Ting

Subject:

DISCLAIMER:-

This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity named
above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message.

Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries
Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



Cycle & Carriage Kia Pte Lt

Kia Customer Service centre

208 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609330
T 6568 4555 F 6569 1056 W kia.com
Company Mo, 199405410K

Ourref : SKR3688X Date: 02™ March 2019
Your ref: SIN2773Y (LONPAC)

Ms. loy Irene (Case Handler)
LEK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd,
Blk. 51 Pava Ubi Industrial Park
Ubi Avenue |, #02-25
Singapore 408933

Dear Madam,

RE: SUBMISSION OF DOCUMENTS FOR SKR3688X

Kindly be informed that our customer, Mr. Mah YingJie, owner of vehicle
registration no. SKR3688X (insured with MSIG) holds vehicle registration no.
SJN2773Y which is insured with you at the time of an accident liable and hereby
submitting a claim against your insured for the cost incurred.

On behalf of our customer, we provide the following claim for your settlement as

below :

Repair cost : $4.146.25

Loss of rental ; $§ 856.00 ($107.00 x 8 days)
GIA search fee ; $ 2.00

Total : $ 500425

\We are pleased to enclose the documents as set out in the attached checklist.

Please contact Mr. Andre Chow En De at 51449137 or email him at
andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg within 7 working days from the date of this
letter should there be any missing documents or any other additional documents
required. If we do not hear from you during these 7 days, we would take it that all
documents submitted to you are complete and in order.

Cheque should be make payable to Cycle & Carriage Kia Pte. Ltd.

We look forward to receiving your early settlement of the invoice(s). Thank you.

Yours faithfully
CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD
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AUTHO RIZATION TO ACT

L, ___ff‘?ﬂ}gr,___'ﬁ*%__ To . ("the third party claimant”)
of BUE: 30, povel iE fo8-02 2 12987 (address), owner of
LED I e (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

o C‘jﬂ;fi___zj" Cowrvicye ELS pre  LA4d

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs
and/or rental and/or loss of use(“claim”) for my vehicle no. Sk R .JEL3 X
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on "__.;3.5;/7;/_;_&__’_
(date) along. /C{Ir}.jf Lo ﬁ;“‘_fjii‘}_—é@_wlqu_wff%f__»j_Pﬂ’w“’:’?_sé)ﬂi}
llocation) Involving vehicle no/s et TR i L —

(*the accident™).

(“the works hop”)

| further authorized the workshop to settle my above mentioned claimin a
nanner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being
macde in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop any reach on my
hehalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar

45 the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s Is concerned.

Dated this __ Y7 _day of 37_.::41,_-1" (month) 20 /9 (year)

; +
- C
= =

i

-
Signed by “the worlshop”

signed by “the third party claimant”



‘s

CLAIMNO : 17/18/18/VP05/020353
DATE : 16 SEPTEMBER 2019

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We. MAH YINGIIE confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SIN 2773Y the sum of Singapore Dollar Four Thousand Eight
Hundred Ninety-Seven and Cents Twenty-Five Only ($54,897.23) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SKR 3688X and SIN 2773Y on 26
January 2018 along KING’S ROAD HEADING TWDS NANYANG PRIMARY
SCHOOL.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD AND/OR CHEONG HUN HENG) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to CYCLE &
CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD.

1/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,
' SIGNED WITHOUT PREJUDICE FOR
e ANY PERSONAL INJURY CLAIM

>

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

| i -3
(AN { INEJ\E
Mame of vehicle owner /Date
271 [/ 20[9
w

P ! L _-' I'
|
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Co Reg Mo : 199405410K

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTELTD

TAX INVOICE

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684567 Fax: 65651240

GST Reg No : MR-B500111-X

Invoice Name & Address

Owner Name & Vehicle Info

Mr Mah Yingjie

30 Dover Rise
#08-02 Dover Parkview
Singapore 138687

Cust Mo/MName
Reg No/Reg Date SKR3IGBBX

Date In/Mileage 06/02/2018/
Chassis/Package KNAFW411MABZ5Z349 (KC17

LCVO3281/Mr Mah Yingjie

/ 29/10/2010
BROO8

Engine No GAFCAH204548 |
Contact No Mobile: 86063688 Make/Model KIA/CERATO 1.6 A SX (2010) |
06,02/ Colour/Trim __ LC / WK il
AccountMo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No  Invoice/Credit Note No
CTPOOORD Cash p9/11/2018/ 15:19  TLT B84 / Laurc Songcuan 22335 B1381872
Description of Goods | Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNTB8000 1100.00
RENEW FRONT LH FENDER AND FRONT LH SIDE MIRROR,
REPATR FROMT LH DOOR
E PNT9B000 1050.00
SPRAY PAINT FROMT LH FENDER, FRONT LH DOOR ,
FRONT LH SIDE MIRROR
A 54900099 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028301 200.00
TO CARRY QUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
M SUNDRY B0.00
APPLY ANTI COROSSION OM AFFECTED PORTIONS
M SUNDRY 20.00
SUNDRIES
M SUNDRY 200.00
SUPPLY FROMT LH SOLAR FILM
¥ MIRROR ASSY-QOUTSIDE RR VIEW,LH 1.00 500.00 00.00 500.00
% PANEL-FENDER,LH 1.00 464.00 00.00 464 .00
% GLASS=FRONT DOOR WINDOW,LH 1.00 231.00 00.00 231.00
I TEXT
LOMPAC TP CLAIM SJNZ2773Y
DOA: 26.01.2018
SURVEYOR: TAUFIKH LKK 06.02.18
"Guarantee your warranty, maintain with Cycle & Carrioge.”
Parts 1,195.00 Hett 3.875.00
Labour 2,380.00 7% GST on 3875.00 271.25
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 4,146.25
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 300.00 Total Due 4,146.25
Total (w/o GST) 3,875.00

Payment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or credit cards. Thank you.
Any dispute to the invoice must be made within 3 days. This is a computer generated document, no signature is reguired.

Page 1 of 1



CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE h ™
25 Semaeng e CcCNadns

Tel 67532536 Fax:67567565 www.chans.com.sgd
GST Reg No: 51-836900-M

TAX INVOICE
MAH YINGJIE INVOICE : AR1802-0218
DATE - 13/02/2018
TERMS : COD
STAFFID : ELAINE
AGREEMENT NO. : HA201802-0056
ATTN - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
[ bESCRIPTION | AMOUNT (SGD) |
Vehicle RegNo  ; SKZ1942H 800.00
Make / Model - TOYOTAALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Rental Dates . Rental Billing From 06/02/2018 To 13/02/2018 (incl)
Period . 8 days
Rental Rate : 5% 107.00 Per Day (Including GST)
Reference Mo . SKR3BEEX
AMOUNT : S§ NON-TAXABLE VALUE : 0.00
EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY-SIX DOLLARS ONLY TAXABLE VALUE : 800.00
GST 7% : 56.00
TOTAL S§ : '856.00|

Please make your cheques payable to : CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

Far Official USe Only

Payment Date : F/ Amt

CS/CC /CH
CS/CC /CH

Member al EeEs " S
YR e Kse ol FEARTAS 363 Sembawang Road Goodiink Park Singapors 758379 T 675312536 F 67567565 E sales@chans.com.sg



CHAN'S & SONS ENTERFRISE
353 Sembawang Road, Goodlink Park,
Singapore 758379,
i Tel: 6753 2536 Fax: 6756 7565
A RENTALS  weww chans.con Bre e - 9742 9446
RENTAL AGREEMENT S01802- 0056
Date of Birtfh Faszspor! Mﬂ'ﬂ Mo, Mationaily
ﬁrta}l ‘/nq U ;[Q} SRIU7289R
Li No Date of Exgiry,
@H(_ <o _Dwu’ Lise do¥-oz | aﬂ* Erwt &(E
[ Pastal Cade Cantact Na Mobils Phone No.
|
138687 | Joolespe
..ra'nr Hirer's / Guarantor's Name g Passport! Nric No. Nationality
 fe , Hazed | [ (BRI EE T
Addre.ss Dcixmarbn E'ME meUﬂ " Date or ZWF
(R T f
e’ y B e
S — e e e T ; R
/ (
[
CHECK OUT | 0w [ e W l e g
i éz fg ‘ 83(@"'\ | E €14 172 3/4 F
CHECK IN Date . | Time Mileage Ramarks
18 -k -] EP?’ K
IMPORTANT NOTES: ! UNIT RBATE (3) TOTAL (3)
= Carie restricled 10 SINGAPORE use. See clause 1(f) for non-compliance, | i
= Mo refund will be given for vehicls catums early. ! RAT_F 8 s [I:}[) % 0
= (wn Damage Liability — Fif$1 $1300 fog) damage to vehicle plus loss of
aarnings while damaged veiche-te-tenar rapar, DISCOUNT [
= Third Party Liability 1 for any Thind Party Accidant Claim, GST @ T2 3‘ A
* Additicnal $3000 igr drivers under 24yrs old or above TOyrs
and/or kess than Yt o, e TOTAL % e
= Hirer is rus_.pm:dbla for ail parking fines & tralfic summdns. - SR
» Extension:- One day's advance notice is required otherwise no extension | EXTENSION
will be alowed, i -
» Vehicle should be refurned at the same hme as collection except on |
Saturday where retum limae is before 10am. — o E i
= Wehicle returned after offica hour will be charged to the next working day. I< 1A qe,m{' |
= Hourly extension is charged at 115 of the daily rate. 6{ [‘ l | N
= A5 preventive maintenance, please check water & engine oil daily. C '@. @
= Pigase check that you have not keft any of your personal belongings in the
vehicle, Our company and staff will not be responsibée for any loss of m&gx |
belangings after the wehicle is raturnad,
» For the comfort ol other users, pleasa refrain ;émgﬂwklm. eating or | | |
camying of pets in the car. A ceaning charge of will be Imposed for
smaly, smally urI:Iirly vehicle, DEFDElT {I‘ﬁfundﬂtﬂa} 55. IJ
G ol PASSENGERS in commarcial vehicle is sirictly prohibited.
D?ENEGFIKEFIS covered undar rifer?: workmen  compensation are CHF"NGED OVER FROM 1'u'EH DATE

aliowad.

IWa declare that all information given on this famm is rue and accuralg.

Hirer's Signatura

iWe have read and agrae o the terms and condilions of the rental agreement above and as set overieal.

Joint Hirer's/ Gumanlm*s Signatura

' VEHICLE ND

| W (9 v H

OPERATING HOURS:

 MODEL
|_ ===t

HETUFIN

MONDAY TO FRIDAY 8.30AM TO 5.30PM, SATURDAY 830AM TO 12.30PM. CLOSED ON SUNDAY & PUBLIC HOLIDAY



Wallewig : ] : I GE

§ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
G i i 3
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-014636
Date of Reguest: 27/01/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Cycle & Carrdage Automotive Ple Ltd
241 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158931

Dear Sirfadam,

Enguiry Date 27/01/2018

Enguiry By Tay Jian Ye

TP Vehicle No. SJIN2TTIY

Accident Date 26/01/2017

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Perlod of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo, |
SJN2ZTTIY Lonpac Insurance Bhd 11/02/2016-10/02/2017 +§5 62507388

Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall ba under no labllity whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connection with the reports or their images,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

h!!ws:.’!sinqamra.meriman.mu'clﬂimsrmdex.n[m?I!'usabﬂFMTRsas&Fumcﬁnn=dsp_ganm$mﬁd-1 707110&CFID=274487 TAACFTOKEN=TB2f... 1




1/27/2013 Invoice

: GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
AR | GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
lNSURANCE Phone: +55 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Mo: Ma00017735

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref Mo: GR-18-014636
Date of Request: 27/01/2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase
Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd
241 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159931
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 27/01/2018
Enguiry By Tay Jian Ye
TP Vehicle Mo. SINZTTIY
Accident Date 26/01/2017
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GET Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires na signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Chegue

https:{/singapore, merimen com/claimsfindex.ofm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=1707 110&CFID=274487TBACFTOKEN=TG8l.., 212



