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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 3:08 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman

Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGMENT : Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H - VC011107

***LKK REF:CC4/QBE18001741/Ayb3 

Attachments: XD7860H.pdf

Dear Shu Pei 

 

Please find attached as per requested. 

 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Jenny Toh 
Senior Assistant, Claims 
QBE Emerging Markets – Singapore 
 
QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
Phone: +65 6477 1225    
Email: jenny.toh@qbe.com  
Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg 
 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 12 March, 2018 11:48 AM 

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@qbe.com> 

Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGMENT : Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H - VC011107***LKK 

REF:CC4/QBE18001741/Ayb3  

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 

Dear Sir/Madam,  

 

We refer to the above matter.  

 

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.  

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:42 PM 

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; 'Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman' <syaheeda.othman@qbe.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 

<thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGMENT : Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H - VC011107***LKK 

REF:CC4/QBE18001741/Ayb3  

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 

Dear Sir/Madam,  

 

We refer to the above matter.  

 

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLU 9778C at M/s SK Automobile Pte Ltd. 

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet. 
 

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.  

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jas and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928. 

   

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 26 January 2018 10:45 AM 

To: 'Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman' <syaheeda.othman@qbe.com>; assignments 

<assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGMENT : Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H - VC011107 

 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman [mailto:syaheeda.othman@qbe.com]  

Sent: Friday, 26 January 2018 10:28 AM 

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: NEW ASSIGMENT : Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H - VC011107 

 
NEW ASSIGNMENT 

 

Dear sir, 

 

Please assist with TP survey. 

 

Thanks. 

 

Syaheeda Othman 

Senior Executive, Claims 
QBE Asia Pacific – Singapore 
 
QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
DID: +6477 1130 Fax : +6533 3270  
Email: syaheeda.othman@qbe.com  
Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg 

 

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin@skauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 25 January, 2018 11:01 AM 

To: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@qbe.com>; Gwen Tan <gwen.tan@qbe.com> 

Cc: JING XIONG KHOO <xiongskauto@gmail.com>; md daud nadzim <mddaudn731@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H 

 

Dear Syaheeda, 

 

Refer to the above matter. 

 

Kindly assist to arrange surveyor today. 

 

Thanks for your kind attention. 

 
-- 

Regards, 

Huey Lee 

SK Automobile Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6789 5155   Fax: 6783 5155 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------- 

From: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg> 

Date: Tue, Jan 23, 2018 at 3:43 PM 

Subject: Arrange surveyor for SLU9778C Your ref: XD7860H 

To: Gwen Tan <gwen.tan@qbe.com>, Joyce Heng <joyce.heng@qbe.com> 

Cc: JING XIONG KHOO <xiongskauto@gmail.com> 

Dear Sir/ Mdm, 

 

 

We the repairers of motor vehicle no.  SLU9778C 

Kindly arrange surveyor to conduct a pre-repair inspection. 
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Location     : 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4#08-46 

                     Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

                     Singapore 415875 

 

Contact No : 8121 0478  Xiong 

 

 

We appreciate your early reply. 

Thanks. 

 

 

-- 

Regards, 

Huey Lee 

SK Automobile Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6789 5155   Fax: 6783 5155 
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